Fort Bend County

QUOTE 2021-04
Dumpster Rental
Amended Tabulation 9.22.20

Award to: Waste Corporation of Texas LP a Delaware Limited Partnership
Term: 1 October 2020 through 30 September 2021

Dumpster Once a Week Service and Monthly Rental Fee

Dumpster Size Location Estimated Vendor: Sprint Waste Vendor: Texas Disposal Vendor: Waste Corporation of [Vendor: Republic
and Annual Texas LP a Delaware
Description Quantity Limited Partnership
Monthly Rental Extended Monthly Rental Extended Monthly Rental| Extended Price Monthly Extended
and Price and Price and Rental
Servicing Price Servicing Price Servicing Price and Price
Front load, 4 Katy Branch 12 $ - No Bid #VALUE! $74.00 $ 888.00 $78.00 $ 936.00
yard 2620 Commercial Center
Blvd. Katy TX 77494
Front load, 6 North End Annex 12 $ - No Bid #VALUE! $80.00 $ 960.00 $90.30 $ 1,083.60
yard 22333 Grand Corner Dr.
Katy Texas 77494
Front load, 2 | Albert George Branch 12 $ - No Bid #VALUE! $ 55.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 70.30| $ 843.60
yard 9230 Gene Street
Needville TX 77461
Front load, 6 Parks Department 12 $ - No Bid #VALUE! $ 80.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 90.30( $ 1,083.60
yard 2725 F.M. 521 North
Fresno TX 77545
2 each - Crabb Service Center 12 $ - No Bid #VALUE! $ 210.00 | $ 2,520.00 | $ 181.00( $ 2,172.00
Front load, 8 201 Payne Lane/FM 762
vard Richmond TX 77469
Front load, 4 Road & Bridge 12 $ - No Bid #VALUE! $ 74.00 | $ 888.00 | $ 78.00( $ 936.00
yard 4310 FM 2218
Richmond TX 77469




Front load, 4 Jones Creek Ranch 12 - No Bid #VALUE! 74.00 888.00 78.00| $ 936.00
yard Park 7714 FM 359 S
Richmond TX 77469
Front load, 6 | Juvenile Leadership 12 - No Bid #VALUE! 80.00 960.00 90.30| $ 1,083.60
yard 400 Coen Road
Rosharon TX
Front load, 2 | Mamie George Branch 12 - No Bid #VALUE! 55.00 660.00 70.30| $ 843.60
yard 320 Dulles Avenue
Stafford TX 77477
Front load, 6 | 5th Street Community 12 - No Bid #VALUE! 80.00 960.00 90.30| $ 1,083.60
yard Center
3110 Fifth Street
Stafford Texas 77477
Front load, 8 Four Corners Park 12 - No Bid #VALUE! 105.00 1,260.00 84.00| $ 1,008.00
yard **(September-April)**
15700 Old Richmond Road
Stafford TX 77477
Front load, 4 | Mission Bend Branch 10 - No Bid #VALUE! 74.00 888.00 78.00| $ 936.00
yard 8421 Addicks Clodine
Houston TX 77083
Roll off, 40 Crabb Service Center 12 $ 385.00 4,620.00 $413 $ 4,956.00 375.00 4,500.00 405.00| $ 4,860.00
yard 201 Payne Lane/FM 762
Richmond TX 77469
Roll off, 40 Beechnut Office 12 $ 385.00 4.620.00 $509 $ 6,108.00 375.00 4.500.00 405.00( $ 4,860.00
yard 19310 Beechnut
Richmond TX 77469
Annual Total: 9,240.00 $ 11,064.00 21,492.00 $ 22,665.60
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