
1s
t h

ou
r

 e
ac

h 
ad

di
tio

na
l 

1s
t h

ou
r

 e
ac

h 
ad

di
tio

na
l 

1s
t h

ou
r

 e
ac

h 
ad

di
tio

na
l 

1s
t h

ou
r

 e
ac

h 
ad

di
tio

na
l 

M
 - 

F 
   

   
8:

00
 A

M
 - 

5:
00

 P
M Spanish: $43.00                                                                      

ASL and Other 
Languages: $60.00

Spanish: $43.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $60.00
$70.00 $65.00 $85.00 $85.00 $125.00 $125.00

M
 - 

F,
 

af
te

r 5
:0

0 
PM

Spanish: $43.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $60.00

Spanish: $43.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $60.00
$70.00 $70.00 $105.00 $105.00 $145.00 $145.00

W
ee

ke
nd

, 
8:

00
 A

M
 - 

5:
00

 P
M Spanish: $45.00

ASL and Other 
Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
$70.00 $70.00 $105.00 $105.00 $145.00 $145.00

W
ee

ke
nd

, 
af

te
r 5

:0
0 

PM

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
No Bid No Bid $105.00 $105.00 $145.00 $145.00

M
 - 

F,
   

   
8:

00
 A

M
 - 

5:
00

 P
M Spanish: $45.00

ASL and Other 
Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
$70.00 $65.00 $125.00 $125.00 $165.00 $165.00

M
 - 

F,
   

  
af

te
r 5

:0
0 

PM

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
$70.00 $70.00 $125.00 $125.00 $165.00 $165.00

W
ee

ke
nd

, 
8:

00
 A

M
 - 

5:
00

 P
M Spanish: $45.00

ASL and Other 
Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
$70.00 $70.00 $125.00 $125.00 $165.00 $165.00

W
ee

ke
nd

, 
af

te
r 5

:0
0 

PM

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
No Bid No Bid $125.00 $125.00 $165.00 $165.00

M
on

da
y 

th
ro

ug
h 

Su
nd

ay
,  

  
8:

00
 A

M
 - 

5:
00

 P
M Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
$70.00 $70.00 $105.00 $105.00 $145.00 $145.00

M
on

da
y 

th
ro

ug
h 

Su
nd

ay
,  

   
af

te
r 5

:0
0 

PM

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00

Spanish: $45.00
ASL and Other 

Languages: $65.00
No Bid No Bid $105.00 $105.00 $145.00 $145.00

Masterword                                                       
MASTERWORD 
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Tabulation 
RFQ 2012-11

Language Interpreting Services Onsite

Interpreters Unlimited

On-Site                                                                                
2 hour min

Renewal term:        August 1, 2014 thru August 31, 2015
Renewal term:  September 1, 2015 thru August 31, 2016

Lawson # 9768

Renewal term:  September 1, 2012 thru August 31, 2013

Languages 
Interpreted
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Vendor

On-Site                       
2 hour min

On-Site                         
2 hour min

Raquel S. Fleischer

Term:  September 1, 2011 thru August 31, 2012

Contact Information

Renae Farmer                                            
phone:  281-589-8910 or 866-716-4999  

fax:  281-589-1104  
rfarmer@masterword.com

Description 

Renewal term:  September 1, 2013 thru August 31, 2014

Anita Tallman                                              
office: 800-726-9891 xt 111                    

fax:  800-726-9822                                   
direct:  858-866-1132  

anita.tallman@iugroup.com

Raquel S. Fleischer  
phone:   832-606-2211  

fax:  713-665-1800  
rfleischer99@gmail.com

On-Site                                        
2 hour min
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