
Locations Lawon 
Number

Agape 
Cleaning 

Enterprises

C&S 
Janitorial 

Service

Claron 
Building 

Maintenance

G&C 
Building 

Maintenance 
Services, Inc.

High 
Quality 

Cleaning 
Services  

Maintenance 
of Houston, 

Inc.

McLemore 
Building 

Maintenance

Ultra 
Building 
Services

Team 
Maintenance, 

Inc.

Fifth Street 7554 650.00$      620.00$     1,350.00$      547.50$         1,265.00$  675.00$        1,439.00$     No Bid 650.00$         

Four Corners 7555 550.00$      500.00$     620.00$         547.50$         560.00$     608.40$        983.00$        No Bid 495.00$         

Kity Hollow 7558 575.00$      575.00$     470.00$         547.50$         510.00$     579.27$        829.00$        No Bid 420.00$         

Mustang 
Community 7559 600.00$      480.00$     550.00$         547.50$         435.00$     810.09$        846.00$        No Bid 425.00$         

Dew House     
Per Event 9711 100.00$      40.00$       75.00$           56.00$           45.00$       89.00$          40.00$          No Bid 225.00$         

2,475.00$   2,215.00$  3,065.00$      2,246.00$      2,815.00$  2,761.76$     4,137.00$     -$       2,215.00$      

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Janitorial Service for Fort Bend County Parks Department Locations

Awarded to: Team Maintenance, Inc.

RFQ #2012-09

Monthly Total:

Term: October 2011 through September 2012
Amended 9.29.11
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