
Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: MR-1               
Qty: 235                    
Chairs                     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $119.83

Item: MR-2                 
Qty: 12                        
Chair dolly

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $193.60

Item: MR-3                 
Qty: 6                          
30x60 table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $520.95

Item: MR-4                 
Qty: 3                          
36x96 table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $619.37

Item: MR-5                 
Qty: 4                          
48" Rd table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $438.49

Item: MR-6                 
Qty: 4                          
X Bases

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $383.55

Disqualified: 
Enter package 
disqualified, 

individual prices 
do not include 
installation as 

required.  
Vendor put 

installation in 
total for section 

only.

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 11-047

Furnishings for University Branch Library

Awarded 04/05/11: Part I Section 1=McCoy Rockford, Part I Section 2=Contract Resource Group, Part I Section 3=Vanguard, Part I Section 4=McCoy Rockford, 

Funding: Library Bond

Part I
Section 1:  Stacking Chairs and Tables

Disqualified: 
Enter package 
disqualified, 

vendor did not 
provide proof of 

worker's 
compensation 
insurance as 

required.

Part I Section 5=McCoy Rockford, Part II Section 1=Library Interiors of Texas, Part II Section 3=SBD Commercial, Part II Section 4=Library Interiors of Texas,
Part II Sections 2, 5 and 6 Cultural Surroundings



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: MR-7                 
Qty: 4                          
30x60 table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $611.59

Item: MR-8                 
Qty: 2                          
24x60 table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $558.23

Item: MR-10               
Qty: 30                        
Folding table 
24x72x29               

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $521.16

Item: MR-11               
Qty: 10                        
Folding table 30x72

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $688.72

Item MR-12             
Qty: 7                          
Table truck

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $699.56

Grand Total        
Section 1

No Bid Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $41,201.58 Disqualified Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

Item: H-1                   
Qty: 1                          
42x96 table

No Bid $2,122.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grand Total            
Section 2

No Bid $2,122.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

Disqualified Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

No Bid

Part I
Section 2:  Conference Tables

Part I
Section 1:  Stacking Chairs and Tables (cont'd)



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: L-1                     
Qty: 28                      
Single chairs               

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $967.28 $813.05

Item: L-2                     
Qty: 8                      
Single chairs               

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $937.28 $793.05

Item: L-4                   
Qty: 1                          
3 pc sofa                     

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,560.60 $1,326.34

Item: L-5                     
Qty: 4                          
Club table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $498.66 $362.44

Item: L-6                     
Qty: 14                        
Club table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $498.66 $362.44

Item: L-7                     
Qty: 1                          
Coffee table

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $480.35 $349.24

Grand Total             
Section 3

No Bid Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,598.91 Disqualified Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

$37,309.30

Part I
Section 3:  Lounge Chairs, Sofas, and Occassional Tables



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: WR-1                 
Qty: 40                        
Task chair

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $382.65 No Bid

Item: WR-2                 
Qty: 74                        
Task chair

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $246.12 No Bid

Item: WR-3                 
Qty: 5                          
Tall stools

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $354.81 No Bid

Item: WR-4                 
Qty: 8                          
Guest chairs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $172.33 No Bid

Item: WR-5                 
Qty: 8                          
Lateral files

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $688.90 No Bid

Item: WR-6                 
Qty: 2                          
Lateral files

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $760.06 No Bid

Item: WR-7               
Qty: 2                          
Lateral case

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $984.42 No Bid

Item: WR-8                 
Qty: 1                          
Printer station

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $338.93 No Bid

Item: WR-9                 
Qty: 18                        
Work stations

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $940.17 No Bid

Part I
Section 4:  Task Chairs, and Workroom and Office Furniture



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: WR-10               
Qty: 4                          
Work station

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid

Item: WR-10.1            
Qty: 4                          
Work station

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $865.47 No Bid

Item: WR-11               
Qty: 3                          
Work stations

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,326.15 No Bid

Item: WR-12               
Qty: 3                          
30x72 desk                  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,266.86 No Bid

Item: WR-13               
Qty: 1                          
30x72 desk

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,600.39 No Bid

Item: WR-15               
Qty: 5                          
Bookcase                   

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $721.51 No Bid

Grand Total               
Section 4

No Bid Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $81,046.56 Disqualified Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

No Bid

Part I
Section 4:  Task Chairs, and Workroom and Office Furniture (cont'd)



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: N-1                    
Qty: 5                         
Visual board

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,089.68

Item: N-2                    
Qty: 3                          
Lecturn

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,623.55

Item N-3                   
Qty: 3                          
Cart

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,201.31

Grand Total                
Section 5

No Bid Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,922.98 Disqualified Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

Item: S-1                     
Qty: 189                      
Shellving

$340.40 $274.50 $261.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-2                     
Qty: 33                    
Shelving                      

$312.23 $251.70 $237.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-3                     
Qty: 54                        
Shelving

$190.56 $201.86 $184.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-4                     
Qty: 15                        
Shelving

$205.79 $218.62 $200.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part I
Section 5:  Visual Boards, Lecturns, and PC Carts

Part II
Section 1:  Steel Shelving



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: S-5                     
Qty: 25                        
Shelving

$145.95 $177.32 $177.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-6                     
Qty: 12                        
Shelving

$272.20 $642.90 $226.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-7                     
Qty: 5                          
Shelving

$149.82 $219.45 $148.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-8                     
Qty: 1                          
Shelving

$492.66 $228.46 $251.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-9                     
Qty: 6                          
Shelving

$569.21 $374.76 $389.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-10                   
Qty: 6                          
Shelving

$765.05 $563.14 $559.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-11                   
Qty: 6                          
Shelving

$569.21 $382.97 $389.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-12                   
Qty: 22                        
Shelving

$210.45 $219.43 $197.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-13                   
Qty: 18                        
Shelving

$126.77 $139.69 $116.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part II
Section 1:  Steel Shelving (cont'd)



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: S-14                   
Qty: 3                          
Shelving

$273.09 $199.51 $248.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-15                   
Qty: 18                        
Shelving

$100.51 $116.10 $85.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-16                   
Qty: 32                        
Shelving

$553.89 $324.66 $283.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-17                   
Qty: 10                        
Shelving

$237.03 $243.17 $256.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-18                   
Qty: 12                        
Shelves

$14.14 $9.56 $10.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-19                   
Qty: 12                        
Shelves

$15.69 $10.99 $12.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-20                   
Qty: 12                        
Shelves

$60.27 $22.89 $28.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-21                   
Qty: 8                          
Hanging racks

$51.73 $15.16 $19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-22                   
Qty: 4,600                   
Supports

$6.04 $2.46 $2.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part II
Section 1:  Steel Shelving (cont'd)



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: S-23                   
Qty: 100                      
Backstops

$6.10 $2.31 $2.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item: S-24                   
Qty: 5                          
Displays

$876.00 $1,875.00 $1,386.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grand Total                
Section 1

$168,888.16 Disqualified $140,180.46 Bid substitutes 
not equal to 

specs

$124,481.96 No Bid Disqualified No Bid No Bid

Item: T-1                     
Qty: 11                     
Adult table

$1,994.00 $2,000.65 No Bid No Bid

Item: T-2                     
Qty: 1                          
Adult table

$1,956.00 $1,911.27 No Bid No Bid

Item: T-3                     
Qty: 6                          
Teen table

$957.00 $970.27 No Bid No Bid

Item: T-4                     
Qty: 1                          
Child table

$957.00 $856.49 No Bid No Bid

Item: T-5                     
Qty: 1                          
Puzzle table                

$881.00 $768.74 No Bid No Bid

Section 2:  Adult and Children's Wood Reading Tables, Carrels, Small Reference Desks, and Atlas Stand

Part II
Section 1:  Steel Shelving (cont'd)

Part II



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: T-6                     
Qty: 4                      
Copier table

$1,302.00 $347.80 No Bid No Bid

Item: T-7                     
Qty: 3                          
Carrel

$2,395.00 $2,018.54 No Bid No Bid

Item: T-8                     
Qty: 1                          
Carrel

$2,395.00 $2,075.42 No Bid No Bid

Item: T-9                     
Qty: 1                          
Atlas stand

$1,762.00 $1,552.10 No Bid No Bid

See Section 6 
(Sections 2, 5 & 6 to 
be awarded together)

Disqualified: Di
not bid Sections 

5 & 6

d Disqualified $48,020.00      
See section 6

Disqualified: 
Sections 5 & 6 
Chairs do not 

meet specs

$42,439.61      
See section 6

No Bid Disqualified Disqualified: 
Sections 5 & 6 
Chairs do not 

meet specs

No Bid

Part II
Section 2:  Adult and Children's Wood Reading Tables, Carrels, Small Reference Desks, and Atlas Stand (cont'd)



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: C-1                    
Qty: 2                          
Comp table

$6,280.83 $4,205.00 $7,731.82 $4,245.87 No Bid $3,125.00 No Bid

Item: C-2                    
Qty: 3                          
Comp table

$6,375.56 $4,205.00 $7,731.82 $4,203.20 No Bid $3,176.00 No Bid

Item: C-3                    
Qty: 1                          
Comp table

$4,875.28 $2,599.00 $4,466.33 $2,821.25 No Bid $1,744.00 No Bid

Item: C-5                    
Qty: 2                          
Comp table

$7,176.39 $5,511.00 $9,851.91 $5,250.31 No Bid $4,232.00 No Bid

Item: C-6                    
Qty: 7                          
Comp station

$1,202.17 $1,162.00 $604.93 $1,155.42 No Bid $789.00 No Bid

Item: C-7                    
Qty: 3                          
Printer table

$3,442.22 $1,515.00 $1,830.90 $1,880.84 No Bid $1,119.00 No Bid

Item: C-8                    
Qty: 1                          
Printer table

$3,442.22 $1,515.00 $1,830.90 $1,880.84 No Bid $1,477.00 No Bid

Item: C-10                  
Qty: 1                          
Children's ref. Desk

$17,283.42 $13,382.00 $19,021.87 $17,083.33 No Bid $13,500.00 No Bid

Item: C-11                  
Qty: 1                          
Adult ref. desk 

$22,110.38 $15,645.00 $26,785.86 $25,087.62 No Bid $18,562.00 No Bid

Section 3:  Circulation Desk, Adult Reference Desk, Children's Referenced Desk, Wood Shelving Matching the Desks, and Computer Workstations
Part II



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: C-12                  
Qty: 3                          
Office desk

$2,459.44 $1,883.00 $2,385.20 $1,934.99 No Bid $1,698.00 No Bid

Item: C-14                  
Qty: 1                          
Self-check desk

$5,831.11 $3,517.00 $4,620.65 $3,878.26 No Bid $3,232.00 No Bid

Item: C-16                  
Qty: 1                          
Self-check desk

$1,476.11 $1,844.00 $2,996.11 $1,616.61 No Bid $960.00 No Bid

Item: C-17               
Qty: 1                     
Circ Desk

$29,735.40 $22,254.00 $28,743.84 $28,169.78 No Bid $29,812.00 No Bid

Item: C-18                  
Qty: 1                          
Cabinets

$2,512.22 $2,738.00 $2,233.53 $3,387.46 No Bid $3,380.00 No Bid

Item: C-19                  
Qty: 2                          
Comp table

$5,503.61 $3,138.00 $4,809.71 $3,856.30 No Bid $2,119.00 No Bid

Item: C-20                  
Qty: 1                          
Bookcase

$1,099.72 $1,497.00 $1,811.82 $856.71 No Bid $482.00 No Bid

Item: C-21                  
Qty: 1                          
Lateral file

$5,363.31 $2,004.00 $2,366.44 $5,054.95 No Bid $2,670.00 No Bid

Grand Total                
Section 3

$176,897.68 Disqualified $123,646.00 $177,911.60     
Bid Substitute

$148,686.80 No Bid Disqualified $118,273.00 No Bid

Part II
Section 3:  Circulation Desk, Adult Reference Desk, Children's Referenced Desk, Wood Shelving Matching the Desks, and Computer Workstations (cont'd)



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: EP-1                  
Qty: 1 lot                    
End panels

 
$63,887.35 $60,779.00 $46,541.92 $44,680.29 No Bid $45,060.00 No Bid

Item: Top                    
Qty: 1 lot                    
Tops

 
$2,024.70 $2,511.00 $2,792.80 $1,881.27 No Bid $2,047.00 No Bid

Grand Total for 
Section 4

$65,912.05 Disqualified $63,290.00 $49,334.72 $46,561.56 No Bid Disqualified $47,107.00 No Bid

Item: CA-1                 
Qty: 80                        
Chairs

 No Bid $437.00 $578.57 No Bid No Bid

See Section 6 
(Sections 2, 5 & 6 to 
be awarded together)

Disqualified: Di
not bid Sections 

5 & 6

d Disqualified $34,960.00      
See section 6

Disqualified: 
Sections 5 & 6 
Chairs do not 

meet specs

$46,285.60      
See section 6

No Bid Disqualified Disqualified: 
Sections 5 & 6 
Chairs do not 

meet specs

No Bid

Part II
Section 5:  Adult Reading Chairs

Part II
Section 4:  Custom Wood Tops and End Panels for Steel Shelving



Description A Bargas & 
Assoc

Contract 
Resource Group

Cultural 
Surroundings

Library Design 
Systems

Library Interiors 
of Texas

McCoy-
Rockford

Office Furniture 
Innovations

SBD 
Commercial 

Interiors

Vanguard 
Environments

Item: K-1                    
Qty: 4                          
Chairs

No Bid $430.00 $984.81 No Bid No Bid

Item: K-2                    
Qty: 20                        
Stools

No Bid $242.00 $587.23 No Bid No Bid

Totals (Sections 2, 5 
& 6 to be awarded 
together)

Disqualified: Di
not bid Sections 

5 & 6

d Disqualified $6,560.00       
Grand Total: 
$89,540.00

Disqualified: 
Sections 5 & 6 
Chairs do not 

meet specs

$15,683.84      
Grand Total: 
$104,409.05

No Bid Disqualified Disqualified: 
Sections 5 & 6 
Chairs do not 

meet specs

No Bid

Part II
Section 6:  Children's Reading Chairs and Stools


	Sheet1

