

Item #3: Dupont Oust Extra, price per pound	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
4 pound container	8910	No Bid	\$ 26.69	No Bid	\$ 36.96	\$ 140.00	No Bid	\$ 96.80
minimum order			32 lbs		4 lbs			8 each 3 lbs container
12 pound container	8911	No Bid	\$ 26.69	No Bid	No	\$ 396.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			24 lbs					
25 pound container	9682	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 835.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								

Item #4: Escort, price per Ounce	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
1 oz. container	8920	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.09	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
8 oz. container	9683	No Bid	\$ 2.59	No Bid	\$ 4.00	\$ 16.72	No Bid	\$ 7.26
minimum order			64 Oz		12/case			1
16 oz. container	8921	No Bid	\$ 2.59	No Bid	\$ 4.00	\$ 33.44	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			64 Oz		4/case			
64 oz. container	9684	No Bid	\$ 2.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 133.76	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			64 Oz					
Brand Bid								Lesco Mansion

Item #5: Garlon 3A, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8930	No Bid	\$ 55.89	No Bid	\$ 52.10	\$ 159.50	No Bid	\$ 106.50
minimum order			50 gallons		5 gallons			2 X 2.5 gallons
returnable			No		No			No
5 gallon container	8931	No Bid	\$ 52.59	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 300.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			50 gallons					
returnable			No					
30 gallon container	8932	No Bid	\$ 52.59	No Bid	\$ 52.10	\$ 1,850.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			30 gallons		30 gallons			
returnable			No		No			

Item #6: Garlon 4 Ultra, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri- Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	14140	No Bid	\$ 68.95	No Bid	\$ 74.15	\$ 180.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			50 gallons		5 gallons			
returnable			No		No			

Item #7: Glyphosate 41%+14% Surfactant, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri- Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8942	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.00	\$ 81.00	No Bid	\$ 53.81
minimum order					5 gallons			2 X 2.5 gallons
returnable					No			No
Brand Bid					Ranger Pro	Makaze		Ranger Pro
5 gallon container	10060	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 160.25	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								
Brand Bid						Makaze		
30 gallon container	8943	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.00	\$ 951.00	No Bid	\$ 52.11
minimum order					30 gallons			1
returnable					No			No
Brand Bid					Ranger Pro	Makaze		Ranger Pro
275 gallon container	10063	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								
Brand Bid						Makaze		
265 gallon container	9688	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.00	\$ 8,699.00	No Bid	\$ 48.26
minimum order					265 gallons			1
returnable					yes			No
Brand Bid					Ranger Pro			Ranger Pro

Item #8: MSMA 6 Plus 47.60% Active, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8953	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.25	\$ 80.58	No Bid	\$ 52.87
minimum order					5 gallons			2 X 2.5 gallons
returnable					No			No

Item #9: Milestone VM, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8955	No Bid	\$ 305.00	No Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 750.00	No Bid	\$ 552.13
minimum order			10 gallons		5 gallons			2 X 2.5 gallons
returnable			No		No			No

Item #10: Outrider, price per ounce	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
20 oz. container	8961	No Bid	\$13.98	No Bid	\$ 285.00	\$325.60	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			20 OZ.		1 bottle			

Item #11: Pro-Mate Accuracy 30%, price per quart	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
1 quart container	8966	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.65	\$ 20.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order					12/case			
returnable					No			

Item #12: Rodeo Herbicide, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8971	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 81.25	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								

Item #13: Roundup Pro Concentrate 50.2% Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate complete with performance techNology surfactant, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8974	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 38.60	\$ 96.00	No Bid	\$ 67.82
minimum order					5 gallons			2 X 2.5 gallons
returnable					No			No
30 gallon container	8975	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 37.60	\$ 1,115.00	No Bid	\$ 64.66
minimum order					30 gallons			1
returnable					No			No

Item #14: Surfactant: Nonionic Surfactant Load: 70% HLB Ratio: 12, Antifoam Index: 3, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
1 gallon container	8988	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.99	No Bid	\$ 21.63
minimum order								1
returnable								No
2.5 gallon container	8989	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.00	\$ 25.25	No Bid	\$ 20.82
minimum order					5 gallons			1
returnable					No			No
30 gallon container	8990	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 299.70	No Bid	\$ 20.57
minimum order								1
returnable								No
Brand Bid					Inlet	Brewer		Lesco 90/10

Item #15: Surfactant: Nonionic Active Ingredient 96% Poly-1-P-Menthene, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8993	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.80	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								
Brand Bid						LPI		

Item #16: Tordon 22K, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8994	No Bid	\$ 65.90	No Bid	\$ 59.95	\$ 198.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			50 gallons		5 gallons			
returnable			No		No			
5 gallon container	8996	No Bid	\$ 65.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 396.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			50 gallons					
returnable			No					
30 gallon container	8994	No Bid	\$ 65.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,376.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			60 gallons					
returnable			No					
250 gallon container	10080	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								

Item #17: Opensight by Dow AgroScience, price per ounce	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
20 oz bottle container	9010	No Bid	\$ 89.40	No Bid	\$ 5.30	\$ 118.25	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			1 Case		1 bottle			
Brand Bid			Opensight		Opensight			
1.25 pound container	9011	No Bid	\$ 89.40	No Bid	\$ 5.30	\$ 118.25	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			1 Case		12/case			
Brand Bid			Opensight		Opensight			
10 pound container	9700	No Bid	\$ 89.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 946.00	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order			10 lbs					
Brand Bid			Opensight					

Item #26: Turbulance, Surfactant, Crop Oil Concentrate, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	10472	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 87.50	No Bid	\$ 26.21
minimum order								2 X 2.5 gallons
returnable								No

Item #27: Roundup Custom price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	14141	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.85	\$ 102.50	No Bid	\$ 109.24
minimum order					5 gallons			72 X 2.5 gallons
Brand Bid					Roundup Custom	RoundUp Custom		Roundup
returnable					No			No

Item #28: Method 240SL, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	14266		\$ 322.56	No Bid	\$ 322.56	\$ 806.40	\$322.56	No Bid
minimum order			5 gallons		5 gallons		2.5 gallons Container	
20 gallon container	13126	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6,451.20	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
Brand Bid			Method 240 SL		Method 240SL	Method 240SL	Method 240 SL	

Item #29: Derigo (by Bayer Environmental Science), price per ounce	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
60 ounce container	14142	No Bid	\$ 8.33	No Bid	\$ 8.33	\$ 499.80	\$8.33	No Bid
minimum order			60 Ounces		4 containers		60 ounce container	
Brand Bid			Derigo		Derigo	Derigo	Derigo	

Item #35: Evoluer 4-4 ULV (Permethrin 4% Piperonyl Butoxide 4%) or equivalent, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	8922	\$ 26.33	No Bid	\$ 28.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.50	No Bid
minimum order		5 gallon pail		2-1/2 gallons			2.5 gallons	
returnable		No		No			No	
Brand Bid		PermaSease 4-4		Biomist 4-4			Perm X 4-4	
5 gallon container	8923	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.50	No Bid
minimum order				2x2-1/2 gallon			5 gallons	
returnable				No			No	
Brand Bid				Biomist 4-4			Perm X 4-4	
15 gallon container		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								
Brand Bid								
30 gallon container	8924	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.65	No Bid
minimum order				30 gallon drum			30 gallons	
returnable				Yes			No	
Brand Bid				Biomist 4-4			Perm-X 4-4	
55 gallon container	8925	\$ 24.89	No Bid	\$ 28.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.65	No Bid
minimum order		55 gallon drum		55 gallon drum			55 gallons	
returnable		No		Yes			No	
Brand Bid		PermaSease 4-4		Biomist 4-4			Perm X 4-4	
250 gallon container	8926	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.89	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable							No	
Brand Bid							Perm X 4-4	
275 gallon container	8927	\$ 23.75	No Bid	\$ 28.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.65	No Bid
minimum order		275 gallon tote		275 gallon tote			275 gallons	
returnable		No		Yes			No	
Brand Bid		PermaSease 4-4		Biomist 4-4			Perm X 4-4	

Item #36: Mosquitomist One ULV, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
30 gallon container	8958	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 69.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 30 gallon drum				
returnable				Yes				
55 gallon container	8959	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 68.02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 55 gallon drum				
returnable				Yes				
275 gallon container	8960	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 63.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 275 gallon tote				
returnable				Yes				

Item #37: PyreNone 25-5 (Pyrethrins 5% Piperonyl Butoxide 25%), price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container		No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No Bid	No bid
minimum order								
returnable								
5 gallon container	8969	\$ 237.88	No bid	\$ 299.64	No bid	No bid	\$ 206.84	No bid
minimum order		5 gallon pail		1 - 5 gallon			5 gallon	
returnable		No: Brand Evergreen 5-		No			No	
30 gallon container	8970	No bid	No bid	\$ 295.88	No bid	No bid	\$ 203.10	No bid
minimum order				1 - 30 gallon drum			30 gallon	
returnable				No			No	
55 gallon container	8967	\$ 222.12	No bid	\$ 289.39	No bid	No bid	\$ 194.02	No bid
minimum order		55 gallon drum		1 - 55 gallon drum			55 gallon	
returnable		No: Brand Evergreen 5-		No			No	

Item #38 Duet by Clarke Mosquito Control, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container	9005	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 188.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				2-1/2 gallon				
returnable				No				
Brand Bid				Duet				
5 gallon container	9006	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 188.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				2x2-1/2 gallon				
returnable				No				
Brand Bid				Duet				
30 gallon container	9007	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 186.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 30 gallon drum				
returnable				Yes				
Brand Bid				Duet				
55 gallon container	9008	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 178.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 55 gallon drum				
returnable				Yes				
Brand Bid				Duet				
275 gallon container	9009	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 177.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 275 gallon tote				
returnable				Yes				
Brand Bid				Duet				

Item #39: Mosquito Master 4-12, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
30 gallon container	11859	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 62.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 30 gallon drum				
55 gallon container	11860	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 61.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 55 gallon drum				
275 gallon container	11861	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 61.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 - 275 gallon tote				

Item #40: 1% Solution, Drift Control Agent, price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
1 gallon container	10468	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.12
minimum order								1
returnable								No
2.5 gallon container		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								

Item #41: Droplex, Deposition Aid and Drift Control Agent, A387 price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
1 gallon container		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								

Item #42: Liberate by Loveland Products, Inc., price per gallon	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
2.5 gallon container		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order								
returnable								

Item #43: Natular DT Tablet Residential, 600/case, price per case	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Asplundh Tree Expert Co. dba VM Distribution Partners Newton, MS	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Houston, TX	Rentokil North America dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Stafford, TX
600 tablet case	14139	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 274.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
minimum order				1 case				