
 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

   Each add'l mile 

20.00$   Laydown 

53.50$  

4.00$  

0.25$  

Rosenberg/Hockley

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Asphalt Stabilized Base, 
TXDOT Item 292, Black 
Base GR2 with RAP               
(Price Per Ton)           
Lawson #'s
Material: 14147      
Laydown: 14148 

 Asphalt Stabilized Base, 
TXDOT Item 292, Black 
Base GR2 without RAP         
(Price Per Ton)           
Lawson #'s
Material: 14145      
Laydown: 14146 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

68.00$  

4.00$  

0.25$  

20.00$  

Rosenberg/Hockley

 800 Ton 
Minimum/$5.75 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Laydown 

 Plant Location/s 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

 Minimum Order 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant Location/s 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

78.00$  

4.00$  

0.30$  

Rosenberg & Katy 

 800 Tons  

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

0.30$  

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

68.00$  

4.00$  

12.00$  

Rosenberg & Katy 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

12.00$  

 Fort Bend County Tabulation 
 Bid 22-051 

 Term Contract for Earthen Road Materials 

 Term:   April 1,  2022 through  March 31, 2023 

 Awarded 3/22/22: All bidders meeting specifications 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 



Fort Bend County Bid 22-051

 Minimum Order  800 Ton 
Minimum/$5.75 

800 Tons 

2



Fort Bend County Bid 22-051

Rosenberg

24 tons 24 Tons 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

20.00$                      

3.75$                        

0.20$                        

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant Location/s 

 Minimum Order 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Per 1/2 sack cement  

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Flexible Base, must be free 
of foreign materils (asphalt, 
base, dirt, wire or any 
uncommon items), Type 
"A", Grade "1", Crushed 
Concrete, (price per 
ton)Lawson #'s                        
Material: 14149      
Laydown: 14150

 Plant Location/s 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Laydown 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

 Laydown 

 Cement Stabilized Sand, 
TXDOT & PT #400.5 
Portland Cement, Type I,      
2 sack minimum,                     
(price per ton)     

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

21.00$                      29.00$                      

4.00$                        3.00$                        

0.30$                        0.21$                        

NA

Katy Stafford

24 tons

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

Disqualified:           
Did not provide          bid 

prices on County's bid 
pricing form. 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

Disqualified:           
Did not provide          bid 

prices on County's bid 
pricing form. 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

3
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24 tons

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

23.00$                      

 Minimum Order 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant Location/s 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Plant Location/s 

 Minimum Order 

   Each add'l mile 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Gravel, River Unwashed, 
5/8" Diameter Maximum       
(price per yard)           
Lawson #'s                              
Material: 14152 

 Laydown 

 Flexible Base, must be free 
of foreign materils (asphalt, 
base, dirt, wire or any 
uncommon items), Type 
"A", Grade "1", Crushed 
Concrete with 3% cement 
added, (price per ton)  
Lawson #'s                              
Material: 14151 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

Garwood

3.75$                        

0.20$                        

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

23.00$                      

3.00$                        

0.21$                        

Simonton

24 tons

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

Disqualified:           
Did not provide          bid 

prices on County's bid 
pricing form. 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 
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Fort Bend County Bid 22-051

12.00$                      

4.00$                        

0.30$                        

 Laydown 

 Plant Location/s 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 4.00$                        

 Hot Mix Asphaltic 
Concrete Pavement:  
TxDOT Item 340, Type D, 
with rap,         Sac B, PG, 64-
22                                      
(price per ton)               
Lawson #'s                              
Material: 14155      

20.00$                      

Rosenberg/Hockley

 Plant/Pit/Siding 60.50$                      

 Minimum Order  800 Ton 
Minimum/$5.75 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant Location/s 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 72.00$                      

   Each add'l mile 0.25$                        

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 4.00$                        

   Each add'l mile 0.25$                        

Rosenberg/Hockley

 Minimum Order Minimum/$5.75 Minim

20.00$                      

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Hot Mix Asphaltic 
Concrete Pavement:  
TxDOT Item 340, Type D, 
without rap, Sac B, PG, 64-
22                                              
(price per ton)              
Lawson #'s                              
Material: 14153

 Laydown 

Rosenberg & Katy 

800 Tons 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

80.00$                      

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

70.00$                      

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

4.00$                        

0.30$                        

12.00$                      

Rosenberg & Katy 

400 Tons 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 
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0.19$                        

No Bid

Hempstead

25 tons

0.25$                        

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Plant Location/s 

 Minimum Order 

 Laydown 

   Each add'l mile 

 Laydown 

 Plant Location/s 

 Hot Mix-Cold Laid, 
Asphaltic Concrete 
Pavement, Type D:  
TXDOT Item 350                    
(price per ton)              
Lawson #'s                              
Material: 14179 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Minimum Order 

 Pre-coated Coverstone:      
PB-3                                         
(price per ton)              
Lawson #'s                              
Material: 14157 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

30.00$                      

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

No Bid

0.25$                        

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

78.00$                      

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

NA

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

110.00$                     

4.00$                        

0.30$                        

Rosenberg & Katy 

400 Tons 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

Dabney

24 tons

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 
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 Minimum Order 

8.50$                        

9.50$                        

3.50$                        

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant Location/s 

 Laydown 

 Up to a depth of 12"   
Lawson # 14166 
 Up to a depth of 14"   
Lawson # 14167 
 Pulverizing Existing 
Materials In-Place per Linear 
Foot                              
Lawson # 14168 

9.00$                        

 Up to a depth of 4"     
Lawson # 14162 
 Up to a depth of 6"     
Lawson # 14163 

6.00$                        

7.00$                        

 Up to a depth of 8"      
Lawson # 14164 
 Up to a depth of 10"    
Lawson # 14165 

5.00$                        

 Pulverizing Only Existing 
Asphalt and/or Base Road     
(price per Linear Foot) 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Up to a depth of 2"     
Lawson # 14161 

 Plant/Pit/Siding PB4 

 Pre-coated Coverstone:         
PB-4 & PB5                             
(price per ton)              
Lawson #'s                              
Material: 14159 

10.00$                      

11.00$                      

7.00$                        

 Plant/Pit/Siding PB5 

8.00$                        

3.50$                        

No Bid

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

4.50$                        

6.50$                        

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

29.00$                      

28.00$                      

No Bid

0.19$                        

Dabney

24 tons

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

5.50$                        

7.50$                        

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 
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Fort Bend County Bid 22-051

Contractor will credit Fort Bend County for Pulverized Material:

 Transported by 
contractor’s vehicles 
Lawson # 14170 

$50/Load Transported by Fort 
Bend County vehicles 
Lawson # 14169 

$10/Load 10.00 Load 

50.00 load
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 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Plant Location 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Minimum Order 

 Minimum Order 

 Field Sand                              
(price per ton) 

 Plant Location/s 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Recycled Asphalt, 
Screened, 3" Diameter 
Maximum                                
(price per ton) 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Laydown 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

    Each add'l mile 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 
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 Fly Ash Stabilized Road 
Mix 50/50: 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Laydown 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant Location/s 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

   Each add'l mile 

 Fly Ash                                    
(price per ton)                         

 Minimum Order 

      Each add'l mile 

 Plant Location 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 
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 Lime and Lime Slurry - 
TXDOT Item 264    
Lawson # 14177 

 31% Dry solids 

 35% Dry solids 

 46% Dry solids 

 Type A Hydrated Lime:  
TXDOT Item 264, 90.0% 
Ca(OH) 2 Min., Delivered 
in closed Tankers                
(price per ton)           
Lawson # 14178 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

0.25$                        

No Bid

Hempstead

25 tons

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

91.00$                      

0.25$                        

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Delivered and Applied at 
Jobsite 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant Location/s 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant Location/s 

 Texas ASPPM Grade IV 
Cold Mix - Road repair 
material, (price per ton)  
Lawson # 14180                      

 Laydown 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

58.00$                      

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

No Bid

Dabney

24 tons

No Bid

0.19$                        

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 
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 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

Rosenberg

24 tons

32.70$                      

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant Location/s 

 Asphalt aggregate, 
limestone Type D, 7/16" by 
#4 graduation                          
(price per ton)              
Lawson # 14171 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 623 Traprock Grade 3, 
TXDOT Item 302                    
(price per ton)              
Lawson # 14173 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

   Each add'l mile 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant Location/s 

Type C, Hot Mix Asphaltic 
Concrete Pavement:  
TXDOT Item 341, Class A 
aggregates with PG7622 oil   
(price per ton)              
Lawson # 14172 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

Item Removed

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

37.25$                      

3.75$                        

0.20$                        

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

3.00$                        

0.21$                        

Fort Bend

24 tons

0.21$                        

Stafford

24 tons

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

58.50$                      

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

3.00$                        
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 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

24 tons

 Bullrock 3” x 5”                     
(price per ton)               
Lawson # 14175 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 623 Traprock Grade 5, 
TXDOT Item 302                    
(price per ton)               
Lawson # 14174 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant Location/s 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant Location/s 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Minimum Order 

 Installation 

40.00$                      

3.75$                        

0.20$                        

Rosenberg

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

58.50$                      

3.00$                        

40.50$                      

Stafford

0.21$                        

Fort Bend

24 tons

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

No Bid

24 tons

0.21$                        

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 
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 Plant Location/s 

70.00$                      

4.20$                        

0.30$                        

Arcola

24 tons

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 Rip Rap, Grade 1, 12” to 
18”                                            
(price per ton)               
Lawson # 14176 

 Limestone Base 1 1/2"           
(price per ton)               
Lawson # 15818 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

Katy 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Minimum Order 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant Location/s 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

   Each add'l mile 

Stafford

25 Tons 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

55.00$                      65.00$                      

4.00$                        3.50$                        

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

0.30$                        0.26$                        

25.25$                      

3.75$                        

0.20$                        

Rosenberg

24 tons

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

14



Fort Bend County Bid 22-051

 Limestone Base 3/4"              
(price per ton)              
Lawson # 15819 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

 James Construction 
Group, LLC.,        

Richmond 

 Plant Location/s 

   Each add'l mile 

 Screened Decomposed 
Granite Gravel ¾-:                 
(price per ton) 

 Minimum Order 

 Plant Location/s  

 Minimum Order 

 Plant/Pit/Siding 

   Each add'l mile 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Plant to Jobsite-1st mile 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

3.75$                        

0.20$                        

Rosenberg

24 tons

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

25.75$                      

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 

 Martin Marietta 
Materials, Inc.,       

Kingwood 

 Texas Materials 
Group,             

Bay Town 

 Vulcan Materials 
Company           

dba                
Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC,      
San Antonio 

 LeHigh Hanson & 
Subsidiaries          

dba                 
Gulf Coast Stabilized 

Materials LLC,       
Richmond 

 Waller County 
Asphalt, Inc.,        
Hempstead 
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