Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 22-050
Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Road Materials

Term: 1 April 2022 through 31 March 2023

Awarded 3/22/22: All Bidders Meeting Specifications

*Amended 6/28/2022

CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300 (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Lawson # 14133 Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 gallons 5500 gallons No Bid
Rosenberg $ 2.34] $ 2.21
Crabb $ 2.34] $ 2.21
Fresno $ 2.34] $ 2.21
Needville $ 234] $ 2.21
Richmond $ 2.34] $ 2.21
Plant $ 2.20] $ 2.10
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge $80.00 per hour after 2 $70.00 per hour after 2

free hours free hours
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 300 Christi P1, South

Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)

Fees and Minimum Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Lawson # 14134 Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX

Undiluted Delivered $ 2.34 No Bid *$
Diluted 12:1 Delivered $ 2.18 *$
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 5000
Demurrage Charge $80.00 per hour after 2 $80.00 per hour after 2

free hours free hours




SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Lawson # 14135 Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 gallons 5500 gallons No Bid
Rosenberg $ 2.34] $ 2.21
Crabb $ 2.34] $ 2.21
Fresno $ 2.34) $ 2.21
Needville $ 234 $ 2.21
Richmond $ 2.34) $ 2.21
Plant $ 2.20] $ 2.10
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee
Demurrage Charge $80.00 per hour after 2 $70.00 per hour after 2

free hours free hours
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 300 Christi P1, South

P2 Road Stabilizer (price per gallon) or equal to:

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Lawson # 14136 Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000
Rosenberg *$ 2.96
Crabb *$ 2.96
Fresno *$ 2.96
Needville *$ 2.96
Richmond *$ 2.96
Plant *$ 2.96
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile *$ 2.96
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee $ 1.30
Demurrage Charge $80.00 per hour after 2
free hours

Plant Location 516 S.McLennan Loop,
Elm Mott, TX




Chip Seal Emulsion "CWE-2" (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Lawson # 14137 Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000
Rosenberg *$ 3.29
Crabb *$ 3.29
Fresno *$ 3.29
Needville *$ 3.29
Richmond *$ 3.29
Plant *$ 3.29
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee $ 1.30
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge $80.00 per hour after 2

free hours
Plant Location 516 S.McLennan Loop,

Elm Mott, TX
ROC-P2 Road Over Coat
Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Lawson # 14138 Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000
Rosenberg *$ 3.14
Crabb *$ 3.14
Fresno *$ 3.14
Needville *$ 3.14
Richmond *$ 3.14
Plant *$ 3.14
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee $ 1.30
Demurrage Charge $80.00 per hour after 2

free hours

Plant Location

516 S.McLennan Loop,
Elm Mott, TX
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