
Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

SW724 or SW993, 5.11 Performance Polo, with County Seal on Left 
chest and name and title embroidered on right chest

71049-019, 5.11 Polo, including Name and Badge embroidery

Taclite 71175 #SR570 Pro Short Sleeve Shirts

Blauer 8666 and 8666W FlexRS Covert Pant, Black

Blauer 8676 and 8676W FlexRS Short Sleeve Supershirt, Black, with 
Badge embroidered over left chest and name embroidered over right 
chest. Patches sewn on each shoulder are supplied by customer.

Blauer 8671 and 8671W FlexRS Long Sleeve Supershirt, Black, with 
Badge embroidered over left chest and name embroidered over right 
chest. Patches sewn on each shoulder are supplied by customer.

Liner to Duty Jacket, Gerber, 51S3, Blk

71500C, Fechheimer Safety Vest, Traffic Control with POLICE, Navy 
Banding

70F3/L, Reversible, Rain Coat, Gerber, 48", black/green, including 
POLICE on both sides

Blauer 8360XP FlexRS Armorskin vest carrier, Black, with badge 
embroidered over left chest and name embroidered over right chest.

E3010BA, Smith and Warren Badge in Gold Ray or Sil Ray

Patch, Fort Bend Co. Pct. 3 new shoulder patch

NT095, Blackinton, Name Plate

UA494, BLK, Tie

Gerber 51S3 Warrior Soft Shell jacket, black, with badge embroidered 
over left chest, name embroidered over right chest and POLICE in silver 
reflective letters on back. Patches sewn on each shoulder are supplied by 
customer.

Style UE002 LGLD Blk Sergeant Stripes (pair)

5.11 Taclite 74272 or 64360 Pants

E525, Stars, Smith & Warren

C538, LT Pins, Smith & Warren 16.25$       

51,129.20$  57,209.20$  Total for Constable Precinct One:

123.75$     

69.67$       

186.00$     

160.00$     

95.20$       

3.50$         

15.00$       

6.50$         

153.75$     14880

14881

14883

14885

14886

150.00$       

65.00$         

1,537.50$    

32.50$         

32.50$         

7,068.00$    

8,000.00$    

952.00$       

35.00$         

3.50$         

53.62$       

17.50$         

1,072.40$    

16.25$       

7.

93.00$       

97.79$       

103.67$     

10,602.00$  

11,148.06$  

11,818.38$  

247.50$       

2,647.46$    

308.70$       

308.70$       

2.50$         

10.

114

84.00$       

84.00$       

5.

6.

11.

12.

88.20$       

115.50$     

57.50$       

114

114

4.

180.00$     38

2

16.

17.

19.

10 13.65$       

15.

50 143.00$     

125.00$     

13.

14. 7.00$         

10 115.50$     

5 4.50$         

2 15.00$       

20

15.00$       

1487610

231.00$       

920.00$       

1,260.00$    

9,576.00$    

10,054.80$  

2,185.00$    

6,840.00$    

7,150.00$    

1,250.00$    

25.00$         

136.50$       

22.50$         

1,155.00$    

70.00$         

14864

14866

20

38

30.00$         

14860

14862

Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. Vendor

59.25$       355.50$       

9,576.00$    

18.

8.

9.

10

10

46.00$       

2 30.00$         

14867

14869

14871

14872

14874

14875

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

59.25$       355.50$       

53.62$       1,072.40$    

14855

14857

14858

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in 
cell below specification.  Provide specifications labeled with below item 
number for each item verifying equal to.

63.00$       

CONSTABLE PRECINCT ONE

1.

2.

3.

51.45$       6

6 51.45$       



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Blauer TU318, DKNV, 6 Pocket Pant, with Hem

Blauer TU317, DKNV, 4 Pocket Pant, with Hem

TR618 Fechheimer Poly/Wool Pants

TR506 511 Tac Lite Pants for Deputies

TR2254 or TR2253 Mens Pants

TR2266 or TR2299 Womens Pants

SH3592 mens short sleeve shirts

SH3591 mens long sleeve shirts

SH3650 womens short sleeve shirts

SH3609 womens long sleeve shirts

SH3594 mens long sleeve shirts

SH3593 mens short sleeve shirts

SH3611 womens long sleeve shirts

SH3610 womens short sleeve shirts

Blauer 8650T-TR2057-Blauer 4 pocket Polyester Pant w 
tunnel Waistband/Transitional

Blauer 8655T-TR2059-Blauer 6 pocket Polyester Pant w 
tunnel Waistband/Transitional update Women

Blauer 8657WT-TR2124-Blauer 6 pocket Polyester Pant w 
tunnel Waistband, Men

2,952.00$    

Blauer 8657WT-TR2133-Blauer 6 pocket Polyester Pant w 
tunnel Waistband, Women

16. 36 14854 83.00$       2,988.00$    

18. 36 14859 82.00$       2,952.00$    

36 1485617. 82.00$       

14. 36 75.00$       2,700.00$    

36 66.00$       

10.

2,376.00$    

3,175.20$    

36 82.00$       2,952.00$    

2,700.00$    

15.

13. 36 82.00$       2,952.00$    

2,988.00$    

CONSTABLE PRECINCT TWO

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and
number in cell below specification. Provide specifications
labeled with below item number for each item verifying equal 

3,528.00$    

1,656.00$    

3.

4.

84.00$       

88.20$       

36

36

2,376.00$    

98.00$       

36

36

66.00$       

3,175.20$    

Galls, LLCVendor

14837

14839

14840

12. 36 75.00$       

361. 83.00$       

36 88.20$       

9. 36

14842

1484411.

46.00$       

84.00$       

14829

14831

14832

362.

14845

G T Distributiors, Inc. 

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

14827  Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

3,024.00$    

5. 36 84.00$       3,024.00$    

6. 36 84.00$       3,024.00$    

3,024.00$    7.

8.

14834

14835

14853

14851

14848



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Tf824 Apex Cargo Pants-Command Staff

ICE Polo, Propper ST136 w Embroidery on left & name & title 
on right

Blauer SH036, s/s w patch 

Blauer SH035, l/s and 

Gerber 71DX3/L, Jacket, Black- with patches and Constable in 
reflective

RW089 Tact Squad Reversible Rain coat with Reflective 
"Constable"

ZH303 Fechheimer Single Breasted Blouse Coat Poly/Wool

Tie, 18", Samuel Broome, Black

Tie, 20", Samuel Broome, Black

HA036 Baseball caps, five (5) panel, navy blue, Velcro 
closure, with Badge embroidered in silver or gold

HD114 5 Star Cap, Navy or White

VISOR 19 Scramble Eggs for Constable

Fort Bend County Pct. 2 Custom Emblem, Badge

Embroidery on Wool Coat Sleeves

Embroidery on Caps

BC1690 Smith & Warren - Badge

Patches, Gold Trim, Chevron

Patches, Silver, Chevron

Patches, Small  Badge for Hat - Gold

Patches, Small Badge for Hat - Silver

Armor Skin, BP 2867

Total for Constable Precinct Two: 72,070.40$  

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

G T Distributiors, Inc. 

39. 60 143.00$     8,580.00$    

150.00$       60

60

680.00$       

204.75$     

10

10

CONSTABLE PRECINCT TWO (cont'd) Galls, LLCVendor

14882

14879

14878

14877

14873

150.00$       

22.

600.00$       

20.

10

19.

51.45$       

60.00$       

68.00$       

10

21.

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and
number in cell below specification. Provide specifications
labeled with below item number for each item verifying equal 

37.

38.

28.

29.

30.

31.

32.

36.

63.00$         6

34. 10

10

105.00$       

35.

650.00$       

2.50$         

65.00$       

48.00$       

2.50$         

2.50$         

10.50$       

147.00$     

2.50$         

2.50$         25.00$         

33.

23.

24.

25.

26.

27. 7.00$         

10

10

650.00$       

70.00$         

20.00$       

10

200.00$       

65.00$       

7.00$         

315.00$     3,150.00$    

25.00$         

14887

14884

10.50$       

10

10

12

10

14905

14904

14902

14901

14899

14898

14895

14894

14891

10

60

10

10

14865

14863

1,470.00$    

514.50$       

2,047.50$    

150.00$       

660.00$       

84.00$         

480.00$       

66.00$       

14870

14868

14861



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Blauer 8666 and 8666W FlexRS Covert Pant, Black

Blauer 8676 and 8676W FLexRS short sleeve supershirt, black, with 
badge embroidered over left chest, name on name
tape over right chest, PCT. 3 embroidered on both collars and patches 
sewn on each shoulder are provided by customer

Blauer 8671 and 8671W FlexRS long sleeve supershirt, black, with 
badge embroidered over left chest, name on name

Gerber #71DX3/L Winter Jacket  Zip in and out liner, Reversible to 
lime green

70F3/L reversible raincoat, black with lime, with POLICE on the back

Fort Bend Co Pct. 3 Emblem Custom

J1 Name Plate

5.11 71049-019 or 61165-019, Polo Shirt with Name and Logo 
Embroidered

Flying Cross 54101A Jacket, navy blue with badge embroidered over 
left chest and name and title embroidered over right
chest (Command Jacket)

Gerber 51S1 Jacket, black with badge over left chest, Deputy over right 
chest and CONSTABLE in silver reflective letters on
back

14906

Smith and Warren badge E402- M375TX, Gold EP or Silver(rhodium) 
EP, Solid Back - Curved, block font, soft enamel, black letters, pin & 
safety catch

14907

Carhartt A-18 acrylic knit cap with small patch added. Black 14909

Otto Cap 11-1168-004 ballcap with small patch added. Black 14911

Sergeant stripes (pair) Style UE002 RED BLK

Sergeant stripes (pair) Style UX509 RED BLK

16. Blauer 8650T - Men's 4-pocket polyester trousers w/ tunnel waistband, 
BLK

17. Blauer 8670 and 8670W - Super shirt L/S polyester shirt, BLK

18. Galls UA494 3in. Polyester clip on tie w/ buttonhole, BLK

19. BP4400 Point Blank Endeavor Laser Cut Carrier w/ Kwiq-Clip -
O3LM00BVZ9/KWIQ-CLIP BKA CSTM, BLK

14888

14889

14890

14892

14893

14896

1,023.75$    

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

10.

11.

12.

30 80.00$       

30

60 115.50$     

500.00$       

14897

14900

14903

6. 2.50$         200

5 13.65$       68.25$         7.

8.

9.

13.

27.00$         

14916

14915

10

6

6 4.50$         

4.50$         14.

15.

10

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

130.00$       

3,960.00$    

5,292.00$    

420.00$       

3,050.00$    

66.00$       

88.20$       

7.00$         

305.00$     

27.00$         

13.00$       

5,040.00$    

5,040.00$    

5 204.75$     

88.20$       

180.00$     

60

60

60

900.00$       

30

5

60

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

CONSTABLE PRECINCT THREE

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

40,343.00$  Total for Constable Precinct Three:

G T Distributiors, Inc. Galls, LLCVendor

20.00$       

1,029.00$    

1,260.00$    

6,930.00$    

2,400.00$    

600.00$       

126.00$     

20 51.45$       

10

84.00$       

60 84.00$       

2,646.00$    

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Blauer FlexRS L/S Supershirt 8671 Womans 8671W

Blauer FlexRS S/S Supershirt 8676 Womans 8676W

Embroidery for #1 and 2.  PCT 4 Collars. Name and rank name tape.

Blauer FlexRS Covert Tactical Pants 8666 Womans 8666W

Blauer Reversible Raincoat Grn/Blk Constable reflective both sides

Blauer B Dry 3 Season Jacket 6120 w/Constable silver reflective back

Blauer Breakaway Safety Vest 339 w/ Constable reflective silver

Blauer Ruggedize Armorskin XP Carrier 8350XP

Safariland Hardwire Armor IIIA Ballistic Panels

Premier Emblem PCT 4 Pendant Collar gold/silver

(Item Removed)

Blackington Nameplate (first initial, last name) gold/silver

Black Polo Propper S/S Shirt with badge, name and rank embroidered

Precinct 4 Shoulder Patches

Sergeant Chevrons (3 rockers up, 2 down w/star in center, gold/navy)

Sergeant Circle Badge Patches

Corporal Chevrons (2 Rockers up, gold/navy)

E525. Two-stars (gold). Smith & Warren

E525. Four-stars (gold). Smith & Warren

C538. Lieutenant Pins. Single bar (gold). Smith & Warren

3.50$         

17.00$       

17.00$       

17.00$       

15.00$       

56.24$       

3.00$         

3.50$         

3.50$         

175.00$       

170.00$       

217.00$     

67.00$       

154.00$     

1,373.00$  

-$           

85.67$       

79.79$       

18.00$       

93.00$       

173.00$     

15.00$       

15.00$       

15.00$       

54.45$       

2.50$         

2.50$         

2.50$         

2.50$         

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

68.00$         

170.00$       

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

14843

NEW

900.00$       

175.00$       

175.00$       

3,388.00$    

30,206.00$  

-$             

60.00$         

224.96$       

171.34$       

217.80$       

750.00$       

125.00$       

125.00$       

125.00$       

150.00$       

60.00$         

150.00$       

319.16$       

72.00$         

372.00$       

692.00$       

868.00$       

13,400.00$  

412.

19. 10

16. 50

17. 10

18. 4

13. 300

14. 50

15. 50

272.00$       

720.00$       

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

72.20$       21. 144.40$       

4 68.00$       

3.

2.

4.

4

4

5.

11,400.00$  

2,970.00$    

64.00$         16.00$       

4

180.00$     

336.00$       

37,950.00$  

54.60$         

544.00$       

84.00$       

-$             

6.

11.

4

7.

8.

-$           

4 13.65$       

136.00$     

57.00$       

135.00$     

1,725.00$  

10. 8

200

22

229.

G T Distributiors, Inc. Galls, LLCVendor

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

CONSTABLE PRECINCT FOUR



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Samuel Broome Navy blue clip on tie 20"

Small sewn on patches for baseball caps

Command Staff Jacket. Flying Cross F1 34891 86 LAPD Navy

90.00$         6.00$         

G T Distributiors, Inc. 

7.00$         

2.00$         

NEW

NEW

NEW

58,087.80$  53,822.71$  

335.00$     

105.00$       

150.00$       

1,675.00$    

206.25$       

1,920.00$    

2.75$         

384.00$     

Total for Constable Precinct Four:

Vendor Galls, LLC

20. 15

21. 75

22. 5

CONSTABLE PRECINCT FOUR (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Elbeco Duty Max 5580 SS Shirt, Mens, White

Elbeco Duty Max 9780 SS Shirt, Womens, White

Elbeco Duty Max 580 LS Shirt, Mens, White

Elbeco Duty Max 9580 LS Shirt, Womens, White

1211U-belt, black, no scratch

HS572  Safety vests with Scothlite Package front and back,
EMS-3” in reflective on front and back, with FORT BEND-2” reflective 
on back  

Liner to Duty Jacket(Navy) Gerber, 51S5  Left Chest - FORT BEND 
COUNTY SEAL. Right Chest - NAME - TITLE

3" Polyester Tie, 18" Dark Navy (no clip on)

3" Polyester Tie, 20" Dark Navy (no clip on)

3" Polyester Tie, 22" Dark Navy (no clip on)

3" Poly-Wool Tie, 18" Dark Navy (no clip on)

3" Poly-Wool Tie, 20" Dark Navy (no clip on)

3" Poly-Wool Tie, 22" Dark Navy (no clip on)

5.11 Tactical, Men Taclite PDU Class B Pant, 74371-750

5.11 Tactical, Women Taclite PDU Class B Pant, 64371-750

5.11 Tactical, Men Taclite PDU Class A Pant, 74370

5.11 Tactical, Women Taclite PDU Class A Pant, 64370

5.11 Tactical, Men Taclite PDU Class B SSshirt, 71168-750

5.11 Tactical, Women Taclite PDU Class B SSshirt, 61168-750

5.11 Tactical, Men Taclite PDU Class B LSSshirt, 72366-750

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 
2.

17. 260.00$       

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

9.

10.

11.

4.

7.00$         14.00$         

14.00$         

2 7.00$         

14.00$         

2 7.00$         

2

75

7518.

19.

20.

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

14927

14922

14920

14919

14918

14917

149145.

6.

7.

8.

40

1,732.50$    

577.50$       

304.50$       

304.50$       

960.00$       

945.00$       

1,155.00$    

Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. Vendor

3.

14908

14910

14912

14913

1.

EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

30 57.75$       

10 57.75$       

5 60.90$       

5 60.90$       

3,900.00$    

3,900.00$    

275.00$       

24.00$       

10 94.50$       

10

2

115.50$     

7.00$         

2

52.00$       

75 52.00$       

5 55.00$       

7.00$         

55.00$       

5 52.00$       

5 52.00$       

75

7.00$         

2 14929

14944

14943

14942

14939

55.00$       

14937

14935

14933

14931

14.00$         

14.00$         

14.00$         

4,125.00$    

4,125.00$    

260.00$       



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

5.11 Tactical, Women Taclite PDU Class B LSSshirt, 62366-750

TDH emblems, EMT

TDH emblems, EMT Intermediate

TDH – PARAMEDIC, LICENSED 

TDH – PARAMEDIC, CERTIFIED 

County MICU Patch including sew on

Custom Embroidery Badge on left chest and name and first initial, last 
name 3/8" on right Chest

Custom Embroidery, FBCEMS Badge, on left

Blackington Bugle Pin, Single Bugle, CB056

Blackington Bugle Pin, 2 Crossed, CB058

Blackington Bugle Pin, 3 Crossed, CB059

Blackington Bugle Pin, 4 Crossed, CB060

Blackington Bugle Pin, 5 Crossed, CB061

Blaur 8131-1 Polo with EMS Logo on Left Chest and Embroidery on 
Right Chest

Blauer 8133 Polo, D Navy/Hi Vis Yellow, Velcro Name Strip Hi Vis 
Yellow with Black print, FBCEMS Patch on Left Sleeve, Certification 
Patch on Right Sleeve

5.11 Canvas Job Shirt with Custom Embroidery

Bullard USRX Firefighter Helmet, Blue, Red or White

Nametag Gold Clutch Better Back Premier Clutchback

1.5" Instructors Gun Belt w/Talon Flex, Black

Tru Spec 65/35 Poly Cotton R/S Combat Shirt, Olive

Gerber Extreme Parka 107-2010, Lime Yellow/Midnight Navy, Velcro 
Name plate left chest, "FORT BEND EMS" in reflective grey w/ black 
outline (#71E1/L)

Embroidery Removal

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

2,450.00$    

136.50$       

14947

36.

14963

14961

14960

14956

14954

14950

14949

14948

14983

30.

25.

150

14982

14979

14978

14976

14974

14972

14971

14968

14966

EMS (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

31.

32.

33.

34.

35.

G T Distributiors, Inc. Galls, LLCVendor

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

42.

750.00$       

275.00$       

25.00$         

10 178.50$     

25 8.00$         

5 4.50$         

200.00$       

21.

24.

26.

750.00$       

40.00$         

22.

23.

27.

28.

29.

25.00$         

5 55.00$       

5 5.00$         14946

14945

5.00$         

200 16.00$       

10 8.00$         

5 8.00$         

450.00$       

500.00$       

22.50$         

650.00$       

1,050.00$    

80.00$         

22.50$         

22.50$         

3,200.00$    

5 5.00$         

420.00$       

577.50$       

1,785.00$    

22.50$         

5 4.50$         

150 5.00$         

200 2.50$         

5 4.50$         

10 13.65$       

10 42.00$       

10 57.75$       

10 245.00$     

5 4.50$         

10 65.00$       

10

14964

105.00$     

5 90.00$       



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Gildan DryBlend 50/50 T-Shirt, FBCEMS Badge on left chest, "FORT 
BEND COUNTY PARAMEDIC" on back, Sizes Small - 4X, Color = 
Navy

Gildan DryBlend 50/50 T-Shirt, FBCEMS Badge on left chest, "FORT 
BEND COUNTY EMS" on back, Sizes Small - 4X,     Color = Navy

Maternity Panel add on Pants

5.11 Tactical Stryke Pants - Mens, Color = Dark Navy

5.11 Tactical Stryke Pants - Womens, Color = Dark Navy

Port and Company 50/50 Mens Polo Shirt w/Embroidered Logo on left 
chest

Port and Company 50/50 Womens Polo Shirt w/Embroidered Logo on 
left chest

Fechhiemer Double Breasted Gold Bugle 6 Button Dress Coat  W/ 
service stripes on each sleeve

Midway Cap Midloin 5 Star Cap, White

Smith and Warren hat badge

Fechheimer Mens, Polyester Trousers, w/piping on pant leg

Thorogood Academy Oxford Shoe

Ballistics Helmet TE622

Blauer Job shirt - JA1198 with custom embroidery

Lapel Pins - Caduceus Gold on Navy 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 1 Bugle Navy on White 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 1 Bugle Gold on Navy 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 2 Bugle Navy on White 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 2 Bugle Gold on Navy 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 3 Bugle Navy on White 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 3 Bugle Gold on Navy 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 4 Bugle Navy on White 15/16" set of 2

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

G T Distributiors, Inc. 

80.00$       

21.00$       

52.00$       

2,400.00$    

57.

58.

59.

60.

61.

15004

64.

63.

62.

15024

1502140

2

15026

15018

15016

15013

1501230

5

68.00$       

15031

15027

10

55.

56.

43.

44.

49.

50.

51.

52.

53.

54.

45.

46.

47.

48.

5 70.00$       

5 245.00$     

5 65.00$       

5

Galls, LLCVendor

1,600.00$    

10

25.00$       

10 68.00$       

10

15002

15000

14998

14994

14993

14992

14990

14986

15011

15010

15008

15006

5 325.00$     

2

25 16.00$       

100 16.00$       

1,625.00$    

400.00$       

50.00$         

680.00$       

680.00$       

210.00$       

210.00$       

1,225.00$    

325.00$       

120.00$       

260.00$       

350.00$       

24.00$       

21.00$       

210.00$       

26.00$       130.00$       

26.00$       130.00$       

26.00$       1,040.00$    

21.00$       

10 26.00$       260.00$       

5

5

10

10 26.00$       260.00$       

2 26.00$       52.00$         

26.00$       52.00$         

EMS (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Lapel Pins - 4 Bugle Gold on Navy 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 5 Bugle Navy on White 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - 5 Bugle Gold on Navy 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - Star of Life Navy on White 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - Star of Life Gold on Navy 15/16" set of 2

Lapel Pins - Star of Life Gold 15/16" set of 2

Commendation Bar Slide Holder 3/8" - 2 Award 

Commendation Bar Slide Holder 3/8" - 3 Award 

Commendation Bar Slide Holder 3/8" - 4 Award 

Commendation Bar Slide Holder 3/8" - 7 Award 

Commendation Bar Slide Holder 3/8" - 10 Award 

Custom Award Pin - Chief's Award 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Unit Commendation 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Valor 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Merit 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Blue Stork 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Pink Stork 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Tox Medic 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Bike Team 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Tactical Team 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Tech Rescue 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - FTO 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Cardiac Arrest 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Paramedic of the Year 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Employee of the Year 3/8" with Single Slide

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

68.

67.

66.

65.

77.

76.

15116

15050

15047

15046

15045

15044

15043

75.

74.

73.

72.

71.

70.

69. 75

75

5

86.

85.

15125

15124

15123

15122

15121

15120

15119

84.

83.

82.

81.

80.

79.

78.

20

10

89.

88.

87.

15130

15129

15128

15127

G T Distributiors, Inc. Galls, LLCVendor

15042

15041

15036

15032

15126

2 26.00$       52.00$         

2 26.00$       52.00$         

2 26.00$       52.00$         

2 50.00$       100.00$       

50.00$       3,750.00$    

75 50.00$       3,750.00$    

5 5.00$         25.00$         

5 6.00$         30.00$         

12.00$       900.00$       

75 14.00$       1,050.00$    

5 16.00$       80.00$         

5 18.00$       90.00$         

18.00$       90.00$         

5 18.00$       90.00$         

15118

15117

20 18.00$       360.00$       

18.00$       360.00$       

20 18.00$       360.00$       

20 18.00$       360.00$       

10 18.00$       180.00$       

18.00$       180.00$       

5 18.00$       90.00$         

5 18.00$       90.00$         

18.00$       90.00$         5

5 18.00$       90.00$         

5 18.00$       90.00$         

EMS (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Custom Award Pin - Unit Excellence 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Purple Heart 3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - URI Storm 2021  3/8" with Single Slide

Custom Award Pin - Peer Support

Patch - Medical Director

Patch - Honor Guard

Patch - Competition Team

Patch - County MICU 3"

Patch - County MICU Woven 3"

Patch - County MICU Woven 4"

Patch - Tactical, Black 3"

Patch - Tactical Medic

B1674, Badge, Two-Toned, Blackinton

Class A White Gloves with finger grips

Honor Guard Braided Cord

J1 Name Plate

Ariat 10011976 Women's Composite Toe ESD Clog Work Shoes 

Bates E03140 - 8" DuraShocks Side Zip Boot

Rocky 6300 - 10" Pull-On Wellington Boots

Rocky FQ0006173 - 8" AphaForce Side Zip Composite Toe Waterproof 
Boot

Thorogood 804-6134 - 6" Quick Release Composite Toe Station Boot

Thorogood 834-6134 - 6" Quick Release Station Boot

Streamlight Stinger #75863 LED HPL DS Rechargeable Flashlight with 
AC & DC Chargers

Duffel Bag - Gall's BG186, Black with Custom Embroidery

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

95.

94.

93.

92.

91.

90.

15134

15133

15132

15131

15141

99.

98.

97.

113.

15135

15142

15143

15144

15145

15146

15147

15149

15153

G T Distributiors, Inc. Galls, LLCVendor

10

15155

15156

15158

15159

25

112.

111.

110.

109.

108.

107.

106.

105.

104.

103.

102.

101.

100.

96. 15137

15138

15139

10

10

15136

10 2.50$         25.00$         

10 2.50$         25.00$         

10 18.00$       180.00$       

10 18.00$       180.00$       

5 18.00$       90.00$         

10 18.00$       180.00$       

2.50$         25.00$         

2.50$         25.00$         

3.00$         75.00$         

110.00$     

20 3.00$         60.00$         

25 2.50$         62.50$         

2 2.50$         5.00$           

10 13.65$       136.50$       

5 110.00$     550.00$       

5

10 130.00$     1,300.00$    

10 105.00$       

15140

20 40.00$       800.00$       

15154

2,200.00$    

10.50$       

20

12.00$       120.00$       

126.00$     630.00$       

EMS (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

25 112.00$     2,800.00$    

2 105.00$     210.00$       

10 100.00$     1,000.00$    

10 180.00$     1,800.00$    



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Blackington Bugle Pin, Caduceus

Under Armour Men's Micro G Stellar Zip Waterproof Boots Gall's 
#FW1689

Merrell Men's Moab 3 8" Tactical Side-Zip Waterproof Boots Gall's 
#FW1036      

Salomon QUEST 4D FORCES 2 HIGH GORE-TEX EN Gall's 
#FW1397

Salomon X Ultra Forces Mid GTX Boots Gall's #FW1369

Bates High Gloss Oxford, E22141 Gall's #FW668

Lowa Zephyr MK2 GTX Hi Boots Gall's #FW1346

Sport-Tek PosiCharge Competitor Tee, ST350

Sport-Tek Long Sleeve PosiCharge Competitor Tee, ST350LS

Vertx Men's Coldblack Polo, VTX4000

Vertx Women's Coldblack Polo, VTX4010P

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

60.00$       

210.00$     

18.00$       

20.00$       

50.00$       

50.00$       

300.00$       

2,100.00$    

900.00$       

1,000.00$    

2,500.00$    

2,500.00$    

121.

120.

119.

118.

117.

116.

115.

114.

Total for EMS: 88,406.00$  

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

5

10

50

50

50

50124.

123.

122.

140.00$     1,400.00$    

G T Distributiors, Inc. Galls, LLCVendor

NEW

EMS (cont'd)

10

10 190.00$     1,900.00$    

5 26.00$       130.00$       

10 90.00$       900.00$       

10 120.00$     1,200.00$    

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

1. J3 Blackinton Nameplate 1 14926

2.
SH3379 First Tactical Men's V2 Tactical Short Sleeve Shirt WHITE

1 NEW

3. SH5033 5.11 Tactical Stryke PDU Twill Rapid Short Sleeve Shirt 
BLACK

1 NEW

4. SH5067 5.11 Tactical Men's Stryke PDU Twill Rapid Long Sleeve 
Shirt BLACK

1 NEW

5. SW2577 5.11 Tactical Men's Class A Uniform Short Sleeve Polo 
BLACK

1 NEW

6. SW724 5.11 Tactical Men's Snag-Free Performance Short Sleeve Polo 
SILVER TAN

1 NEW

7. SW726 5.11 Tactical Men's Snag-Free Performance Long Sleeve Polo 
SILVER TAN

1 NEW

8. SH599 Blauer Super Shirt 100% Poly S/S Shirt WHITE 1 NEW

9. SH095 Elbeco Response Paragon Plus Long Sleeve Poly Cotton Shirt 
LIGHT BLUE

1 NEW

10. SH3591 Flex RS LS Supershirt OLIVE DRAB 1 NEW

11. SH3592 Flex RS SS Supershirt OLIVE DRAB

12. TR3224 5.11 Tactical Men's Stryke Pants RANGER GREEN

13. TR909 5.11 Tactical Men's Stryke Pants BATTLE BROWN

14. TR909 5.11 Tactical Men's Stryke Pants BLACK

15. JA028 Condor Phantom Softshell Jacket BLACK

16. JA028 Condor Phantom Softshell Jacket COYOTE

17. JA2471 5.11 Tactical 3-in-1 Parka 2.0 BLACK

RW093 Neese Lime Green 48" PVC Vinyl Raincoat with Reflective 
Striping LIME GREEN

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

18.

51.45$       

54.60$       

95.00$       

40.00$       

88.20$       

1

80.00$       

210.00$     

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW 32.00$       

1 84.00$       

68.00$       

68.00$       

68.00$       

80.00$       80.00$         

80.00$         

210.00$       

1

1

1

54.60$         

95.00$         

40.00$         

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

32.00$         

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:   lowest bidder per section

1

1

1

88.20$         

84.00$         

68.00$         

68.00$         

68.00$         

51.45$         

13.65$       

60.00$       

75.00$       

80.00$       

50.00$       

FIRE MARSHAL

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

13.65$         

60.00$         

75.00$         

80.00$         

50.00$         

G T Distributiors, Inc. Galls, LLCVendor



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

19. CB061 Blackinton 5 Crossed Bugles Pin GOLD PLATE

20. CB060 Blackinton 4 Crossed Bugles Pin GOLD PLATE

21. CB059 Blackinton 3 Crossed Bugles Pin GOLD PLATE

22. UN923 Eiseman-Ludmar Metal Cutout 2 Crossed Bugles Collar 
Insignia GOLD PLATE

23. CB074 Smith & Warren Custom Collar Pins 3 Letters 3/8" (sold in 
pairs) GOLD PLATE

24. CB074 Smith & Warren Custom Collar Pins 3 Letters 3/8" (sold in 
pairs) NICKEL

25. LH260 Boston Leather 1 3/4 Garrison Belt PLAIN/BLACK

26.
LP673 Dutyman 1.75" Garrison Belt PLAIN/BLACK

27.
TE041 Blackhawk! CQB/Riggers Belt BLACK

28.
TE041 Blackhawk! CQB/Riggers Belt COYOTE

29. NT097 Blackinton Nametag One Line GOLD

30. NT097 Blackinton Nametag One Line SILVER

31. UA494 Galls Clip-On Tie BLACK

32. FW515 Thorogood Porpmeric Academy Oxford BLACK

33. BP447 Point Blank Hi Lite Level XP IIIA Custon Vest BLACK

34. BP3419 Guardian Gen 3 Carrier (Body Armor Carriers) BLACK NEW

NEW

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

25.00$         

G T Distributiors, Inc. 

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

7.00$         

70.00$       

820.00$     

245.00$     

7.00$           

70.00$         

820.00$       

245.00$       

60.00$         

13.65$         

6.00$         

6.00$         

13.65$         13.65$       

6.00$         

9.00$         

25.00$       

25.00$       

18.00$       

28.00$       

60.00$       

60.00$       

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

NEW

13.65$       

18.00$         

28.00$         

60.00$         

6.00$           

6.00$           

9.00$           

25.00$         

2,710.20$  

NEW

Total for Fire Marshal

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

Galls, LLC

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

1 6.00$           

FIRE MARSHAL  (cont'd) Vendor



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

TRU 1060, Pants, Men's Tactical Pants 

TRU 1060, Pants, Women's Tactical

Wrangler Jeans, 13MWZ Men's

ELBECO, E314 Men's Trouser, with piping-Traditional  Style

ELBECO, E9314 Women's Trouser-Traditional Style, with piping

ELBECO, E314-13Women's Long Sleeve Shirt-Zipper Front. With 
metal buttons on pocket flaps and shoulder straps 

ELBECO, E314-13Women's Long Sleeve Shirt-Zipper Front. With 
metal buttons on pocket flaps and shoulder straps 

5.11 71049-019  Men's/Women's SS Polo Shirts, with badge 
embroidered over left chest and name and department embroidered over 
right chest

5.11 72049-019 Men's/Women's LS Polo Shirts,  with badge 
embroidered over left chest and name and department embroidered over 
right chest

Blauer FlexRS short sleeve supershirt with nametape, badge patch and 
shoulder patches Style 8676

Blauer FlexRS short sleeve supershirt with nametape, badge patch and 
shoulder patches Style 8676W

Blauer FlexRS long sleeve supershirt with nametape, badge patch and 
shoulder patches Style 8671

Blauer FlexRS long sleeve supershirt with nametape, badge patch and 
shoulder patches Style 8671W

Blauer FlexRS Covert Tactical Pant Style 866614. 21,000.00$  

88.20$       

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

8.

9.

10. 14975

14977

14980

14981

11.

12.

13.

300

200

500 84.00$       42,000.00$  

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

250

14951

14952

14953

NEW

NEW

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

NEW6.

NEW7.

45.00$       

Vendor Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. 

84.00$       25,200.00$  

35,280.00$  

17,640.00$  

400 88.20$       

84.00$       14989

54.60$       

250

60.00$       

54.00$       

54.00$       

54.00$       2,700.00$    

18,007.50$  

8,190.00$    

350

45 45.00$       

54.00$       20

14970

14973

11,250.00$  

1,200.00$    

540.00$       

8,100.00$    

150

20

10

150

50

51.45$       

1,080.00$    

2,025.00$    

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

SHERIFF’S OFFICE



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Blauer FlexRS Covert Tactical Pant Style 8666W

Blauer FlexRS Cargo Pant Style 8665 

Blauer FlexRS Cargo Pant Style 8665W

Short Sleeve T-Shirt, Red, Gus George Academy Logo on Front left 
with staff under the logo all in black

UA Tac Performance SJ079 OD, Short Sleeve, POLO

Long Sleeve T-Shirt, Red, Gus Geroge Academy Logo on Front left 
with staff under the logo all in black

Gerber, 70C3/L, Reversible Raincoat,  with FORT BEND CO. 
SHERIFF'S OFFICE in silver reflective on back on black and green 
back -HD106

Gerber, 71DX5/L, Reversible Winter Duty Jacket, with patches sew on 
jacket and liner. With SHERIFF on back 

Fechheimer JK598 NAV, 55/45 Poly Wool, Dress Coat, with patches 
and striping

Fechheimer TR NAV, 75/25 Poly Wool, Dress Pants

Elbeco SH878, WHT, Polyester, Long Sleeve, White Shirt

UA048, Shoulder Boards

Gerber, 51S5, Liner to Duty Jacket

Blauer Flexrs Airvent Adjustment Cap

Blauer Flexrs Clip on Tie, 18", 20", 22" , DARK Navy - UA3529

Badge - Silver, S266 RH, BC219

27.

28.

29.

30.

540.00$       

1,250.00$    

100

6,700.00$    335.00$     

10

10

23.

22.

15020

15022

15023

24.

25.

26.

20.

21. 15015

1,600.00$    15001

15.

16.

17.

18.

14991

14995

14996

14997

30 84.00$       2,520.00$    

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

19.

Vendor Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. 

840.00$       

12,600.00$  

400.00$       

50 84.00$       

5,775.00$    

18,000.00$  

54.00$       

15

100 1,800.00$    

1,050.00$    

180.00$     

100 204.75$     15017

15019

1,275.00$    

5 90.00$       450.00$       

20,475.00$  

4,200.00$    

10 40.00$       

85.00$       

50 115.50$     

40 40.00$       

125.00$     

150

40 21.00$       

20

14999

15029

15872

15873

18.00$       

7.00$         

15028

SHERIFF’S OFFICE (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

150 84.00$       



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Badge - Gold, S266 GP, BC219

S.O. - Collar Pin, Silver, A4287--Rho-Glo

S.O. - Collar Pin, Gold, A4287--Hi-Glo

Name Bar - Gold, NT095

Name Bar - Silver, NT095

Lieutenant Bars - Large, Gold, A1141--Hi-Glo

Captain Bars - Large, Gold, A1140--Hi-Glo

Major Oak Leaf - Gold, A1143--Hi-Glo

3 Star Pin - Gold, A11--Hi-Glo

4 Star Pin - Gold, A11+A127--Hi-Glo

Honor Guard Name Plate, Blackinton, C14747 

Shoulder Patch, EN22158

Laser Cut Silver Round Badge Patch,  Silver Badge Patch, No Velcro, 
EN22742

Laser Cut Gold Round Badge Patch,  Gold Badge Patch, No Velcro, 
EN22741

Laser Cut Deputy Patch, EN22724

Laser Cut Investigator Patch, EN22723

Laser Cut Sergeant Patch, EN22722

Laser Cut Lieutenant Patch, EN22719

Laser Cut Captain Patch, EN22717

Sergeant Stripe Patch (pair), EN2216050.

New

New

New

New

New

15061

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

42.

43.

44.

45.

46.

47.

15060

48.

49.

4500

1000

100

15048

15049

15051

34.

35.

36.

37. 15052

15053

15054

15055

38.

39.

40.

41 15056

15057

200

400

100

2.50$         

2.50$         

250.00$       

2.00$         

2.50$         

2.50$         

15059

28.00$       

12.00$       

15874

15039

15040

31.

32.

33.

Vendor

150

100

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

SHERIFF’S OFFICE (cont'd)

85.00$       

G T Distributiors, Inc. 

1,000.00$    

900.00$       300

108.00$       

9,000.00$    

250.00$       

2,500.00$    

250.00$       

132.00$       

252.00$       

180.00$       

850.00$       

1,800.00$    

280.00$       

955.50$       

1,200.00$    

480.00$       

Galls, LLC

500.00$       

100 2.50$         

3.00$         

30.00$       

500.00$       

6

24.00$       

10

4 33.00$       

20

10

200 2.50$         

12.00$       

20 13.65$       273.00$       

70 13.65$       

2.50$         

6 42.00$       

6 18.00$       



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Service Stripes

Mourning Covers

SWAT Shoulder Patches

Small Shoulder Patches, EN23514

Small Shoulder Patch - PINK, EN26056

Belt - Premier Emblem, P5003

Ballcap - GGLEA Logo Embroidered on front, 19-768-053

Academy Gear Bag - GGLEA Logo on Bag - Premier Emblem, PBG-

Fleece Hoodie - Red

ID Cases

Patch, Narcotics and Air Suppor - Round Badge Patch

5.11 Tactical 1/4 zip job shirt, Dispatch - SW3297 Blk

Sport-Tek S/S Competitor Tee

K9 patch, shoulder

AIR SUPPORT patch, shoulder

NARC patch, shoulder (black background with green text)

2 Star Pin - Gold, Blackinton A11-2 Hi Glo

5.11 Tactical Stryke Pants - Mens, Dark Navy

5.11 Tactical Stryke Pants - Womens, Dark Navy

Blauer Watch Cap, Style # 125, Dark Navy

5.11 Tactical Motocycle Breeches, #TR407, Dark Navy

68.

69.

70.

71.

New

New

New

New

15079

15875

66.

67.

57.

58.

59.

60.

61.

62.

63.

64.

65.

15067

15068

15069

15070

15071

15072

15073

15077

15078

20

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

51.

52.

SHERIFF’S OFFICE (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

53.

54.

55.

56.

15062

15063

15064

15065

New

15066

2.50$         250.00$       

Vendor Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. 

4.00$         

50 4.00$         

400.00$       

100.00$       

125.00$       

60 15.00$       

60 65.00$       

2.50$         

420.00$       

200.00$       

15 65.00$       

200.00$       

200.00$       

975.00$       

50

21.00$       

20 5.00$         

50

100

200 4.00$         

2.00$         

800.00$       

20 50.00$       

200 2.00$         

200

60 8.00$         

400.00$       

15 1.50$         22.50$         

1,360.00$    20 68.00$       

480.00$       

900.00$       

3,900.00$    

1,000.00$    

20 68.00$       1,360.00$    

10 26.00$       260.00$       

4.00$         50

20 135.00$     2,700.00$    

100 28.00$       2,800.00$    



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Blauer Gore - Tex - Supershell Jacket, # JX441, Dark Navy

Blauer Tacshell Pants, # RW272, Dark Navy

Flying Cross Duty Guard Hardshell Jacket, # JA3251, Black

Small Shoulder Patch (3.5") Green/Black with Velcro, EN26400

Honor Guard Shoulder Patch, EN22653

Volunteer Shoulder Patch, EN22652

Chaplain Shoulder Patch, EN25954

Silver Badge Patch w/ Velcro EN22726

Gold Badge Patch w/ Velcro EN22725

Subdued Round Narcotics Badge Patch, EN27859

FTO Patch, EN28238

Safety Pin, CB2177GP

Elbeco SH885, MDNV, Texttrop2 Men's Zippered Shirt Short Sleeve

Elbeco SH886, DKNV, Texttrop2 Women's  Zippered Shirt Short 
Sleeve

Elbeco SH877, NAV, Texttrop2 Women's Zippered Shirt Long Sleeve

72.

73.

74.

75.

76.

77.

79.

78.

80.

 Disqualified:
Vendor did not bid all 

items in section. 

Total for Sheriff's Office: 354,636.50$  

81.

82.

83.

84.

85.

86.

New

New

100 50.00$       5,000.00$    New

50 2.50$         125.00$       

12 13.00$       156.00$       

New

New

New

50 2.50$         125.00$       

50 3.00$         150.00$       

50 3.00$         150.00$       

New

New

New

50 3.00$         150.00$       

50 2.50$         125.00$       

50 2.50$         125.00$       

New

New

New

20 250.00$     5,000.00$    

100 220.00$     22,000.00$  

New

New

New

Vendor Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. 

30 50.00$       1,500.00$    

20 54.00$       1,080.00$    

100 2.50$         250.00$       

10 450.00$     4,500.00$    

SHERIFF’S OFFICE (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Belt Clarino Sam Brown B1031U

Belt  River  Clarino  Sam Brown B1131U

Belt Reversible Nylon Bianchi 7201

Bianchi Accumold Duty Belt Style 7200

Single Belt Keeper Clarino  2431 

Double Belt Keeper Plain 2211 

Handcuff Pouch Single Top Flap Nylon Bianchi 7300

Handcuff Case Clarino Safariland 190-9

Open Top Cuffcase Clarino Safariland-090-9

Double Speed Loader Case Clarino Safariland 340

Automatic Clip Holder Clarino Safariland 77

Bianchi Accumold Elite Handcuff Case Style 7900

Safariland Paddle Holster, Tactical High Gloss - 6378

Accumold Nylon Trouser Belt (Under Belt) Style 7205

Holster Level II Clarino Safariland 6280

Holster Level III Clarino Safariland 6360

Holster Level III Mid-Rise Tactical STX Safariland 6360

Holster w/light attachment LEVEL II Clarino Safariland 6280

Holster w/light attachment LEVEL III 6360  Safariland-Clarino 235.00$     

60.37$       

62.81$       

34.46$       

43.91$       

4.03$         

5.86$         

25.47$       

40.25$       

35.07$       

35.92$       

40.86$       

32.79$       

62.20$       

22.87$       

127.44$     

147.24$     

132.48$     

7,223.15$    

516.90$       

878.20$       

1,007.50$    

293.00$       

382.05$       

2,012.50$    

7,014.00$    

143.68$       

6,129.00$    

327.90$       

311.00$       

228.70$       

2,548.80$    

2,944.80$    

662.40$       

2,750.00$    

5,505.50$    

137.50$     

157.30$     

8.

9.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15080

15081

15082

15083

15084

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

15087

10

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

35

15088

15089

15090

15091

15092

15878

1509315.

16.

17.

18.

6.

7.

19.

15094

15095

15

20

420.00$       

15085

15086

1,811.10$    

Vendor Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. 

62.00$       1,860.00$    30

70.00$       8,050.00$    

34.00$       510.00$       

48.00$       960.00$       

115

168.00$       

45.00$       6,750.00$    

31.00$       310.00$       

54.00$       270.00$       

25.00$       250.00$       

200.00$     4,000.00$    

225.00$     4,500.00$    

8,225.00$    

8.00$         400.00$       

28.00$       

20

20

5

20 15096

15097

44.00$       2,200.00$    

38.00$       7,600.00$    

42.00$       

158.00$     790.00$       

212.00$     4,240.00$    

DUTY GEAR

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

250

50

15

50

200

4

150

10

5

4.50$         1,125.00$    



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Holster w/light attachment LEVEL III  Mid-Rise  STX Tactical  
Safariland 6360

Magazine Holder  Double-Bianchi 7302 Nylon

Molle Universal Radio Holder - NP610 BLK

Molle Double Side Arm Mag Pouch -  NP774 BLK

Molle 4 x 8 Vertical Utility Pouch -  NP791 BLK

Molle Medical Pouch - NP793 BLK

Molle Handcuff Double Pouch - NP899 BLK

Molle Single Xpndbld Baton/Flashlight Po - NY010 BLK

Molle Tourniquet Pouch - TP585 BLK

Smith & Wesson Handcuffs - RS021

Velcro Under Belt - Style 1311U 

Buckle Under Belt - Style 1511U

Glock 17/22/31 Blue Gun Training Gun TN061

Bianchi Accumold Elite Magazine Pouch Style 7902

Level 2, Mid-Rise, STX, Tactical, Safariland 6280

Level 2, Mid-Rise, STX, Tactical, Safariland 6280, with light 
h

Bianchi Accumold Elite Belt Keepers (4-pack) Style 7906

Bianchi Accumold Elite Duty Belt Style 7950

Bianchi 7934 Open Top Handcuff Case 29.13$       

28.

29.

15106

15107

15108

15109

15110

15111

15112

15113

15114

15115

38.

37.

36.

35.

34.

33

32

31

30.

51.83$       

26.83$       

21.96$       

21.35$       

50.61$       

39.80$       

112.69$     

122.75$     

19.98$       

536.60$       

1,609.80$    

658.80$       

640.50$       

506.10$       

398.00$       

563.45$       

613.75$       

199.80$       

53.66$       

233.04$       

Total for Duty Gear: 63,249.00$  52,288.22$  

27.00$       

518.30$       

20. 15098

216.00$       

712.70$       

303.40$       

365.90$       

518.30$       

274.40$       

274.40$       

142.54$     

30.34$       

36.59$       

33.54$       

33.54$       

51.83$       

27.44$       

27.44$       

335.40$       

335.40$       

21. 15099

22. 15100

23. 15101

24.

8 NEW

25.

26.

27.

15102

15103

15104

15105

5

Vendor Galls, LLC G T Distributiors, Inc. 

400.00$       

135.00$     

10

60

30

400.00$       

720.00$       

680.00$       

360.00$       

360.00$       

600.00$       

33.00$       

56.00$       

330.00$       

560.00$       

550.00$       

10 39.00$       390.00$       

10

10

10

24.00$       

5

10

170.00$     850.00$       

40.00$       

40.00$       

68.00$       

36.00$       

36.00$       

60.00$       

24.00$       

22.00$       660.00$       

1,440.00$    

30

10

10

10

675.00$       

10 55.00$       

DUTY GEAR (cont'd)

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

10 54.00$       540.00$       

5 147.00$     735.00$       

10 15.50$       155.00$       



Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Lawson 
Number

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Bid Price   
per        

Each

Extended    
Total

Point Blank NIJ 06 Level II, Style Number BII-5 with 1-hilite Carrier

Point Blank NIJ 06 Level IIIA, Style number XPIIIA with 1-hilite Carrier

Point Blank HL6N00BV0M Hi Lite replacement carrier

Point Blank Duty ODC, 035MOOBVOJ

Point Blank Guardian GDC_00BOJ‐FBCSO MDNV CSTM, Carrier Vest

Repair Fee per Panel

Back Patch for Outer Vest Carrier, Style Number BF051 Sheriff Back 

Name Patch for Outer Vest Carrier, Style Number BF051 Name Patch

Point Blank Green Endeavor 03EMOOBVOJ

6.

7.

8.

9.

Total for Body Armor

NEW15

200

200

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

122,975.00$  -$  

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

300.00$     

245.00$     

100.00$     

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

3,000.00$    

12,250.00$  

1,000.00$    

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1,150.00$    

13,900.00$  

82,000.00$  

NO BID

NO BID

14936

14938

15879

14941

15880

3,675.00$    245.00$     

15.00$       3,000.00$    

15.00$       3,000.00$    

G T Distributiors, Inc. 

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 26-010

Term Contract for Law Enforcement Uniforms, Duty Gear and Body Armor

Term:  October 1, 2025 through September 30, 2026

Awarded:  lowest bidder per section

If bidding an "or equal to", type the manufacturer name and number in
cell below specification. Provide specifications labeled with below item
number for each item verifying equal to.

BODY ARMOR Vendor Galls, LLC

695.00$     

100 820.00$     

10 115.00$     

10

50

10

14928

14930

14932

20


