Fort Bend County

Term Contract for the Purchase of Culverts

Bid 07-042

1 April 2007
through

31 March 2008

* Amended 3/16/07

Award to all vendors meeting specifications
based on price and availability at time of order
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2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, galvanized, conforms to AASHTO M218, 12 ga.:
2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, galvanized, conforms to AASHTO M218, 14 ga.:

2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, galvanized, conforms to AASHTO M218, 16 ga.:

2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, polymer coated, conforms to AASHTO
M?245 and M246, 12 ga:

2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, polymer coated, conforms to AASHTO
M?245 and M246, 14 ga.:

2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, polymer coated, conforms to AASHTO
M?245 and M246, 16 ga.:

2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, aluminized, conforms to AASHTO
M36 and M274, 12 ga:

2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, aluminized, conforms to AASHTO
M36 and M274, 14 ga.:

2-2/3 inch by 2 inch corrugation full circle pipe, aluminized, conforms to AASHTO
M36 and M274, 16 ga.:

Metal flared end section with hardware to fit corrugated pipe, conforms to AASHTO M218:
T & G reinforced concrete pipe culverts THD #464:

Rubber gasketed reinforced concrete pipe THD #464:

Railroad tank culverts:

Corrugated polyethylene pipe:

Corrugated polyethylene coupling:
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Company

Act Pipe & Supply
Vendor #741872912

Contech Construction Products
Vendor #331177165

Gateway Pipe and Supply
Vendor #431589291

HD Supply
Vendor #030550887

Hanson Pipe & Products
Vendor #540179210

MDN Enterprises
Vendor #760474330

Wyatt Resources
Vendor #760437621

Index of Bidders

Contact Person

Rusty Bowman

Eric Kruppa

Matt Eversgerd

Richard Hardy

Terry Vinson

Don Flanery

Joseph Comer

il

Phone#

713-947-7132

281-893-6012

314-621-6094

713-378-0129

713-466-6306

281-354-9621

281-346-6100

Fax#

713-947-7451

281-893-6026

314-621-6019

713-378-3429

713-466-6897

281-354-9637

281-346-0080



2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Galvanizaed, Conforms to AASHTO M218, 12 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 13.99 21.74 20.66
24" 18.77 28.88 27.44
30" 23.95 36.10 34.30
36" 29.71 42.97 40.83
42" 34.84 50.08 47.58
48" 39.31 57.34 54.48
54" 47.46 65.02 61.77
60" 51.90 72.97 69.33
66" 63.83 80.33 76.32

2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Galvanizaed, Conforms to AASHTO M218, 14 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 10.27 15.53 14.76
24" 13.85 20.75 19.72
30" 17.81 26.07 24.77
36" 22.36 31.07 29.52
42" 26.35 36.16 34.36
48" 29.59 41.40 39.33
54" 36.54 47.18 44.83
60" N/A 53.13 50.48
66" N/A No Bid No Bid




2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Galvanizaed, Conforms to AASHTO M218, 16 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 8.49 12.62 11.99
24" 11.44 16.65 15.82
30" 14.87 21.02 19.97
36" 18.82 25.14 23.89
42" 22.28 29.22 27.76
48" 2493 33.57 31.88
54" N/A No Bid No Bid
60" N/A No Bid No Bid
66" N/A No Bid No Bid

2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Polymer Coated, Conforms to AASHTO M245 and M246, 12 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 21.58 29.89 28.40
24" 29.25 39.73 37.75
30" 35.65 49.74 47.26
36" 43.46 59.26 56.30
42" 50.53 69.01 65.56
48" 57.63 79.05 75.10
54" 64.73 89.49 85.04




2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Polymer Coated, Conforms to AASHTO M245 and M246, 14 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 16.15 21.80 20.71
24" 21.53 29.10 27.65
30" 2691 36.55 34.73
36" 32.25 43.60 41.42
42" 37.64 50.71 48.18
48" 43.02 58.08 55.18
54" 46.76 66.02 62.72

2-2/3" X 1/2"" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Polymer Coated, Conforms to AASHTO M245 and M246, 16 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 13.12 18.75 17.42
24" 17.21 24.26 23.05
30" 21.74 30.57 29.05
36" 26.27 36.56 34.74
42" 30.82 42.49 40.37
48" 34.40 48.77 46.34
54" N/A No Bid No Bid




2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Aluminized, Conforms to AASHTO M36 and M274, 12 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 18.84 28.21 26.80
24" 24.06 36.60 34.77
30" 36.34 45.42 43.15
36" 35.50 53.80 51.11
42" 41.31 62.94 59.80
48" 47.01 72.07 68.47
54" 52.74 80.94 76.90
60" 58.31 91.12 86.57
66" 64.32 101.35 96.29

2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Aluminized, Conforms to AASHTO M36 and M274, 14 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 13.81 21.16 20.11
24" 18.07 27.31 2593
30" 22.28 33.74 32.06
36" 26.72 39.87 37.88
42" 30.93 46.56 44.24
48" 35.26 53.30 50.64
54" 39.44 59.89 56.90
60" N/A 67.48 64.11
66" N/A 75.09 71.34




2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Aluminized, Conforms to AASHTO M36 and M274, 16 ga.

Price Per Foot

Description Contech MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources,
Construction Inc.
Comments Spiral Riveted Riveted
No Minimum Order | No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
18" 11.51 15.43 14.66
24" 15.03 20.40 19.38
30" 18.66 25.62 24.34
36" 22.23 32.73 31.10
42" 25.83 38.27 36.36
48" 29.38 43.77 41.59
54" N/A 49.27 46.81
60" N/A 55.86 52.86
66" N/A 61.96 58.87




Metal Flared End Section with Hardware to Fit Corrugated Pipe, AASHTO M218

Price Per Each
Description Contech Construction MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources, Inc.
Comments $500 Min. Order No Minimum Order No Minimum Order
12" 65.52 52.63 50.00
15" 84.24 66.31 63.00
18" 102.96 83.15 79.00
24" 154.44 120.00 114.00
30" 279.24 228.00 217.00
36" 455.52 302.10 287.00
42" 748.80 503.15 478.00
48" 936.00 624.21 593.00
54" 1162.20 735.78 699.00
60" 1513.20 853.68 811.00
66" 1794.00 1292.63 1228.00
72" 2059.20 1465.26 1392.00
78" 2496.00 1602.10 1522.00




T & G Reinforced Concrete Pipe Culverts THD #464

Price Per Foot

Description Hanson Pipe & Products MDN Enterprises
Comments >36,000 Ibs is freight allowed No minimum order
<36,000 Ibs, add $150 freight charge
18" 20.70 16.73
24" 26.95 21.80
30" 37.35 30.20
36" 56.55 45.73
42" 74.00 59.80
48" 88.50 71.60
54" 108.00 87.26
60" 132.15 106.80
66" 159.80 129.13
72" 187.25 151.34
78" 222.30 179.67
84" 253.70 205.03




*Amended 3/16/07
Rubber Gasketed Reinforced Concrete Pipe THD #464

Price Per Foot

Description Hanson Pipe & Products *MDN Enterprises
Comments >36,000 Ibs is freight allowed No minimum order
<36,000 Ibs, add $150 freight charge
18" 24.60 21.07
24" 31.35 26.82
30" 43.40 37.16
36" 65.80 56.32
42" 86.00 73.58
48" 103.00 88.16
54" 121.00 103.55
60" 152.35 130.37
66" 180.60 154.55
72" 213.75 182.89
78" 247.30 211.62
84" 279.15 238.87
Railroad Tank Culverts
Price Per Each
Size Gateway Pipe & Supply
St. Louis MO
6’ x 28 5500.00
6°6” x 32° 5900.00
737 x 28 5900.00
737 x 32 6600.00
8 x32 6500.00
86" x 32’ 6500.00
9°8” x 32 6700.00
9’ x40’ 7900.00




Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe

Price Per Foot - 20 foot sections

Description Act Pipe & Supply HD Supply MDN Enterprises Wyatt Resources
Comments Truckload No Minimum No Minimum No Minimum
Minimum
8" x 20' 2.58 2.39 2.39 3.67
10" x 20’ 3.68 342 3.41 4.68
12" x 20’ 3.98 3.73 3.69 5.06
15" x 20’ 5.36 5.02 4.97 6.80
18" x 20 7.52 7.05 6.98 9.13
24" x 20’ 11.78 11.04 10.93 14.96
30" x 20’ 18.94 17.70 17.57 24.05
36" x 20/ 23.20 21.75 21.53 30.64
42" x 20’ 32.31 30.29 29.98 41.04
48" x 20’ 38.74 36.29 35.95 49.20
60" x 20’ 70.44 65.36 65.36 89.50d




Corrugated Polyethylene Coupling

Price Per Each
Description Act Pipe & Supply HD Supply MDN Enterprises Morrison Supply
Comments Truckload No Minimum No Minimum $500 Minimum
Minimum Mar-Mac

8" x 20' 3.98 3.29 3.81 2.05

10" x 20' 5.38 4.53 4.44 4.59

12" x 20’ 6.07 5.12 5.02 6.00
15" x 20’ 10.11 8.52 8.35 7.33

18" x 20 17.22 14.51 14.21 11.06
24" x 20’ 24.29 20.45 20.04 17.50
30" x 20’ 56.47 47.56 46.58 40.00
36" x 20' 78.57 66.17 64.81 77.00
42" x 20/ 115.00 96.84 94.85 84.00
48" x 20’ 135.00 113.68 111.35 106.00
60" x 20’ 210.00 176.84 173.20 180.00
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