
Tabulation 

Food for Jail and Juvenile 

RFQ 2007-08 

Effective: 1 January 2007 through 31 March 2007 

 

Awarded to Brenham Wholesale, Labatt Food Service, and Performance Food Group 
   

Section 
Brenham 

Wholesale 
Labatt 

Food Service 

Performance 

Food Group 

Section I 
Frozen Meats  

$ 33,614.95 No Bid $34,513.47 

Section II 
Frozen Vegetables 

Disqualified 3,298.29 3,162.55 

Section III 
Frozen Breakfast 

1,304.92 No Bid 1,574.70 

Section IV 
Frozen Juice 

2,469.47 2,224.98 2,327.77 

Section V 
Drink Mix 

879.96 385.25 751.51 

Section VI 
Cereal  

5,037.35 No Bid 5,537.51 

Section VII 
Cookies/Crackers 

1,415.81 No Bid No Bid 

Section VIII 
Eggs/Margarine 

2,111.57 2,445.53 2,148.05 

Section IX 
Spices 

2,800.03 2,551.27 2,513.81 

Section X 
Condiments 

3,949.71 3,257.64 3,657.23 

Section XI 
Dry Items 

8,678.47 7,906.33 8,549.99 

Section XII 
Can 
Goods/Vegetables 

7,610.96 7,977.83 9,171.90 

Section XIII 
Can Goods/Fruits 

6,037.91 5,784.03 6,001.34 

Section XIV 
Can Goods/Others 

1,819.01 1,803.53 1,829.53 

Section XV 
Gravy Mix/Sauces 

61.08 58.90 54.50 

Section XVI 
Gelatin/Cake 
Mixes 

4,102.23 No Bid 3,821.78 

Section XVII 
Chips 

137.79 130.01 144.81 

Section XVIII 
Coffee 

247.28 No Bid No Bid 

Section XIX 
Misc. Items 

5,018.02 4,431.53 5,376.35 

Section XX 
Cooler Foods 

492.97 423.31 403.50 

 


