
* Amended 03/28/07 
 

Tabulation 

Food for Jail and Juvenile 

RFQ 2007-26 

Effective: 1 April 2007 through 30 June 2007 
 

Awarded to Brenham Wholesale, Labatt Food Service, and Performance Food Group 
   

Section 
Brenham 

Wholesale 
Labatt 

Food Service 

Performance 

Food Group 

*Section I 
Frozen Meats  

*$ 36,006.75 No Bid 
*Vendor 

Withdrew quote 

Section II 
Frozen Vegetables 

3,204.82 2,951.13 3,321.56 

Section III 
Frozen Breakfast 

1,300.09 No Bid No Bid 

Section IV 
Frozen Juice 

2,199.60 2,275.39 2,249.51 

Section V 
Drink Mix 

749.36 1,084.10 919.98 

Section VI 
Cereal  

5,204.64 No Bid 5,101.66 

Section VII 
Cookies/Crackers 

1,479.46 No Bid No Bid 

Section VIII 
Eggs/Margarine 

2,282.85 2,146.76 2,124.43 

Section IX 
Spices 

No Bid No Bid 2,334.36 

Section X 
Condiments 

No Bid 3,415.55 No Bid 

Section XI 
Dry Items 

No Bid 7,985.82 No Bid 

Section XII 
Can 
Goods/Vegetables 

7,878.54 7,624.15 
Disqualified: 

Did not quote all 
items of section 

Section XIII 
Can Goods/Fruits 

6,324.48 6,422.48 
Disqualified: 

Did not quote all 
items of section 

Section XIV 
Can Goods/Others 

1,812.90 1,813.13 No Bid 

Section XV 
Gravy Mix/Sauces 

53.76 57.80 51.84 

Section XVI 
Gelatin/Cake 
Mixes 

3,841.69 No Bid No Bid  

Section XVII 
Chips 

129.77 130.03 139.52 

Section XVIII 
Coffee 

267.70 No Bid 381.30 

Section XIX 
Misc. Items 

4,377.77 4,655.86 4,825.80 

Section XX 
Cooler Foods 

441.40 413.79 405.09 



 


