Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007

TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58

Company

Computer Paper:

Computer Paper:

Computer Paper:

Computer Paper:

Computer Paper

14 7/8 X 11 20# 14 7/8 X 11 20# 14 7/8 X 11 20# 14 7/8 X 11 20# 14 7/8 x 11 20#
15" Green Bar 1 15" Green Bar 1 15" Green Bar 1 15" Green Bar 1 15" Green Bar 1 Part
Part Part Part Part over 76 cases
01 to 10 cases 11 to 20 cases 21 to 50 cases 51 to 75 cases (price per thousand)
(price per (price per (price per (price per
thousand) thousand) thousand) thousand)
gg"l"“’a‘e Express $6.30 $ 6.30 $6.30 $ 6.30 $6.30
Matera Paper . . . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $10.478 $10.478 $10.478 $10.478 $10.478
g)m“ed'K“k Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium Foods $10.23 $10.23 $10.23 $10.23 $10.23
Structure Wise, Inc. $12.50 $12.22 $11.95 $11.69 $11.45




TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58

Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007
Company Computer Paper: Computer Paper: | Computer Paper: | Computer Paper:
912 x 11 20# 915 x 11 204# 915 x 11 204# 912 x 11 20#
White 1 Part White 1 Part White 1 Part White 1 Part
01 to 10 cases 11 to 20 cases 21 to 50 cases over 50 cases
(price per thousand) (price per (price per (price per thousand
thousand) thousand
ggrp"m‘e Express $ 4.40 $ 4.40 $ 4.40 $ 4.40
Matera Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Company LTD
Office Depot $6.83 $6.83 $6.83 $6.83
gi)mSted'K“k Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium Foods $6.78 $6.78 $6.78 $6.78
Structure Wise Inc. $7.88 $7.70 $7.63 $7.46

Company Computer Paper: | Computer Paper: Computer Paper:
9% x 11 2 Part 9% x 11 2 Part 9% x 11 2 Part
NCR-AIll White NCR-AIl White NCR-AIl White
01 to 05 cases 06 to 10 cases 11 to 15 cases
(price per (price per thousand) | (price per thousand)
thousand)
ggrp"m‘e Express $14.10 $14.10 $14.10
Matera Paper . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $19.95 $19.95 $19.95
oumsted-Rirk Paper No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Premium Foods $18.25 $18.25 $18.25
Structure Wise Inc. $20.12 $ 19.69 $19.27




TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58
Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007

Company Computer Paper: | Computer Paper: Computer Paper:
9% x 11 3 Part 97%x 11 3 Part 9% x 11 3 Part
NCR-AIl White NCR-AIl White NCR-AIl White
01 to 05 cases 06 to 10 cases 11 to 15 cases
(price per (price per thousand) | (price per thousand)
thousand)
Corporate Express US $31.20 $31.20 $31.20
Matera Paper . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $ 38.98 $ 38.98 $ 38.98
oumsted-Rirk Paper No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
Premium Foods $29.15 $29.15 $29.15
Structure Wise Inc. $32.76 $ 32.05 $31.38

Company Computer Paper: | Computer Paper: Computer Paper:
9% x 11 3 Part 9% x 11 3 Part 9% x 11 3 Part
NCR- NCR- NCR-
White/Canary/Pin | White/Canary/Pink | White/Canary/Pink
k 06 to 10 cases 11 to 15 cases
01 to 05 cases (price per thousand) | (price per thousand)
(price per
thousand)
Corporate Express US $44.20 $44.20 $44.20
Matera Paper . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $ 38.84 $ 38.84 $ 38.84
g)mswd‘K“k Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium Foods $ 35.15 $ 35.15 $ 35.15
Structure Wise Inc. $39.17 $38.33 $37.53




Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007

TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58

Company Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper:
8 2x 11 204# 82x 11 204# 8 2x 11 20# 8 2x 11 204# 8 2x 11 20#
White-5000 shts | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs
cs 11 to 20 cases 21 to 50 cases 51 to 75 cases over 76 cases
01 to 10 cases (price per case) (price per case) (price per case) (price per case)
(price per case)
Corporate Express US $29.50 $29.50 $29.50 $29.50 $29.50
Matera Paper . . . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $ 30.08 $ 30.08 $30.08 $30.08 $ 30.08
oumsted-Kirk Paper $29.70 $29.70 $29.70 $29.70 $29.70
Premium Foods $27.85 $27.85 $27.85 $27.85 $27.50
Structure Wise Inc. $31.83 $31.48 $31.15 $30.49 $30.18
Company Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper:
82x 14 20# 82x 14 20# 82x 14 20# 8 2x 14 204# 8 2x 14 204#
White-5000 shts | White-S000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs
cs 11 to 20 cases 21 to 50 cases 51 to 75 cases over 76 cases
01 to 10 cases (price per case) (price per case) (price per case) (price per case)
(price per case)
Corporate Express US $ 40.70 $ 40.70 $40.70 $ 40.70 $ 40.70
Matera Paper . . . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $ 40.99 $ 40.99 $40.99 $ 40.99 $ 40.99
g(l)mSted‘K“k Paper $ 40.70 $ 40.70 $ 40.70 $ 40.70 $ 40.70
Premium Foods $35.20 $35.20 $35.20 $35.20 $ 35.00
Structure Wise Inc. $43.17 $42.23 $41.77 $41.33 $40.47




Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007

TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58

Company

Copy Paper:

8 2x 11 204#
Green-5000 shts cs
01 to 10 cases
(price per case)

Copy Paper:

8 2x 11 20#
Green-5000 shts cs
11 to 20 cases
(price per case)

Copy Paper:

8 2x 11 20#
Green-5000 shts cs
21 to 50 cases
(price per case)

Copy Paper:

8 2x 11 204#
Green-5000 shts cs
51 to 75 cases
(price per case)

Copy Paper:

8 2x 11 20#
Green-5000 shts cs
over 76 cases
(price per case)

Corporate Express

US $ 31.80 $ 31.80 $31.80 $31.80 $31.80
Matera Paper . . . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
gf)mSted‘K“k Paper $37.20 $37.20 $37.20 $37.20 $37.20
Premium Foods $ 38.00 $ 38.00 $ 38.00 $ 38.00 $ 38.00
i‘;“““re Wise $ 32.40 $32.04 $ 31.70 $ 31.02 $30.37
Company Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper:
11x17 20# 11x17 20# 11x17 20# 11x17 20# 11x17 20#
White-2500 shts ¢cs | White-2500 shts cs | White-2500 shts cs | White-2500 shts cs | White-2500 shts cs
01 to 10 cases 11 to 20 cases 21 to 50 cases 51 to 75 cases over 76 cases

(price per case)

(price per case)

(price per case)

(price per case)

(price per case)

Corporate Express

Us $32.30 $32.30 $32.30 $32.30 $32.30
gjﬁ;ﬁfyg‘i‘% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $32.22 $32.22 $32.22 $32.22 $32.22
gi)r.nmd‘Kirk Paper $32.00 $32.00 $32.00 $32.00 $32.00
Premium Foods $29.50 $29.50 $29.50 $29.50 $29.25
Structure Wise Inc. $33.99 $33.24 $32.89 $32.19 $31.86




Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007

TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58

Company Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper: Copy Paper:
815 x 11 20# 815 x 11 20# 815 x 11 20# 815 x 11 20# 815 x 11 20#
Three-hole Three-hole Three-hole Three-hole Three-hole
White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs | White-5000 shts cs
01 to 10 cases 11 to 20 cases 21 to 50 cases 51 to 75 cases Over 76
(price per case) (price per case) (price per case) (price per case) (price per case)
Sgrp orate Express $32.90 $32.30 $32.30 $32.30 $32.30
Matera Paper . . . . .
Company LTD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Office Depot $36.08 $36.08 $36.08 $36.08 $36.08
g(l)mSted‘K“k Paper $32.00 $32.00 $32.00 $32.00 $32.00
Premium Foods $29.20 $29.20 $29.20 $29.20 $29.20
Structure Wise Inc. $33.99 $33.24 $32.89 $32.19 $31.86




TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58
Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007



TABULATION
Purchase of Computer Paper and Copy Paper - RFQ #2007-58
Effective: 1 July 2007 through 30 September 2007

Awarded to: Corporate Express # 741926921, Premium Foods # 742051756,

and Structure Wise # 043636579

Item #1 - Computer Paper 14 7/8 X 11, 20#, 12" Green bar, 1 Part.

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder Per Case

Comm Code

01 to over 76 cs $ 6.30/thousand sheets Corporate Express (2300/cs) $14.54
Item #2 - Computer Paper 9 2 X 11, 20#, White, 1 Part.

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder Per Case

644-00005

Comm Code

01 to over 50 cs $ 4.40/thousand sheets Corporate Express (2300/cs) $9.61
Item #3 - Computer Paper 9 /2 X 11, 2 Part NCR, All White.

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder Per Case

644-00010

Comm Code

01 to 15 cs. $14.10/thousand sheets Corporate Express (1800/cs) $25.29

Item #4 - Computer Paper 9 /2 X 11, 3 Part NCR, All White.

644-00015

Comm Code

644-00020

Comm Code

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder Per Case
01 to 15 cs. $29.15/thousand sheets Premium Foods (1200/cs)  $34.98
Item #5 - Computer Paper 9 2 X 11, 15#, 3 Part NCR, White/Canary/Pink.

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder Per Case
01 to 15 cs. $35.15/thousand sheets Premium Foods (1200/cs)  $42.18

Item #6 - Copy Paper 8 2 X 11, 20#, White.

Qty. Unit Bid Price
01 to75cs $27.85case
76¢s and over $27.50/case

Low Bidder
Premium Foods
Premium Foods

Item #7 - Copy Paper 8 2 x 14, 20#, White.

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder

01 to75cs $35.20/case Premium Foods
76¢s and over $35.00/case Premium Foods
Item #8 - Copy Paper 8 2 X 11, 20#, Green.

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder

01 to20cs $31.80/case Corporate Express
21 to 50 cs $31.70/case Structure Wise Inc.
51to 75 cs $31.02/case Structure Wise Inc.
76¢s and over $30.37/case Structure Wise Inc.
Item #9 - Copy Paper 11 x 17, 20#, White.

Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder

01 to75cs $29.50/case Premium Foods

76 cs and over $29.25/case Premium Foods

Item #10 - Copy Paper 8 2 X 11, 20#, White, three-hole punched.
Qty. Unit Bid Price Low Bidder
01 to75cs $29.20/case Premium Foods

644-00025

Comm Code

644-00030
644-00036

Comm Code
644-00035
644-00037

Comm Code

644-00040

Comm Code

644-00045
644-00039

Comm Code

644-00038



