Term Contract for Purchase of Tires and Tubes

Fort Bend County 08-013

October 1, 2007 through September 30, 2008

Award to low bidder per section

Section A to Z Tire Blake Southern Strouhal
Houston Phillips Tire Mart
Rosenberg Houston Hungerford
Section 1: $4,263.00 No Bid $4,230.02 No Bid
Tubes
Section 2: | Disqualified No Bid | $10,000.00 No Bid
Michelin
Section 3: | Disqualified No Bid $6,425.00 No Bid
Bridgestone
Section 4: | $16,844.00 No Bid | $17,740.00 No Bid
Continental/General
Section 5: | Disqualified | $81,917.00 No Bid No Bid
Goodyear
Section 6: | Disqualified No Bid | $63,753.00 | $64,650.34
Michelin
Section 7: | Disqualified No Bid | $15,280.00 | $16,331.50
B F Goodrich
Section 8: | Disqualified No Bid | $21,536.00 | $23,979.80
Uniroyal
Section 9: | Disqualified No Bid | $26,296.70 No Bid
Bridgestone/Firestone
Section 10: | Disqualified | $98,886.08 No Bid No Bid
Goodyear
Section 11: | $22,195.00 No Bid | $19,653.90 No Bid
Generic
Section 12: | Disqualified No Bid $828.00 $828.00
Michelin
Section 13: | Disqualified No Bid No Bid $678.52
B F Goodrich
Section 14: | Disqualified No Bid $2,688.00 No Bid
Bridgestone/Firestone
Section 15: $6,208.00 No Bid $5,492.00 No Bid
Continental/General
Section 16: | Disqualified No Bid | $77,295.00 $76,697.28
Michelin
Section 17: | Disqualified No Bid No Bid $2,646.20
B F Goodrich
Section 18: | Disqualified No Bid | $18,836.80 No Bid
Bridgestone/Firestone
Section 19: | $19,380.00 No Bid | $16,548.00 No Bid
Continental/General
Section 20: | Disqualified | $92,450.74 No Bid No Bid
Goodyear
Section 21: | $24,649.00 No Bid | $26,798.00 No Bid
Generic
Section 22: | Disqualified No Bid | $23,806.00 | $26,558.00
Michelin
Section 23: | Disqualified No Bid | $32,884.00 No Bid
B F Goodrich
Section 24: | Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bridgestone/Firestone




Section A to Z Tire Blake Southern Strouhal
Houston Phillips Tire Mart

Rosenberg Houston Hungerford

Section 25: | Disqualified No Bid | $36,729.00 No Bid
Goodyear

Section 26: | Disqualified No Bid | $13,730.00 No Bid
Titan

Section 27: | $24,670.00 NoBid | $25,623.20 No Bid
Generic

Section 28: | Disqualified No Bid | $176,760.00 | $183,521.90
Michelin

Section 29: | Disqualified No Bid | $26,322.00 No Bid
Bridgestone/Firestone

Section 30: | Disqualified No Bid | $57,838.96 No Bid
Bridgestone/Firestone

Section 31: | Disqualified | $29,280.00 No Bid No Bid
Goodyear

Section 32: | $62,100.00 No Bid | $78,196.00 No Bid
Generic

Section 33: | $13,300.00 No Bid | $12,670.00 No Bid
Galaxy

Section 34: No Bid | $49,900.00 No Bid No Bid
Goodyear

Disqualified: Did not bid on all items in section as required or altered specifications.

Company Contact Person Phone Number Fax Number
A to Z Tires Philip Nussbaum 806-373-2592 x 114 806-373-6504
Blake Phillips IrwinRabinowitz 281-342-5446 281-342-9454
Southern Tire Mart Bobby Harms 877-786-4681 214-389-7111
Strouhal Tire Centers | Emil Zahradnik 979-532-1579 979-532-2101




SECTION 1: TUBES
DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

7.50R16 Tube with TR15 stem

7.50R16 Tube with TR150 stem

7.50-18 Tube with TR15 stem

9.00R20 Tubes with TR443 stem

10.00R20 Tubes with TR444 stem

14.00R24 Tubes with TR220A stem
11L-15/16 Tubes with TR15CW stem

18.4-30 Tubes with TR218A stem

12.4-24 Tubes with TR218A stem

18.4R38 Tubes with TR218A stem

KR 14/15 Tubes with TR13 stem

20.5R25 Tubes with SP1000 stem

13.00R24 Tubes with TR220A stem

13.6X24 Tubes cupples TR218A

14.9R24 Tubes with TR218A stem

10.00X16 Tubes with TR15CW stem
11.00X16 Tubes with TR1SCW stem

12X16.5 Tubes with TRISCW stem

7.50R15 Brass stem tubes roller tube with TR440
23.1X26 Tubes cupples TR218A
16.9/18.4X34 Tubes cupples TR218A
480/400X8 Tubes cupples TR87

600/690X9 Brass stem tubes cupples TR440
8.25R15 Brass stem tubes  cupples TR444
7.00X12 Brass stem tubes  cupples TR440
FR 13/14 tube

11.25 - 24 tubes

16 tubes TR13

13 x 500-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire
23 x 1050-12 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire
18 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire

16 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire

$7.93
$7.42
$7.96
$11.40
$11.90
$27.75
$8.30
$27.00
$16.44
$39.00
$5.35
$46.60
$27.75
$22.80
$26.80
$9.87
$11.18
$11.67
$9.21
$44.60
$34.00
$5.58
$5.83
$9.34
$7.82
$3.66
$20.00
$7.16
$3.05
$6.16
$3.50
$3.50



SECTION 2: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY VENDOR:
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
P225/60R 16 Pursuit V-rated $86.00
P235/55/R17 Pursuit V-rated $114.00
SECTION 3: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY  VENDOR:
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
P225/60R16 PV41 Pursuit v-rated 340AA $64.25
SECTION 4: CONTINENTAL/GENERAL BRAND ONLY VENDOR:
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
P225/60R16 XP-2000 Pursuit v-rated $81.44
P225/60R 18 Continental Pro Contact $87.00
SECTION 5: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY VENDOR:
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
P225/60R 16 Pursuit v-rated $74.47
SECTION 6: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY VENDOR:
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
P205/75R15 LTX M/S ORWL $74.00
P225/75R15 LTX M/S ORWL $82.00
LT235/75R15 LTX M/S 6 ply $89.00
LT235/75R15 LTX A/T 6 ply $95.00
LT235/85R16 LTX A/S 10 ply $130.00
LT235/85R16 LTX A/T 10 ply $140.00
LT235/85R16 LTX M/S 10 ply $131.00
LT235/85R16 XPS Rib 10 ply $160.00
LT235/85R16 XPS Traction 10 ply $173.00
P245/75R16 LTX M/S ORWL $106.00
LT245/75R16 LTX A/S 10 ply $123.30
LT245/75R16 LTX A/T 10 ply $134.00
LT245/75R16 LTX M/S 10 ply $125.00
P255/70R16 LTX M/S $102.00
LT265/75R16 LTX M/S 10 ply $147.00

LT265/75R16 LTX A/S 10 ply $131.00

SOUTHERN TIRE MART

SOUTHERN TIRE MART

ATOZTIRE

BLAKE PHILLIPS

SOUTHERN TIRE MART



SECTION 6: (CONT’D)
DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

P235/75R16 LTX M/S ORWL
LT235/75R16 LTX M/S 10 ply
9.50R16.5 XPS Rib 10 ply
LT225/70R19.5 10 ply
LT275/65R18 10 ply
LT245/75R17 10 ply
P235/75R16 10 ply
P245/75R16 10 ply
P205/75R14 10 ply
LT275/65R18 All-terrain

SECTION 7: BF GOODRICH BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

$108.00
$131.00
$169.00
$205.00
$174.00
$106.00
$108.00
$125.00
$55.00

$175.00

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

LT245/75R17 Rugged Trail T/A 10 ply
L T245/75R16 Commercial T/A 10 ply
LT275/65R18 ATS

SECTION 8: UNIROYAL BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

$101.00
$85.00
$114.00

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

LT235/75R15 HDT 6 ply
LT235/75R15 AWP B/W 6 ply
LT235/85R16 AWP 10 ply
LT235/85R16 HDT 10 ply
LT245/75R16 AWP 10 ply
LT245/75R16 HDT 10 ply
LT245/75R16 ADT 10 ply
P255/70R16 AWP
LT265/75R16 AWP 10 ply

$88.00
$74.00
$84.00
$97.00
$82.00
$101.00
$96.00
$73.00
$88.00



SECTION 9: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
L'T235/75R15 Transforce HT 6 ply $72.70
L'T235/75R 15 Destination MT 6 ply $86.35
L'T225/75R16 Transforce HT $78.20
L.T245/75R 16 Transforce HT 10 ply $69.10
L.T245/75R 16 Destination MT 10 ply $95.55
LT245/75R17/121/118R M &S $87.35
L'T235/85R 16 Transforce HT 10 ply $71.40
LT215/85R16 Transforce HT $80.55
7.50X16 Trans Rib $75.00
7.50R16 Bridgestone VSX 14 ply $125.00
LT235/85R 16 Destination MT $95.20
L'T235/85R16 Steeltex A/T $80.20
P255/70R16 A/T Destination AT $78.45
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply $82.40
L'T235/75R 16 Transforce HT 10 ply $76.50
LT215/75R16 Transforce HT $80.55
LT235/75R16 Destination MT $95.20
LT275/65R18 ATS $90.80
SECTION 10: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY VENDOR: BLAKE PHILLIPS
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
P215/65R16 Eagle LS $70.88
P255/65R16 Eagle LS $101.72
LT235/75R15 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply $109.00
P235/75R15 Wrangler RT/S XL $75.30
P255/70R15 Eagle GT II $69.95
P235/75R16 Wrangler ST BW $81.95
L.T235/85R16 Wrangler HT 10 ply $101.00
LT235/85R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply $129.00
L'T245/75R16 Wrangler HT load range E $110.90
L.T245/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply $142.00

L.T245/75R16 Wrangler AT/S 10 ply $111.00



SECTION 10: (CONT’D)
DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: BLAKE PHILLIPS
UNIT PRICE

P245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S
LT245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 10 ply
LT265/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 10 ply
LT265/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 8 ply
P255/70R16 Wrangler RT/S
LT245/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply
P265/70R17 Wrangler RT/S
P265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S
LT265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S 6 ply
LT265/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply
7.50 x 16 Workhorse Rib 8 ply

7.00 x 15 Workhorse

SECTION 11: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE
DESCRIPTION

$81.78
$96.50
$107.00
$144.76
$77.65
$150.60
$96.60
$119.75
$129.00
$170.00
$95.54
$40.13

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

LT235/75R15 Transforce HT 6 ply
L'T235/75R 15 Destination MT 6 ply
LT225/75R16 Transforce HT
LT245/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply
L T245/75R16 Destination MT 10 ply
LT245/75R17/121/118R M &S
L'T235/85R 16 Transforce HT 10 ply
LT215/85R16 Transforce HT
7.50X16 Trans Rib

7.50R16 Bridgestone VSX 14 ply
LT235/85R16 Destination MT
LT235/85R16 Steeltex A/T
P255/70R16 A/T Destination AT
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply

$72.70
$86.35
$78.20
$69.10
$95.55
$87.35
$71.40
$80.55
$75.00
$125.00
$95.20
$75.00
$78.45
$82.40



SECTION 12: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

225/70R19.5 XRV 14 Ply $207.00

SECTION 13: BF GOODRICH BRAND ONLY VENDOR: STROUHAL TIRE
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

225/70R19.5 ST230 14 Ply $169.63

SECTION 14: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
225/70R19.5 M724F 12 ply $168.00
225/70R19.5 M729F 12 ply $168.00
SECTION 15: CONTINENTAL/GENERAL BRAND ONLY VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
225/70R19.5 LMT 460 12 ply $197.00
225/70R19.5 LMT 450 12 ply $192.00
225/70R19.5 LMT 400 12 ply $197.00
225/70R19.5 HDR 14 ply $199.00
SECTION 16: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY VENDOR: STROUHAL TIRE
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
8.25-20 XZY $165.00
9.00R20 XZA $198.00
10.00R20 XZA 16 ply $225.00
11R22.5 XZE 14 ply $250.00
11R22.5 XDE All terrain $322.00
11R22.5 XDE AT $322.00
11R22.5 MI XZY 16 ply $327.75
11R22.5 MI XZE 16 ply $289.00
11R22.5 XDE MS 16 ply $310.50
12R22.5 XZE $315.00
255/70R22.5 XZE $260.00
385/65R22.5 x 24 18 ply $465.75

315/80 R22.5 XZA $445.63



SECTION 17: BF GOODRICH BRAND ONLY VENDOR: STROUHAL TIRE
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

11R22.5 DR675 16 ply $264.62

SECTION 18: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
9.00-20 Transport 1 12 ply $132.00
9.00-20 S A Traction ND 12 ply $132.00
9.00R20 T546 14 ply $204.40
10.00-20 Transport 1 14 ply $146.00
10.00X20 S A Traction ND 14 ply $146.00
10.00R20 T559 14 ply $225.20
10.00R20 T819 16 ply $225.20
10.00R20 T831 16 ply $240.80
10.00R20 T546 16 ply $235.60
10R22.5 T559 12 ply $178.40
10R22.5 FD663 12 ply $199.20
11R22.5 T559 16 ply $204.40
11R22.5 T831 16 ply $235.60
11R22.5 T819 16 ply $214.80
12R22.5 T831 16 ply $272.00
SECTION 19: CONTINENTAL/GENERAL BRAND ONLY VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
11R22.5 HDO 16 ply $288.00
11R22.5 HDC 16 ply $295.00
11R22.5 HSR 16 ply $281.00
11R22.5 HSL 16 ply $304.00

11R22.5 HTL 14 ply $211.00



SECTION 20: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: BLAKE PHILLIPS
UNIT PRICE

9.00R20 G149 RSA 12 ply
9.00R20 G124 12 ply
10.00R20 G149 RSA 14 ply
10.00R20 G287 MSA 16 ply
11R22.5 G287 MSA 16 ply
11R22.5 G288 MSA 16 ply
11R22.5 G177 16 ply
11R22.5 G395 LHS 14 ply
11R22.5 G395 LHS 16 ply
11R22.5 G314 12 ply
12R22.5 G149 MSA 16 ply
315/80R22.5 G291 18 ply
385/65R22.5 G178SS 18 ply

SECTION 21: OUT OF NATIONAL CATALOG
DESCRIPTION

$239.00
$323.80
$267.00
$261.24
$289.04
$371.33
$302.12
$301.20
$328.30
$299.35
$403.93
$354.90
$420.00

VENDOR: ATO Z TIRE
UNIT PRICE

9.00-20 Transport 1 12 ply
9.00-20 S A Traction ND 12 ply
9.00R20 T559 12 ply

9.00R20 T546 14 ply

10.00-20 Transport 1 14 ply
10.00-20 S A Traction ND 14 ply
10.00R20 T559 14 ply
10.00R20 T819 16 ply
10.00R20 T831 16 ply
10.00R20 T546 16 ply

10R22.5 T559 12 ply

10R22.5 FD663 12 ply

11R22.5 T559 16 ply

11R22.5 T831 16 ply

11R22.5 T819 16 ply

12R22.5 T831 16 ply

$100.00
$105.00
$176.00
$287.00
$122.00
$125.00
$188.00
$188.00
$209.00
$209.00
$195.00
$225.00
$175.00
$197.00
$175.00
$305.00



SECTION 22: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY

DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply

12.4-24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply
13.6R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply
14.9R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply
18.4R30 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply
16.9R34 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply
18.4R38 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply
380/85R24 Power Radial 80

SECTION 23: BF GOODRICH BRAND ONLY

DESCRIPTION

$81.00

$104.65
$128.60
$114.50
$406.00
$510.00
$585.00
$899.00
$801.00
$919.00
$478.00

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 § ply
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply

12.4-24 Power Gripper TL 8 ply
13.6R24 Power Radial 80

14.9-24 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply
380/85R24 Power Radial 80

18.4-30 Power Gripper TL 8 ply
16.9-34 R-1Power Gripper TL 8 ply
16.9R34 Power Radial 80

18.4-34 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply
18.4R34 Power Radial 80

18.4-38 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply
18.4R38 Power Radial 80

$81.00

$104.65
$128.60
$114.50
$214.00
$408.00
$279.00
$490.00
$440.00
$420.00
$661.00
$491.00
$709.00
$534.00
$728.00

SECTION 24: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

No Bids Received



SECTION 25: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

7.50-16 Triple Rib HD TT 6 ply
11L-15 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply
10.00-16 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply
11.00-16 Triple Rib HD 8 ply TT
12.4-24 R1 Dura Torque TL 8 ply
13.6-24 R1 Dyna Torque II TT 8 ply
14.9R24 R-1W Super Traction Radial
18.4-30 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply

18.4-30 R-2 Special Sure Grip TD8 10 ply TL

16.9-34 R1 Dyna Torque II TT 8 ply
18.4-34 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply
18.4R38 R-1 Dyna Torque TL

SECTION 26: TITAN BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

$74.50

$114.50
$109.00
$140.00
$287.00
$334.00
$551.00
$470.00
$673.00
$400.00
$412.00
$672.00

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

11L-15SL Tru Trac Triple Rib TT F-2 8 ply
10.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply
11.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply
12.4-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply

18.4-30 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply
13.6R24-128A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1
14.9R24-120A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1

SECTION 27: NATIONAL AND FIRESTONE
DESCRIPTION

$115.00
$120.00
$138.00
$270.00
$384.00
$330.00
$364.00

VENDOR: ATO Z TIRE
UNIT PRICE

7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply
12.4-24 Super All Traction 23° 8 ply
18.4-30 Traction F & R 8 ply

340/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8 ply
380/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8§ ply

$62.00

$100.00
$114.00
$116.00
$156.50
$335.00
$550.00
$550.00



SECTION 27: (CONT’D)
DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: ATO Z TIRE
UNIT PRICE

18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 6 ply
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 10 ply
16.9-34 Traction Field & Road 8 ply
18.4-34 Traction Field & Road 8 ply
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 ply

SECTION 28: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

$335.00
$900.00
$330.00
$350.00
$650.00

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART

UNIT PRICE

29.5R25 MI XHA 1 star
1400R24 XGL

17.5R25 XTLA
20.5R25 XTLA
1300R24 XGLA
29.5R25 MI XHA 1 Star
750R15 MI XLC
23.5R25 XHA 1 STXL
23.1-26 10 ply tubeless
14/70-20 20 ply

SECTION 29: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY

DESCRIPTION

$5180.00
$840.00
$1060.00
$1648.00
$755.00
$5180.00
$300.00
$2982.00
$898.00
$905.00

UNIT PRICE

7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply
6.00X9Industrial 10 ply
8.25X15 Industrial 12 ply
7.00X12 Industrial 10 ply
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply
4.10/3.50-4

8-14.5 Towmaster Super Hwy
12X16.5 Super traction
14/70-20 20 ply roller tire
15.5X25 SGGLO

17.5X25 GGG E2/L-2

$125.00
$44.50
$128.00
$80.00
$12.10
$8.90
$63.00
$111.00
$905.00
$525.00
$565.00

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART



SECTION 29: (CONT’D) VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
13.00X24 G-2 $365.00
13.00R24 Bridgestone VUT $920.00

SECTION 30: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
14.00X24 G-2 $415.00
14.00R24 Bridgestone VUT $995.00
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 $965.00
23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 $1290.00
29.5R25 E-3 22 ply $5142.00
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply $125.00
6.00X9 industrial 10 ply $44.50
8.25X15 industrial 12 ply $128.00
7.00X12 industrial 10 ply $80.00
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply $12.10

13 x 500-8 NHS Turf $15.00

23 x 1050-12 NHS Turf $44.00

18 x 750-8 Turf $25.50

7.50 R/0 Westlake CR859 LR G $98.00
13x650 6 turb $17.07
13x500 6 turb $15.50
SECTION 31: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY VENDOR: BLAKE PHILLIPS
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
15.5X25 Rock lug 12 ply TL $658.00
17.5X25 Rock lug 16 ply Tl $686.00
13.00X24 grader 12 ply TL SG6-2A $337.00
13.00R24 GS2BG2 $781.00
14.00X24 Grader 12 ply TL SGG-2A $378.00
20.5R25 1 GP2B6STL $1657.00

14.00R24 GS2BG2TL $775.00



SECTION 32: PRIMARILY NATIONAL

VENDOR: ATO Z TIRE

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply $80.00
6.00X9Industrial 10 ply $40.00
8.25X15 Industrial 12 ply $100.00
7.00X12 Industrial 10 ply $60.00
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply $5.00
410/350-4 $5.00
8-14.5 Towmaster Super Hwy $46.00
12X16.5 Super traction $87.00
14/70-20 20 ply roller tire $950.00
15.5X25 SGGLO $310.00
17.5X25 GGG E2/L-2 $410.00
13.00X24 G-2 $217.00
13.00R24 Bridgestone VUT $1000.00
14.00X24 G-2 $260.00
14.00R24 Bridgestone VUT $550.00
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L.-2 $525.00
23.5X25 SGG E-2/L.-2 $775.00
29.5R25 E-3 22 ply $3850.00
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply $80.00
6.00X9 industrial 10 ply $40.00
8.25X15 industrial 12 ply $100.00
7.00X12 industrial 10 ply $60.00
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply $5.00

13 x 500-8 NHS Turf $9.00

23 x 1050-12 NHS Turf $40.00
18 x 750-8 Turf $21.00

7.50 R/0 Westlake CR859 LR G

$95.00



SECTION 33: GALAXY BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

VENDOR: SOUTHERN TIRE MART
UNIT PRICE

14/70 =20 20 ply NHS for roller
14/70 =20 20 ply NHS for roller, blem

SECTION 34: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY
DESCRIPTION

$905.00
$905.00

VENDOR: BLAKE PHILLIPS
UNIT PRICE

P235/55R17 Eagle RSA Pursuit

$99.80



