
Tabulation 

 

Term contract for Photographic Supplies 

 

Fort Bend County 

Bid 08-015 

 

Company B & H  
Photo Video 

New York  NY 

Cameras 
Unlimited 
Rosenberg 

H P I 
International 

Brooklyn  NY 

Southpoint  
Photo Supply 

Farmers Branch  

Fujicolor Superia 

Plus, 100 ASA - 24 

No Bid No Bid $2.10 
No  minimum 

$1.59 
100 rl minimum 

Fujicolor Superia 

Plus, 400 ASA - 12  

$2.95 
No minimum 

No Bid $2.63 
No  minimum 

$1.79 
100 rl minimum 

Fujicolor Superia 

Plus, 400 ASA - 24 

$2.15 
No minimum 

No Bid $3.30 
No  minimum 

$2.55 
100 rl minimum 

Polaroid Type-52  

Black and white 

$615.50 
No minimum 

$695.00 
1 case min. 

$632.60 
No  minimum 

$659.00 
1 case minimum 

Color print paper: 

Fujicolor Crystal 

Archive, medium 

contrast, glossy, 8x10 

100 sheets/box  

No Bid No Bid $25.05 
No  minimum 

$33.25 
5 case minimum 

Color print paper: 

Fujicolor Crystal 

Archive, medium 

contrast, glossy, 

11x14 100 sheets/box  

No Bid No Bid $25.05 
No  minimum 

$68.50 
1 case minimum 

Color print paper: 

Fujicolor Crystal 

Archive, medium 

contrast, matte 

100 sheets/box  

No Bid No Bid $51.04 
16.20 

No  minimum 

$68.50 
1 case minimum 

Negative print files: 

for 35MM negatives, 

sleeves, #35-7B, 

1000/case 

$89.90 
No minimum 

$179.90 
1 case min. 

$166.50 
No  minimum 

$149.00 
10 box minimum 

Besler dust gun 100 

or equal canned 

air:12 cans/case 

No Bid $5.99 
1 case min. 

AVW Brand 

$7.45 
No  minimum 
Falcon Brand 

$5.99 
1 case minimum 

Fuji Hunt Developer 

Replenisher 

Cartridge 

CN-16S NC1 

No Bid No Bid $80.40 
No  minimum 

$56.10 
3 case minimum 

Fuji Hunt Fixer and 

Replenisher 

Cartridge CN-16S 

NC2 

 

 

 

No Bid No Bid $40.07  
No  minimum 

$33.26 
3 case minimum 



Company B & H  
Photo Video 

New York  NY 

Cameras 
Unlimited 
Rosenberg 

H P I 
International 

Brooklyn  NY 

Southpoint  
Photo Supply 

Farmers Branch 

Fuji Hunt Start Up 

CN-162 N1 

No Bid No Bid $97.26 
No minimum 

$78.16 
2 case minimum 

Fuji Hunt ECI RA 

Pro Developer 

Replenisher 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.46 
8 case minimum 

Digital RA 

Fuji Hunt P2R 

Colorprint bleach fix 

and replenisher 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.16 
5 case minimum 

Fuji Hunt Start Up 

CN-16S N2 

No Bid No Bid $74.21 
No minimum 

$59.63 
2 case minimum 

Fuji Hunt Start Up 

CN-16S N3 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.31 
2 case minimum 

Fuji Hunt Start Up 

CN-16S N4 

No Bid No Bid $29.63 
No minimum 

$23.81 
2 case minimum 

Kodak roller 

transport cleanup 

sheets #4955, 50 shts 

per box, 11 x 14 

$119.90 
No minimum 

$123.00 
5 boxes 

$124.23 
No  minimum 

$122.00 
1 case minimum 

Glacial acetic acid or 

equal, 1 gallon 

No Bid No Bid $21.54 
No  minimum 

$23.09 
5 case minimum 

 
RECAPITULATION OF BID 

 
 Commissioners Court approval:    June 26th        
 Legal Notice run in newspaper:    July 18th and 25th     
 Individual notices mailed:     30 
 Bid packets picked up or mailed:    3 
 Bid opening date:      August 2nd     
 Bids received:       4 

 

Recommendation: Award to all bidders meeting specifications based on price and  

order requirements at time of order 
 


