Recommendation: Section 2 to Aves Audio and
Sections 1 & 3 to Troxell Communication

Tabulation
BID #08-069
Audio Visual Equipment

Funding: Library Section 1: 100650999 G650-0S8LONESTAR 22100 & 22300;
Section 2: 100650100 64000; Section 3: 100650100 64500

Section 1: George
Memorial Library

Aves Audio Visual
Sugar Land

CCS Presentation
Systems
Houston

Troxell
Communications
Sugar Land

Mount, universal
projector for false CEI,
Premier
PM1PDSFCAM
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$205.00
Substitute

$178.06

TEK VOX 1301
presentation switcher
scaler, TVX71020
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$1889.00
Subtitute

$848.36

TOA Mixer amplifier,
9 channel, 240W,
TOAA724

Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$549.00

$417.87

JBL speaker, 4"
ceiling 2 way, 80 watt,
w/tran
JBLCONTROL24CT

No Bid

$90.00 = $360.00

$91.47 = $365.88

Sony DVD/VCR
combo recorder
SONRDRVXS555
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$209.00

$299.56

Cable VGA 15 pin HD
M/M w/stereo
miniplug 25', Kramer,
DRACGMAGMAZ25
Quantity: 2 each

No Bid

$35.00 = $70.00

$23.71 = $47.42

XGA over CAT 5
transmitter, Kramer,
KRATP123
Quantity: 2 each

No Bid

$245.00 = $490.00

$212.20 = $424.40

XGA over CAT 5
receiver, Kramer,
KRATP124
Quantity: 2 each

No Bid

$245.00 = $490.00

$212.20 = $424.40




Section 1: George
Memorial Library
(continued)

Aves Audio Visual
Sugar Land

CCS Presentation
Systems
Houston

Troxell
Communications
Sugar Land

Power supply 12VDC
on CAT 5 cables,
Kramer KRAPTI1PS
Quantity: 2 each

No Bid

$99.00 = $198.00

$87.53 =$175.06

Projector XGA LCD
6500 lumens, Sanyo,
SANPLCXP100L
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$5,580.00

$4,892.01

Lens mot standard ZM
F/PLC-XP30/40/50/
PLV SRS, Sanyo,
SANLNSW31A
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$2,015.00

$1,762.89

Lamp for PLC-
XP100L, Sanyo,
SAN610334278B
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$379.00

$320.00

Network organizer,
network interface fo
projector PINET
organizer Plus II,
Sanyo,
SANPOAPNO3C
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$499.00

No Charge

Front antenna bracket
kit, Shure,
SHUUA440
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$94.00

$83.20

DGPCABLE-
necessary to complete
installation

No Bid

$629.00

$294.74

Installation of above

No Bid

$2,499.00

$1,139.90

Total for Section 1:

No Bid

$16,155.00

$11,848.81

Section 2: George
Memorial Library

Aves Audio Visual
Sugar Land

CCS Presentation
Systems
Houston

Troxell
Communications
Sugar Land

Cable VGA 15 pin HD
M/M w/stereo
miniplug 25', Kramer,
DRACGMAGMAZ25
Quantity: 2 each

$33.00 = $66.00

$35.00 = $70.00

$24.21 = $48.42




Section 2: George Aves Audio Visual CCS Presentation Troxell
Memorial Library Sugar Land Systems Communications
(continued) Houston Sugar Land
DVD/VCR combo, $87.00 = $174.00 $95.00 = $190.00 $89.97 = $179.94

Sony, SONSLVD380P
Quantity: 2 each

Wall plate 2VGA,
w/audio, Liberty,
LWCPCGI1140EPC
Quantity: 3 each

$44.00 = $132.00

$53.75 =$161.25

$36.99 =$110.97

PA system package,
Califone CALPA300P
Quantity: 1 each

$229.00

$139.00

$222.49

Package wireless
presentation pro
PA300 UHF Califone
CLPA300UHFPQ
Quantity: 1 each

$360.00

$399.00

$364.47

Wireless presenter
with laser pointer,
Kensington,
KEN33374
Quanity: 5 each

$49.00 = $245.00

$59.00 = $295.00

$48.65 = $243.25

Microphone Cond
Omni Lavalier, Shure,
SHUWL183
Quantity: 2 each

$66.00 = $132.00

$88.00 = $176.00

$79.64 = $159.28

Professional cardioid
Lavalier Mic, Shure,
SHUWL185
Quantity: 3 each

$76.00 = $228.00

$102.00 = $306.00

$84.95 = $254.85

Replacement filter

$56.00 = $168.00

$59.00 = $177.00

$56.60 = $169.80

cartridge for PLC-

XP100L, Sanyo,

SNPOAFIL131

Quantity: 3 each

Total for Section 2: $1,734.00 $1,913.25 $1,753.47
Aves Audio Visual CCS Presentation Troxell

Section 3: Fulshear Sugar Land Systems Communications

Branch Library Houston Sugar Land

Lamp for PLC- No Bid $379.00 $326.09

XP100L, Sanyo,

SAN6103342788

Quantity: 1 each




Section 3: Fulshear
Branch Library
(continued)

Aves Audio Visual
Sugar Land

CCS Presentation
Systems
Houston

Troxell
Communications
Sugar Land

Mic system dual CH
wireless UHF w/SM58
Shure,
SHUULXP24D58
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$1,850.00

$1,276.89

Mic system dual CH
wireless UHF w/SM58
Shure,
SHUULXP24D58
Quantity: 2 each

No Bid

$1850.00 = $3700.00

$1276.89 = $2553.78

Professional cardioid
Lavalier Mic, Shure,
SHUWL185
Quantity: 3 each

No Bid

$102.00 = $306.00

$90.15 = $270.45

Front antenna bracket
kit, Shure,
SHUUA440
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$94.00

$83.20

Wireless presenter
with laser pointer,
Kensington,
KEN33374
Quanity: 1 each

No Bid

$59.00

$49.67

AKG Boom
microphone stand,
AKG,
AKGKM254BLLACK
Quantity: 2 each

No Bid

$40.00 = $80.00

$33.46 = $66.92

Projector XGA LCD
6500 lumens, Sanyo,
SANPLCXP100L
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$5,580.00

$4,892.01

Lens mot standard ZM
F/PLC-XP30/40/50/
PLV SRS, Sanyo,
SANLNSW31A
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$2,015.00

$1,762.89

Mount, universal
projector for false CEI,
Premier
PM1PDSFCAM
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$205.00
Substitute

$178.06




Section 3: Fulshear
Branch Library
(continued)

Aves Audio Visual
Sugar Land

CCS Presentation
Systems
Houston

Troxell
Communications
Sugar Land

TOA Mixer amplifier,
9 channel, 240W,
TOAA724

Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$549.00

$147.87

JBL speaker, 4"
ceiling 2 way, 80 watt,
w/tran
JBLCONTROL24CT
Quantity: 6 each

No Bid

$90.00 = $540.00

$91.47 = $548.82

Sony DVD/VCR
combo

SONSLVD380P
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$95.00

$91.86

CD player single CD,
Rack mount table,
Marantz, MAR
DNNDNC615
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$369.00

$236.08

Cable VGA 15 pin HD
M/M w/stereo
miniplug 25', Kramer,
DRACGMAGMAZ25
Quantity: 2 each

No Bid

$35.00 = $70.00

$23.71 = $47.42

TEK VOX 1301
presentation switcher
scaler, TVX71020
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$1889.00
Substitute

$830.87

Wall plate 2VGA,
w/audio, Liberty,
LWCPCG1140EPC
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$53.75

$36.23

Network organizer,
network interface fo
projector PINET
organizer Plus II,
Sanyo,
SANPOAPNO3C
Quantity: 1 each

No Bid

$499.00

No Charge

DGPCABLE-
necessary to complete
installation

No Bid

$709.00

$505.26

Installation of above

No Bid

$2,899.00

$1,710.00

Total for Section 3:

No Bid

$21,940.75

$15,884.37




