Tabulation
Food for Jail and Juvenile
RFQ 2009-16
Effective: 1 January 2009 through 31 March 2009
Awarded to Brenham Wholesale, Labatt Food Service, and Performance Food Group

Fresh Fruit

Section Brenham Labatt Performance Mountain
Wholesale Food Service | Food Group King

Section I $3433270| $36.13932|  $34.481.64 No Bid
Frozen Meats
Section II ) .
Frozen Vegetables No Bid 3.518.46 4,027.32 No Bid
Section 111 . . )
B fast No Bid No Bid 1,498.12 No Bid
Section IV 2.266.07 2.278.03 2.503.62 No Bid
Frozen Juice
Section V . )
Drink Mix 774.25 No Bid 860.98 No Bid
Section VI 5.903.25 No Bid 6.250.49 No Bid
Cereal
Section VII . . )
Cookies/Crackers 1,786.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section VIIT No Bid 3,192.95 3,287.35 No Bid
Eggs/Margarine
Section IX No Bid No Bid 2.755.20 No Bid
Spices
Section X No Bid 2.808.01 2.990.16 No Bid
Condiments
Section XI No Bid 10441.11 10.677.86 No Bid
Dry Items
Section XII . . )
Can Goods/Vegetables No Bid 10,177.98 No Bid No Bid
Section XIII . . )
Can Goods/Fruits No Bid No Bid 5,893.49 No Bid
Section XIV . )
o Gods/Others No Bid 2.178.77 2.305.51 No Bid
Section XV . )
Gravy Mix/Sauces No Bid 69.80 60.00 No Bid
Section XVI . . )
Gelatin/Cake Mixes No Bid No Bid 4,614.35 No Bid
Section XVII No Bid 151.18 153.38 No Bid
Chips
Section XVIII 326.04 No Bid 482.23 No Bid
Coffee
Section XIX No Bid 6.091.72 7.819.13 No Bid
Misc. Items
Section XX No Bid 545.18 561.69 No Bid
Cooler Foods
Section XXI
Fresh Vegetables 6.637.20 5.896.44 5.626.16 5.126.75
Section XXII 2.789.52 2.861.76 2.537.75 2.081.25




