Tabulation Bid 22-013 Purchase of Vehicles

Low bidder per vehicle as highlighted

Description	Helfman Ford Inc. Stafford, TX	Lake Country Chevrolet Jasper, TX	McComb's HFC, Ltd San Antonio, TX	Silsbee Ford Inc Silsbee, TX
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe without console	No Bid	\$33,531.48	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with console	No Bid	\$34,215.48	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 3: Non-Police Package 4-door sedan	No Bid	\$19,465.25	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, extended cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, rubber flooring no carpet, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, extended cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth, rear cloth, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 8: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth, rear cloth, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, lockable hard cover, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 9: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth split bench, rear cloth, power windows/locks, TTP, tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, lockable hard cover, non aluminum bed	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 10: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl, rear vinyl, no full console, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Description	Helfman Ford Inc. Stafford, TX	Lake Country Chevrolet Jasper, TX	McComb's HFC, Ltd San Antonio, TX	Silsbee Ford Inc Silsbee, TX
Vehicle 11: Truck, 1/2 ton, crew cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, front tow hooks, TTP, limited slip rear axle, 7.89" min ground clearance, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 12: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB with hard cover, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor, lockable hard cover	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 13: Truck, 1/2 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, front ground clearance min 9.6 inch, locking rear differential, integrated trailer brake system, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	\$30,564.85	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, locking rear differential, front tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	\$30,766.25	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 16: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, locking rear differential, front tow hooks, TTP, limited slip rear axle, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	\$32,235.85	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 17: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, 4 wheel drive, cloth bucket, no full console, rear cloth, power windows/locks/towing mirrors, TTP, limited slip rear axle, integrated brake system & controller, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	\$32,316.25	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 18: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, Integrated trailer brake system, locking rear differential, tow hooks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	\$30,766.25	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 19: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, cloth, rear cloth, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid	\$33,019.05	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 20: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, dually, 4 wheel drive, diesel engine, cab/chassis only, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, limited slip rear axel, front tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system	\$44,580.40	\$42,111.05	\$46,588.00	\$46,264.75

Description	Helfman Ford Inc. Stafford, TX	Lake Country Chevrolet Jasper, TX	McComb's HFC, Ltd San Antonio, TX	Silsbee Ford Inc Silsbee, TX
Vehicle 21: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, 4 door crew cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, rubber	No Bid	\$33,328.85	No Bid	No Bid
mats, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor				
Vehicle 22: Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 4500, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, vinyl split bench,	\$37,821.52	No Bid	\$38,748.00	\$37,862.40
powered windows/locks, limited slip rear axle, front tow hooks, integrated trailer break				
system, wheelbase 137.5" minimum				
Vehicle 23: Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 5500, 4x4, regular cab, diesel, 60" cab to axle, dually cab &	\$48,195.40	No Bid	\$52,293.00	\$50,348.25
chassis, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, TTP				
Vehicle 24: Ford Explorer or equal, cloth seats, power windows/door locks, rear air	\$28,698.38	No Bid	\$28,994.00	\$29,109.00
conditioning, TTP	φ 20,070. 30	NO DIG	\$20,994.00	\$29,109.00
Vehicle 25: Ford Explorer Police Inceptor utility, all wheel drive, cloth, power driver's	\$31,578.38	No Bid	\$37,500.00	\$34,610.75
seat/windows/door locks/mirrors, no spotlight				
Vehicle 26: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, V-8, vinyl seating, vinyl flooring, power	No Bid	No Bid	\$41,055.00	No Bid
windows/locks, rear A/C, no back seat, side and rear windows, TTP				
Vehicle 27: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, bucket cloth, passenger cloth bench	No Bid	No Bid	\$41,055.00	No Bid
backseat with 3 person restraints, vinyl flooring, power windows/locks, rear A/C, side/rear				
door windows, TTP				
Vehicle 28: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth bucket, cloth bucket, rear vinyl,	\$33,830.76	No Bid	\$37,490.00	\$31,933.50
power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, aluminum bed floor				
Vehicle 29: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, hard cover, cloth bucket, rear vinyl,	\$34,607.67	No Bid	\$39,490.00	\$33,728.50
power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, lockable hard cover, aluminum bed floor	within 3% from a local			
	vendor pursuant to \$271.905			
Vehicle 30: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth split bench, rear	\$33,777.76	No Bid	\$39,490.00	\$33,828.50
vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, lockable hard cover,	<i><i><i><i>ϕ</i>𝔅𝔅𝔅𝔅𝔅𝔅𝔅𝔅𝔅</i></i></i>	110 210	<i>403</i> , <i>13</i> 0.000	<i>400,020.00</i>
Vehicle 31: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth split bench, rear vinyl, power	\$34,300.76	No Bid	\$37,490.00	\$32,033.50
windows/locks, TTP, tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, aluminum bed floor				
Vehicle 32: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, cloth split bench, rear	\$35,646.76	No Bid	\$38,870.00	\$35,733.50
vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, aluminum bed floor				

Description	Helfman Ford Inc. Stafford, TX	Lake Country Chevrolet Jasper, TX	McComb's HFC, Ltd San Antonio, TX	Silsbee Ford Inc Silsbee, TX
Vehicle 33: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB with hard cover, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, lockable hard cover, aluminum bed floor	\$33,925.76 within 3% from a local vendor pursuant to §271.905	No Bid	\$38,250.00	\$33,728.50
Vehicle 34: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, TTP, front tow hooks, locking rear differential, integrated trailer brake system, limited slip rear axle, aluminum bed floor	\$28,654.52 within 3% from a local vendor pursuant to \$271.905	No Bid	\$31,452.00	\$28,069.25
Vehicle 35: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, limited slip, locking rear differential, integrated trailer break system, aluminum bed floor	\$32,231.52	No Bid	\$32,388.00	\$30,975.50
Vehicle 36: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, locking rear differential, TTP, front tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, aluminum bed floor	\$29,998.52	No Bid	\$32,573.00	\$31,964.25
Vehicle 37: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, cloth, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, integrated trailer break system, TTP, aluminum bed floor	\$31,264.52	No Bid	\$33,463.00	\$33,150.25
Vehicle 38: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, V-8, vinyl seating, vinyl flooring, power windows/locks, rear A/C, no back seat, side and rear windows, TTP	No Bid	No Bid	\$42,055.00	No Bid
Vehicle 39: Ambulance cab and chassis, regular cab, diesel engine	No Bid	No Bid	\$47,905.00	No Bid
Vehicle 40: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, vinyl split bench, power window/locks, trailer towing mirrows, limited slip rear axle, front tow hooks, integraged trailer brake system	\$34,608.52 within 3% from a local vendor pursuant to \$271.905	No Bid	\$33,840.00	\$35,049.75
Vehicle 41: Truck, F-650, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, diesel, vinyl seating, driver bucket/2-passenger bench, pwer equipment group, air complressor, power window/locks, front tow hooks	\$71,105.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 42: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, 4X4, LWB, vinyl seating, rear vinyl, power window/locks, TTP, non-aluminum bed	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid