Fort Bend County Tabulation
B22-099
Term Contract for Purchase of Tires and Tubes

Term: October 1, 2022 through September 30, 2023

Awarded 9/6/2022: Low Bidder Per Section

Section 1: Tubes (Must be First Quality) Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
7.50R16 Tube with TR15 stem 14580 5 No Bid No Bid
7.50R16 Tube with TR150 stem 14591 5 No Bid No Bid
9.00R20 Tubes with TR443 stem 14593 5 No Bid No Bid
10.00R20 Tubes with TR444 stem 14595 5 No Bid No Bid
18.4-30 Tubes with TR218A stem 14596 22 No Bid No Bid
12.4-24 Tubes with TR218A stem 14597 12 No Bid No Bid
KR 14/15 Tubes with TR13 stem 14599 25 No Bid No Bid
13.6X24 Tubes cupples TR218A 14600 11 No Bid No Bid
11.00X16 Tubes with TR15CW stem 14601 8 No Bid No Bid
12X16.5 Tubes with TR15CW stem 14602 4 No Bid No Bid
16.9/18.4X34 Tubes cupples TR218A 14603 5 No Bid No Bid
480/400X8 Tubes cupples TR87 14604 6 No Bid No Bid
600/690X9 Brass stem tubes cupples TR440 14605 6 No Bid No Bid
7.00X12 Brass stem tubes cupples TR440 14606 4 No Bid No Bid
23 x 1050-12 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire 14607 2 No Bid No Bid
18 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire 14608 2 No Bid No Bid
16 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire 14609 2 No Bid No Bid
12.00 R20 tube 14611 10 No Bid No Bid
7.50 - 15 TR440 valve tube 14612 10 No Bid No Bid
23.1R26 Tubes w/ TR218A Stem 14614 2 No Bid No Bid
14.00R24 Tubes w/ TR78a Stem 14615 2 No Bid No Bid
7.50R15 w/ TR75A Stem 14617 2 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 1: $ - $ -




General/Passenger/Light Truck

Section 2A: Goodyear Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

P235/55R17 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 14588 300 No Bid $ 12400 ( $ 37,200.00
P265/60R17 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 14590 600 No Bid $ 13220 $ 79,320.00
P235/50R18 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 14592 300 No Bid § 15842 (8§ 47,526.00
P225/60R18 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 14594 600 No Bid $ 12592($ 75,552.00
275/55R20 Eagle Enforcer v-rated 14598 200 No Bid $ 14996 ( $ 29,992.00

TOTAL FOR SECTION 2A: - $ 269,590.00
Section 2B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended

Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

P235/55R17 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 15500 150 No Bid $ 124.00 | $ 18,600.00
P265/60R17 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 15501 300 No Bid $§ 132201 $ 39,660.00
P235/50R18 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 15502 150 No Bid $ 15842 1S 23,763.00
P225/60R18 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 15503 300 No Bid $§ 125921 $ 37,776.00
275/55R20 Eagle Enforcer v-rated 15504 100 No Bid $ 14996 | $ 14,996.00

TOTAL FOR SECTION 2B: - $ 134,795.00




General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 3A: Uniroyal Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

LT235/85R16 HD/H 10 ply 14582 20 No Bid No Bid

LT235/85R16 HD 10 ply 14583 20 No Bid No Bid

LT245/75R16 HD/H 10 ply 14584 50 No Bid No Bid

LT245/75R16 HD 10 ply 14585 50 No Bid No Bid

LT265/75R16 HD/D10 ply 14586 50 No Bid No Bid

P255/70R16 Laredo Cross Country 14587 50 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 3A: $ - $ -
Section 3B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

LT235/85R16 HD/H 10 ply 15505 10 $§ 12684 §$ 1,268.40 No Bid

LT235/85R16 HD 10 ply 15506 10 § 12684 $ 1,268.40 No Bid

LT245/75R16 HD/H 10 ply 15507 25 § 12570 $ 3,142.50 No Bid

LT245/75R16 HD 10 ply 15508 25 § 12570 | $ 3,142.50 No Bid

LT265/75R16 HD/D10 ply 15509 25 § 13645 §$ 3,411.25 No Bid

P255/70R16 Laredo Cross Country 15510 25 $§ 137.08]$ 3,427.00 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 3B: $ 15,660.05 $ -




General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 4A: Michelin Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
LT235/85R16 XPS Rib 10 ply 14610 20 $§ 2240018 4,480.00 No Bid
LT235/85R16 XPS Traction 10 ply 14613 10 $§ 22400 $ 2,240.00 No Bid
LT245/75R16 LTX A/T2 10 ply 14623 50 § 196.00 | $ 9,800.00 No Bid
LT245/75R16 Defender LTX M/S 14625 20 $ 173.60 | $ 3,472.00 No Bid
LT265/75R16 Defender LTX M/S 14628 20 § 191201 S 3,824.00 No Bid
LT245/75R17 Defender LTX M/S 14629 10 $ 257.60 ( $ 2,576.00 No Bid
LT245/75R17 LTX A/T2 , 10 ply 14630 4 $§ 23280 S 931.20 No Bid
LT275/65R18 LTX A/T2, 10 ply 14631 10 § 248.00 | $ 2,480.00 No Bid
LT275/65R18 Defender LTX M/S, 10 ply 14634 10 § 228801 S 2,288.00 No Bid
LT225/75R16 LTX M/S2, 10 ply 14636 40 § 16240 $ 6,496.00 No Bid
LT265/65R18 Defender LTX M/S, 10 ply 14639 20 $§ 205.60 | $ 4,112.00 No Bid
P255/70R16 Defender LTX M/S 14641 50 $ 17440 $ 8,720.00 No Bid
LT245/75R16 LTX A/T2 OWL 14643 10 $§ 196.00 | $ 1,960.00 No Bid
LT265/60R18 Defender LTX M/S 14645 20 $§ 20240 $ 4,048.00 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Defender LTX M/S 14650 20 § 251201 S 5,024.00 No Bid
P255/65R17 Defender LTX M/S 15882 200 § 19280 $ 38,560.00 No Bid
P245/60R18 Defender LTX M/S 15883 80 $ 200.00 | $ 16,000.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 4A: $ 117,011.20 -




Section 4B: Generic Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
LT235/85R16 XPS Rib 10 ply 15511 10 § 1268418 1,268.40 No Bid
LT235/85R16 XPS Traction 10 ply 15512 5 § 14656 | $ 732.80 No Bid
LT245/75R16 LTX A/T2 10 ply 15513 25 § 14052 | S 3,513.00 No Bid
LT245/75R16 Defender LTX M/S 15514 10 § 125770 | $ 1,257.00 No Bid
LT265/75R16 Defender LTX M/S 15515 10 § 13645| $ 1,364.50 No Bid
LT245/75R17 Defender LTX M/S 15516 5 § 15628 | $ 781.40 No Bid
LT245/75R17 LTX A/T2, 10 ply 15517 2 $ 160.08 | $ 320.16 No Bid
LT275/65R18 LTX A/T2, 10 ply 15518 5 § 19241 ]S 962.05 No Bid
LT275/65R18 Defender LTX M/S, 10 ply 15519 5 § 19894 | $ 994.70 No Bid
LT225/75R16 LTX M/S2, 10 ply 15520 20 § 138.66 | $ 2,773.20 No Bid
LT265/65R18 Defender LTX M/S, 10 ply 15521 10 § 13046 | $ 1,304.60 No Bid
P255/70R16 Defender LTX M/S 15522 25 § 137.08 ]S 3,427.00 No Bid
LT245/75R16 LTX A/T2 OWL 15523 5 § 14052 | S 702.60 No Bid
LT265/60R18 Defender LTX M/S 15524 10 § 121.14 | S 1,211.40 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Defender LTX M/S 15525 10 $§ 17352 § 1,735.20 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 4B: $ 22,348.01 -




General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section SA: B F Goodrich Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

LT245/75R17 Rugged Trail T/A 10 ply 14616 30 § 16320 S 4,896.00 No Bid

LT245/75R16 Commercial T/A 10 ply 14618 10 § 188.00 | $ 1,880.00 No Bid

LT245/75R17 Commercial T/A 10 ply 14619 10 § 22880 ]S 2,288.00 No Bid

LT275/65R18 All Terrain T/A KO2 14620 40 $ 253.60 | $ 10,144.00 No Bid

LT265/70R17 Commercial T/A 10 ply 14621 20 $§ 239201 S 4,784.00 No Bid

P235/75R16 Long Trail T/A Tour 14679 10 $ 11120 ( $ 1,112.00 No Bid

P245/75R16 Long Trail T/A tour 14683 10 § 118401 S 1,184.00 No Bid

P235/75R17 Long Trail 14689 150 § 199.20 | $ 29,880.00 No Bid

LT265/70R17 ALL TERRAIN T/A K02 14690 10 § 21840 S 2,184.00 No Bid

LT245/75R17 ALL TERRAIN T/A KO2 14694 20 $ 209.60 | $ 4,192.00 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 5A: $ 62,544.00 -
Section 5B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

LT245/75R17 Rugged Trail T/A 10 ply 15526 15 § 15628 | $ 2,344.20 No Bid

LT245/75R16 Commercial T/A 10 ply 15527 5 $ 12570 $ 628.50 No Bid

LT245/75R17 Commercial T/A 10 ply 15528 10 § 15628 § 1,562.80 No Bid

LT275/65R18 All Terrain T/A KO2 15529 20 § 19241 5% 3,848.20 No Bid

LT265/70R17 Commercial T/A 10 ply 15530 10 $ 17352 §$ 1,735.20 No Bid

P235/75R16 Long Trail T/A Tour 15531 10 § 12156 | $ 1,215.60 No Bid

P245/75R16 Long Trail T/A tour 15532 5 $ 12570 $ 628.50 No Bid

P235/75R17 Long Trail 15533 50 § 12425 % 6,212.50 No Bid

LT265/70R17 ALL TERRAIN T/A K02 15534 5 § 180.87 ]S 904.35 No Bid

LT245/75R17 ALL TERRAIN T/A KO2 15535 10 § 160.08 | $ 1,600.80 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 5B: $ 20,680.65 -




General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 6A: Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
LT235/75R15 Destination A/T2 6 ply 14622 20 § 11546 | § 2,309.20 No Bid
LT235/75R15 Destination MT 6 ply 14624 20 $ 14196 $ 2,839.20 No Bid
LT225/75R16 Transforce HT2 10 ply 14626 16 § 138.66 | § 2,218.56 No Bid
LT225/75R16 Destination X/T 10 ply 14627 16 $ 13454 $ 2,152.64 No Bid
LT245/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 14632 100 $§ 12570 $ 12,570.00 No Bid
LT245/75R16 Destination MT2 10 ply 14633 30 $ 15955( $ 4,786.50 No Bid
LT245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 14635 150 $ 15628 (S 23,442.00 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 14637 100 § 12684 $ 12,684.00 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Destination M/T2 10 ply 14638 30 § 17172 | § 5,151.60 No Bid
LT215/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 14640 16 $ 113.00( $ 1,808.00 No Bid
LT215/85R16 Destination X/T 10 ply 14642 20 § 12434 § 2,486.80 No Bid
LT235/80/17 Transforce HT 10 ply 14644 100 § 14620 $ 14,620.00 No Bid
LT245/70R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 14646 40 § 14422 | § 5,768.80 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 14647 20 $ 17352 $ 3,470.40 No Bid
LT265/75R16 Transforce AT2 14648 40 § 15638 | § 6,255.20 No Bid
LT275/70R18 Transforce AT2 10 ply 14649 20 $ 19295( $ 3,859.00 No Bid
LT275/70R18 Transforce HT 14651 20 § 18332 § 3,666.40 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Transforce AT2 10 ply 14652 50 $ 18087 $ 9,043.50 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Destination M/T2 10 ply 14653 100 § 18738 § 18,738.00 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Transforce AT2 10 ply 14654 20 $ 14656 $ 2,931.20 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Destiniation LE3 14655 20 § 12684 | § 2,536.80 No Bid
LT235/75R16 Destination LE3 14656 10 $ 12156 $ 1,215.60 No Bid
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply 14657 32 $ 16510 $ 5,283.20 No Bid
P255/70R16 Destination A/T2 1458 20 $ 151.00( $ 3,020.00 No Bid
P205/60R16 Firestone Champion Fuel fighter 14659 100 $ 84.60 [ § 8,460.00 No Bid
P255/65R17 Destination LE3 14660 200 $ 12196 $ 24,392.00 No Bid
P265/75R16 Destination X/T 14663 40 § 15646 | § 6,258.40 No Bid
P215/60R16 Champion Fuel Fighter 14665 40 $ 89.92 | $ 3,596.80 No Bid
P235/70R16 Destination LE3 14666 60 § 122,07 § 7,324.20 No Bid
P255/65R16 Destination LE3 14668 40 § 12245(§ 4,898.00 No Bid
P265/70R16 Destination LE3 14669 40 § 158.09 | § 6,323.60 No Bid




Section 6A: Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only, No Subs, Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
(cont'd) Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

P205/75R15 Winterforce 2 14670 40 $ 88.00 | § 3,520.00 No Bid

P235/55R17 Champion Fuel Fighter 14673 40 $§ 128.11 ]S 5,124.40 No Bid

P245/65R17 Destination LE3 14674 60 $ 111.75( $ 6,705.00 No Bid

P265/60R17 Fire Hawk V-Rated Pursuit 14675 400 § 12923 |8 51,692.00 No Bid

P245/60R18 Destination LE3 14677 50 § 11841 ]S 5,920.50 No Bid

P255/70R17 Destination LE3 14678 50 $§ 13731158 6,865.50 No Bid

P235/75R17 Dueler A/T REVO 2 14680 50 § 1242518 6,212.50 No Bid

P255/65R18 Destination LE3 14682 40 § 121978 4,878.80 No Bid

LT275/70R18 Destination MT2 14684 8 $§ 2332318 1,865.84 No Bid

P265/65R18 Destination LE3 OWL 14686 6 § 13046 | S 782.76 No Bid

275/55R20 Fire Hawk V-Rated Pursuit All Season 14687 200 $ 172.34 | $ 34,468.00 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 6A: $ 342,144.90 $ -




General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 6B: Generic Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
LT235/75R15 Destination A/T2 6 ply 15536 10 § 11546 $ 1,154.60 No Bid
LT235/75R15 Destination MT 6 ply 15537 10 $ 14196 $ 1,419.60 No Bid
LT225/75R16 Transforce HT2 10 ply 15538 $ 138.66 | § 1,109.28 No Bid
LT225/75R16 Destination X/T 10 ply 15539 $ 13454 $ 1,076.32 No Bid
LT245/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 15540 50 $ 12570 $ 6,285.00 No Bid
LT245/75R16 Destination MT2 10 ply 15541 15 $ 15955( $ 2,393.25 No Bid
LT245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 15542 75 $ 15628 $ 11,721.00 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 15543 50 $ 12684 $ 6,342.00 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Destination M/T2 10 ply 15544 15 § 17172 | § 2,575.80 No Bid
LT215/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 15545 8 $ 113.00( $ 904.00 No Bid
LT215/85R16 Destination X/T 10 ply 15546 10 § 12434 § 1,243.40 No Bid
LT235/80/17 Transforce HT 10 ply 15547 50 $ 14620 $ 7,310.00 No Bid
LT245/70R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 15548 20 § 14422 § 2,884.40 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 15549 10 $ 17352 $ 1,735.20 No Bid
LT265/75R16 Transforce AT2 15550 20 § 15638 $ 3,127.60 No Bid
LT275/70R18 Transforce AT2 10 ply 15551 10 $ 19295( $ 1,929.50 No Bid
LT275/70R18 Transforce HT 15552 10 $ 18332 ( §$ 1,833.20 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Transforce AT2 10 ply 15553 25 $ 18087 $ 4,521.75 No Bid
LT265/70R17 Destination M/T2 10 ply 15554 50 § 18738 | § 9,369.00 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Transforce AT2 10 ply 15555 10 $ 14656 $ 1,465.60 No Bid
LT235/85R16 Destiniation LE3 15556 10 § 12684 | § 1,268.40 No Bid
LT235/75R16 Destination LE3 15557 5 $ 12156 $ 607.80 No Bid
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply 15558 15 $ 16510 $ 2,476.50 No Bid
P255/70R16 Destination A/T2 15559 10 $ 151.00( $ 1,510.00 No Bid
P205/60R16 Firestone Champion Fuel fighter 15560 50 $ 84.60 | $ 4,230.00 No Bid
P255/65R17 Destination LE3 15561 75 $ 12196 $ 9,147.00 No Bid
P265/75R16 Destination X/T 15562 20 § 15646 | § 3,129.20 No Bid
P215/60R16 Champion Fuel Fighter 15563 20 $ 89.92 | $ 1,798.40 No Bid
P235/70R16 Destination LE3 15564 30 § 122,07 § 3,662.10 No Bid
P255/65R16 Destination LE3 15565 20 § 12245(§ 2,449.00 No Bid
P265/70R16 Destination LE3 15566 20 § 158.09 | § 3,161.80 No Bid




General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 6B: Generic (cont'd) Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
P205/75R15 Winterforce 2 15567 20 $ 88.00 | $ 1,760.00 No Bid
P235/55R17 Champion Fuel Fighter 15568 20 $ 12811 ($ 2,562.20 No Bid
P245/65R17 Destination LE3 15569 30 § 11175 $ 3,352.50 No Bid
P265/60R17 Fire Hawk V-Rated Pursuit 15570 150 $ 12923 (S 19,384.50 No Bid
P245/60R18 Destination LE3 15571 25 $§ 118411 § 2,960.25 No Bid
P255/70R17 Destination LE3 15572 25 $ 137311 8§ 3,432.75 No Bid
P235/75R17 Dueler A/T REVO 2 15573 25 § 12425 § 3,106.25 No Bid
P255/65R18 Destination LE3 15574 20 $ 12197 $ 2,439.40 No Bid
LT275/70R18 Destination MT2 15575 4 $§ 233231 8§ 932.92 No Bid
P265/65R18 Destination LE3 OWL 15576 3 $ 13046 $ 391.38 No Bid
275/55R20 Fire Hawk V-Rated Pursuit All Season 15577 100 $ 172341 $ 17,234.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 6B: $ 161,396.85 $ -
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General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 7A: Goodyear Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

LT235/75R15 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply 14661 10 No Bid § 15874 | § 1,587.40
LT235/85R16 Wrangler HT 10 ply 14662 20 No Bid S 14161 (S 2,832.20
LT235/85R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 14664 20 No Bid § 18873 | § 3,774.60
LT235/85R16 LR G G614 RST 14 ply 14667 16 No Bid S 33444$ 5,351.04
LT245/75R16 Wrangler HT load range E 14671 8 No Bid § 12123 § 969.84
LT245/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 14672 20 No Bid $ 20757 (S 4,151.40
LT245/75R16 Wrangler Trail Runner AT 10 ply 14676 300 No Bid $ 13645 (S 40,935.00
LT245/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT 10 ply 14681 20 No Bid $ 15189 $ 3,037.80
LT265/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT 10 ply 14685 10 No Bid $ 17216 | § 1,721.60
LT265/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 8 ply 14688 60 No Bid $ 20012 $ 12,007.20
LT245/70R17 Wrangler Trail Runner AT 6 ply 14691 90 No Bid $§ 15501 (8 13,950.90
LT265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S 14692 40 No Bid $ 160.60 | $ 6,424.00
LT265/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 14695 10 No Bid $ 21346 $ 2,134.60
LT275/65R18 Wrangler Trail Runner AT VBL10 ply 14699 10 No Bid $ 17620 ( $ 1,762.00
LT275/65R18 Wrangler Trail Runner AT OWL 10 ply 14701 12 No Bid § 17620 § 2,114.40
P205/60R16 Eagle Sport A/S 14703 10 No Bid $ 81.72 | $ 817.20
P215/65R16 Assurance WeatherReady 14705 10 No Bid $ 10652 $ 1,065.20
P235/75R17 Wrangler SRA 14707 10 No Bid $ 13292 (§ 1,329.20
P235/75R15 Wrangler Fortitude HT XL 14708 10 No Bid $ 10833 (S 1,083.30
P235/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT BW 14710 100 No Bid $ 13963 ($ 13,963.00
P245/65R17 Wrangler Fortitude HT 14713 10 No Bid § 13464 | § 1,346.40
P245/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT 14714 20 No Bid $ 13099 | $ 2,619.80
P255/70r16 Wrangler RT/S 14716 30 No Bid § 13877 § 4,163.10
P255/65R16-Eagle ES Item Removed
P265/70R17 Wrangler Fortitude HT 14719 10 No Bid § 125116 § 1,251.60
P265/70R17 WranglerTrail Runner AT 14725 8 No Bid $ 13666 $ 1,093.28
P275/65R18 Wrangler SR-A OWL SL 14727 30 No Bid § 14675 § 4,402.50
LT265/70R17 Wrangler Duratrac 10 ply 14729 40 No Bid $ 17966  $ 7,186.40
LT275/70R18 Wrangler Duratrac 10 ply 14732 30 No Bid § 18493 | § 5,547.90
LT275/65R18 Wrangler Duratrac 6 ply 15884 20 No Bid $ 166.12 | $ 3,322.40

TOTAL FOR SECTION 7A: $ 151,945.26
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General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 7B: Generic Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

LT235/75R15 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply 15578 5 $ 1419 ( $ 70980 [ § 15774 § 788.70
LT235/85R16 Wrangler HT 10 ply 15579 10 $ 12684 $ 1,268.40 [ $§ 14161 [ $ 1,416.10
LT235/85R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 15580 10 $ 17172 $ 1,717.20 [ §  188.73  § 1,887.30
LT235/85R16 LR G G614 RST 14 ply 15581 8 $ 17172 § 1,373.76 | § 33444 § 2,675.52
LT245/75R16 Wrangler HT load range E 15582 4 $ 12570 $ 502.80 [ § 12123 § 484.92
LT245/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 15583 10 $ 15955 (S 1,595.50 | § 207.57 [ $ 2,075.70
LT245/75R16 Wrangler Trail Runner AT 10 ply 15584 150 $ 14052 § 21,078.00 [ § 136.45 [ $ 20,467.50
LT245/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT 10 ply 15585 10 $ 12570 $ 1,257.00 | $  151.89 [ § 1,518.90
LT265/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT 10 ply 15586 5 $ 13645 (S 68225 (8§ 17216 § 860.80
LT265/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 8 ply 15587 30 $ 16588 $ 4976.40 [ $§ 200.12 [ $ 6,003.60
LT245/70R17 Wrangler Trail Runner AT 6 ply 15588 40 $ 15376 $ 6,150.40 | $ 15501 | § 6,200.40
LT265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S 15589 20 $ 18087 ( $ 3,61740 [ $  160.60 | § 3,212.00
LT265/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 15590 5 $ 18738 (S 93690 [ § 21346 § 1,067.30
LT275/65R18 Wrangler Trail Runner AT VBL10 ply 15591 5 $ 19241 (S 962.05|§ 17620 $ 881.00
LT275/65R18 Wrangler Trail Runner AT OWL 10 ply 15592 6 § 19241 $ 1,154.46 [ § 17620 | $ 1,057.20
P205/60R16 Eagle Sport A/S 15593 6 $ 89.01 | $ 534.06 | $ 81.72 | $ 490.32
P215/65R16 Assurance WeatherReady 15594 6 $ 96.05 | $ 57630 [ § 10652  § 639.12
P235/75R17 Wrangler SRA 15595 6 $ 12425($ 74550 | § 132921 § 797.52
P235/75R15 Wrangler Fortitude HT XL 15596 6 $ 11210 ( $ 67260 [ § 10833 [ § 649.98
P235/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT BW 15597 50 $ 12156 $ 6,078.00 | $ 139.63 | § 6,981.50
P245/65R17 Wrangler Fortitude HT 15598 5 $ 11175 ( $ 558758 13464 $ 673.20
P245/75R16 Wrangler Fortitude HT 15599 10 $ 12570 $ 1,257.00 | $  130.99 [ § 1,309.90
P255/70r16 Wrangler RT/S 15600 15 $ 137.08 (S 2,056.20 [ § 13877 $ 2,081.55
P255/65R16 Eagle LS 15802 5 $ 12245($ 612.25 No Bid
P265/70R17 Wrangler Fortitude HT 15601 5 $ 14978  $ 74890 [ § 12516 § 625.80
P265/70R17 WranglerTrail Runner AT 15602 4 $ 14019 $ 560.76 | § 136.66 | $ 546.64
P275/65R18 Wrangler SR-A OWL SL 15603 15 $ 14978  $ 2,246.70 [ § 14675 $ 2,201.25
LT265/70R17 Wrangler Duratrac 10 ply 15604 20 $ 18738 | $ 3,747.60 | $  179.66 | § 3,593.20
LT275/70R18 Wrangler Duratrac 10 ply 15605 15 $§ 23323 (8§ 34984515 18493 | § 2,773.95

TOTAL FOR SECTION 7B: $ 71,875.39 $ 73,960.87
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General/Passenger/Light Truck (cont'd)

Section 8A: Toyo Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

LT245/75R16 Open Country MT 10 ply 14693 20 No Bid No Bid

LT235/85R16 Open Country MT 10 ply 14696 12 No Bid No Bid

LT265/70R17 Open Country MT 10 ply 14697 20 No Bid No Bid

LT265/70R17 Open Country AT 14698 16 No Bid No Bid

LT245/75R17 Open Country AT 14700 8 No Bid No Bid

LT265/70R17 Open Country AT3 10ply 14702 16 No Bid No Bid

LT265/70R18 Open Country AT3 10ply 14704 16 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 8A: $ - -
Section 8B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

LT245/75R16 Open Country MT 10 ply 15606 6 § 1595518 957.30 No Bid

LT235/85R16 Open Country MT 10 ply 15607 6 $ 12684 $ 761.04 No Bid

LT265/70R17 Open Country MT 10 ply 15608 10 $§ 187388 1,873.80 No Bid

LT265/70R17 Open Country AT 15609 8 § 17455 §$ 1,396.40 No Bid

LT245/75R17 Open Country AT 15610 4 § 16258 | $ 650.32 No Bid

LT265/70R17 Open Country AT3 10ply 15611 8 § 17455 §$ 1,396.40 No Bid

LT265/70R18 Open Country AT3 10ply 15612 8 § 17523 ] %$ 1,401.84 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 8B: $ 8,437.10 -
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Heavy Truck

Section 9A: B F Goodrich Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
225/70R19.5 ST230 14 Ply 14706 4 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 9A: - -
Section 9B: Generic Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
225/70R19.5 ST230 14 Ply 15613 2 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 9B: - -
Section 10A: Bridgeston/Firestone Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Pricing per Pricing
Quantity Each Each
225/70R19.5 M724F 12 ply 14709 8 § 32371 2,589.68 No Bid
225/70R19.5 M729F 12 ply 14711 8 § 32371 2,589.68 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 10A: 5,179.36 -
Section 10B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Pricing per Pricing
Quantity Each Each
225/70R19.5 M724F 12 ply 15614 4 $ 303.17 1,212.68 No Bid
225/70R19.5 M729F 12 ply 15615 4 § 303.17 1,212.68 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 10B: 2,425.36 -
Section 11A: Continental Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
225/70R19.5 HD3 Terra Plus 14ply 14712 16 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 11A: - -
Section 11B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
225/70R19.5 HD3 Terra Plus 14ply 15616 8 § 313.72 2,509.76 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 11B: 2,509.76 -
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Heavy Truck (cont'd)

Section 12A: Michelin Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
225/70 R19.5 10 ply XZE 14715 6 No Bid No Bid
225/70R19.5 XZE 14 ply 14718 4 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZE2 LRG 14 ply 14721 100 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZY LRH 16 ply XZY3 14723 12 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZE2 LRH 16 ply 14728 6 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XMD LRH 16 ply 14731 32 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZY3 14746 12 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XDY3 14747 12 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 X WORK XDY 14748 12 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XDY3 14749 12 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 X WORK XDY 14751 12 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XMD LRH 14752 6 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XDN2 14753 3 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XDAS5+ 14755 2 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XZE2 LRH 16 Ply 14758 20 No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 XZE 14760 24 No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 XZY3 14763 12 No Bid No Bid
255/70R22.5 XZE 14765 12 No Bid No Bid
275/80R24.5 XDN2 14766 8 No Bid No Bid
275/80R24.5 XDAS+ 14769 5 No Bid No Bid
315/80 R22.5 XZA 14770 6 No Bid No Bid
315/80/R22.5 X WORKS Z 14771 6 No Bid No Bid
385/65R22.5 x 24 18 ply XZY 3 14772 6 No Bid No Bid
425/65R22.5 XZY3 14775 6 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 12A: $ -
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Heavy Truck (cont'd)

Section 12B: Generic Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
225/70 R19.5 10 ply XZE 15617 4 No Bid No Bid
225/70R19.5 XZE 14 ply 15618 2 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZE2 LRG 14 ply 15619 50 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZY LRH 16 ply XZY3 15620 6 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZE2 LRH 16 ply 15621 3 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XMD LRH 16 ply 15622 12 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XZY3 15623 6 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 XDY3 15624 6 No Bid No Bid
11R22.5 X WORK XDY 15625 6 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XDY3 15626 8 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 X WORK XDY 15627 6 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XMD LRH 15628 3 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XDN2 15629 3 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XDAS5+ 15630 2 No Bid No Bid
11R24.5 XZE2 LRH 16 Ply 15631 10 No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 XZE 15632 12 No Bid No Bid
12R22.5 XZY3 15633 8 No Bid No Bid
255/70R22.5 XZE 15634 6 No Bid No Bid
275/80R24.5 XDN2 15635 4 No Bid No Bid
275/80R24.5 XDAS+ 15636 4 No Bid No Bid
315/80 R22.5 XZA 15637 2 No Bid No Bid
315/80/R22.5 X WORKS Z 15638 2 No Bid No Bid
385/65R22.5 x 24 18 ply XZY 3 15639 2 No Bid No Bid
425/65R22.5 XZY3 15640 2 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 12B: $ -

16




Heavy Truck (cont'd)

Section 13A: B F Goodrich Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

11R22.5 Cross Control D 16 ply 14717 10 No Bid No Bid

11R24.5 Cross Control D 16 ply 14720 10 No Bid No Bid

11R22.5 ST230 14722 10 No Bid No Bid

11R24.5 ST230 14724 10 No Bid No Bid

11R22.5 TR144 14726 10 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 13A: -
Section 13B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

11R22.5 Cross Control D 16 ply 15641 6 No Bid No Bid

11R24.5 Cross Control D 16 ply 15642 8 No Bid No Bid

11R22.5 ST230 15643 8 No Bid No Bid

11R24.5 ST230 15644 8 No Bid No Bid

11R22.5 TR144 15645 8 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 13B:
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Section 14A: Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

10R22.5 FS561 Plus 12 ply 14730 4 $§ 397.66 | $ 1,590.64 No Bid

10R22.5 FD663 14 ply 14733 4 $ 41466 | $ 1,658.64 No Bid

11R22.5 FS 560 Plus 16 ply 14734 12 $ 406.69 | $ 4,880.28 No Bid

11R22.5 T831 16 ply 14735 12 § 515348 6,184.08 No Bid

11R22.5 T819 16 ply 14736 12 $§ 44691 | § 5,362.92 No Bid

12R22.5 T831 16 ply 14737 10 § 607.02]8$ 6,070.20 No Bid

11R24.5 T831 16 ply 14738 12 $§ 5725218 6,870.24 No Bid

11R24.5 FS 560 Plus 16 ply 14739 12 $ 44694 | $ 5,363.28 No Bid

12R22.5 FS561 Plus 16 ply 14740 12 § 45044 | $ 5,405.28 No Bid

315/80R22.5 FS400 20 ply 14741 12 § 66512 | % 7,981.44 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 14A: $ 51,367.00 $ -
Section 14B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

10R22.5 FS561 Plus 12 ply 15646 4 $ 39766 $ 1,590.64 No Bid

10R22.5 FD663 14 ply 15647 4 § 41466 | $ 1,658.64 No Bid

11R22.5 FS 560 Plus 16 ply 15648 12 § 406.69 | $ 4,880.28 No Bid

11R22.5 T831 16 ply 15649 12 § 51534 § 6,184.08 No Bid

11R22.5 T819 16 ply 15650 12 $ 44691 | $ 5,362.92 No Bid

12R22.5 T831 16 ply 15651 10 $§ 607.02 8§ 6,070.20 No Bid

11R24.5 T831 16 ply 15652 12 § 572528 6,870.24 No Bid

11R24.5 FS 560 Plus 16 ply 15653 12 $§ 44694 | § 5,363.28 No Bid

12R22.5 FS561 Plus 16 ply 15654 12 $§ 45044 | $ 5,405.28 No Bid

315/80R22.5 FS400 20 ply 15655 12 $§ 66512 § 7,981.44 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 14B: $ 51,367.00 $ -
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Heavy Truck (cont'd)

Section 15A: Goodyear Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

11R22.5 Workhorse MSA 16 ply 14742 8 No Bid $§ 373491 $ 2,987.92
11R22.5 Workhorse MSA 16 ply 14744 100 No Bid § 37349 $ 37,349.00
11R22.5 Workhorse MSD 16 ply 14745 12 No Bid $§ 398471 8§ 4,781.64
11R22.5 Marathon LHS 14 ply 14750 12 No Bid $§ 371.18 | $ 4,454.16
11R22.5 Marathon LHT 12 ply 14759 12 No Bid § 319221 8§ 3,830.64
12R22.5 G751 MSA 16 ply 14761 No Bid $ 647.09| $ 3,882.54
315/80R22.5 G291 18 ply 14767 No Bid § 523931 8§ 3,143.58
385/65R22.5 G278 18 ply 14768 No Bid $§ 85939 5% 3,437.56

TOTAL FOR SECTION 15A: - $ 63,867.04
Section 15B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended

Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

11R22.5 Workhorse MSA 16 ply 15656 4 No Bid $§ 37349 $ 1,493.96
11R22.5 Workhorse MSA 16 ply 15657 20 No Bid $§ 37349 8% 7,469.80
11R22.5 Workhorse MSD 16 ply 15658 6 No Bid $§ 398471 $ 2,390.82
11R22.5 Marathon LHS 14 ply 15659 6 No Bid $§ 371.18( $ 2,227.08
11R22.5 Marathon LHT 12 ply 15660 6 No Bid $§ 319221 8§ 1,915.32
12R22.5 G751 MSA 16 ply 15661 2 No Bid $ 647.09| $ 1,294.18
315/80R22.5 G291 18 ply 15662 2 No Bid $§ 523931 8§ 1,047.86
385/65R22.5 G278 18 ply 15663 2 No Bid $§ 85939 5% 1,718.78

TOTAL FOR SECTION 15B: - $ 19,557.80
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Section 16A: Toyo Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

11R22.5 M506Z 16 ply 14743 10 No Bid No Bid

11R24.5 M506Z 16 ply 14754 10 No Bid No Bid

11R22.5 M157 14 ply 14756 10 No Bid No Bid

11R22.5 M147 16 ply 14757 10 No Bid No Bid

11R24.5 M147 16 ply 14762 40 No Bid No Bid

12R22.5 M170 16 ply 14764 40 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 16A: $ - -
Section 16B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

11R22.5 M506Z 16 ply 15664 4 § 525341 8§ 2,101.36 No Bid

11R24.5 M506Z 16 ply 15665 4 § 572528 2,290.08 No Bid

11R22.5 M157 14 ply 15666 4 $§ 41775 §$ 1,671.00 No Bid

11R22.5 M147 16 ply 15667 4 § 406.69 | $ 1,626.76 No Bid

11R24.5 M147 16 ply 15668 12 $§ 44694 | § 5,363.28 No Bid

12R22.5 M170 16 ply 15669 12 § 498.09 | $ 5,977.08 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 16B: $ 19,029.56 -
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Heavy Truck (cont'd)

Section 17: Generic Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
10R22.5 FS561 12 ply 13151 4 § 277.00 | $ 1,108.00 | $ 373.02 | $ 1,492.08
10R22.5 FD663 12 ply 9265 4 $ 270.00 | $ 1,080.00 [ $§ 45885 $ 1,835.40
11R22.5 FS561 16 ply 13152 25 § 303.00 S 7,575.00 | $ 396.82 | § 9,920.50
11R22.5 T831 16 ply 15670 12 $ 364.00 | $ 4368.00 [ $§ 39847 | $ 4,781.64
11R22.5 T819 16 ply 9268 8 § 355.00 ]S 2,840.00 | $ 37349 ( § 2,987.92
12R22.5 T831 16 ply 9269 10 $ 364.00 | $ 3,640.00 | $ 61857 | $ 6,185.70
11R24.5 T831 16 ply 10452 25 $ 384.00 | S 9,600.00 | $§ 426.65| $ 10,666.25
11R24.5 16 ply FS561 13153 $ 320.00 | $ 2,560.00 [ $§ 42063 $ 3,365.04
12R22.5 FS561 13154 $§ 365.00 S 2,920.00 | $ 45635( $ 3,650.80
TOTAL FOR SECTION 17: $ 35,691.00 $ 44,885.33
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Agricultural

Section 18A: Michelin Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
12.4-24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15482 5 No Bid No Bid
13.6R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15483 5 No Bid No Bid
14.9R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15484 5 No Bid No Bid
18.4R30 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15485 4 No Bid No Bid
16.9R34 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15486 5 No Bid No Bid
18.4R38 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15487 5 No Bid No Bid
380/85R24 Power Radial 80 15488 5 No Bid No Bid
18.4R34 R-1W Radial 8 ply 15489 5 No Bid No Bid
23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 14796 10 No Bid No Bid
28L-26 10 ply tubeless 15490 10 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 18A: $ - -
Section 18B: Generic Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
12.4-24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15671 2 $§ 336.00 | S 672.00 No Bid
13.6R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15672 2 § 592.00 S 1,184.00 No Bid
14.9R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15673 2 $ 740.00 | $ 1,480.00 No Bid
18.4R30 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15674 2 $ 1,450.00 | $ 2,900.00 No Bid
16.9R34 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15675 2 $ 1,399.00 | $ 2,798.00 No Bid
18.4R38 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 15676 2 $ 2,050.00 | $ 4,100.00 No Bid
380/85R24 Power Radial 80 15677 2 $ 1,999.00 | $ 3,998.00 No Bid
18.4R34 R-1W Radial 8 ply 15678 2 $ 1,999.00 | $ 3,998.00 No Bid
23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 15679 4 $ 1,499.00 | $ 5,996.00 No Bid
28L-26 10 ply tubeless 15680 4 $ 1,864.54 | $ 7,458.16 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 18B: $ 34,584.16 -
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Agricultural (cont'd)

Section 19A: Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 14774 4 $§ 19259 § 770.36 No Bid
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8§ ply 14779 8 $ 21049 | $ 1,683.92 No Bid
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 14788 5 $§ 261018 1,305.05 No Bid
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 14789 8 $ 20838 $ 1,667.04 No Bid
12.4-24 Super All Traction 11 23° 8 ply 14794 12 $§ 38035 8§ 4,564.20 No Bid
340/85R24 Performer 85 R-1W 8 ply 14795 5 § 74831 $ 3,741.55 No Bid
380/85R24 Performer 85 R-1W 8§ ply 14796 5 § 78126 $ 3,906.30 No Bid
13.6-24 Super All Traction II 23deg R-1 8 ply 14798 4 $ 42593 ]S 1,703.72 No Bid
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip - R-2 10 ply 14799 4 $ 1,374.77 | $ 5,499.08 No Bid
18.4-34 Super All Traction 23° TL-R-1 8 ply 14801 5 $ 1,027.89 | $ 5,139.45 No Bid
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8§ ply 14803 5 $ 3,056.78 | § 15,283.90 No Bid
18.4-30 Super All Traction II 23° R-1 8 ply 14806 4 $§ 788321(8% 3,153.28 No Bid
12.4R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 14811 20 $§ 71090 | § 14,218.00 No Bid
13.6R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 14819 4 $ 748311 $ 2,993.24 No Bid
14.9R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 14821 8 § 78126 $ 6,250.08 No Bid
18.4R30 Radio All Traction DT R-1W 14822 20 $ 1,28436 | $ 25,687.20 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 19A: $ 97,566.37 -
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Section 19B: Generic Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9311 4 $§ 19259 | $ 770.36 No Bid
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8§ ply 9312 8 § 21049 S 1,683.92 No Bid
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 § ply 9313 5 $§ 261.01]8S 1,305.05 No Bid
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9314 8 $§ 20838 ]S 1,667.04 No Bid
12.4-24 Super All Traction II 23° 8 ply 9315 6 $§ 38035($ 2,282.10 No Bid
340/85R24 Performer 85 R-1W 8 ply 15681 5 § 748311 S 3,741.55 No Bid
380/85R24 Performer 85 R-1W 8 ply 15682 5 § 781261 $ 3,906.30 No Bid
13.6-24 Super All Traction II 23deg R-1 8 ply 15683 4 $§ 425931 § 1,703.72 No Bid
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip - R-2 10 ply 15684 4 $ 1,374.77 | $ 5,499.08 No Bid
18.4-34 Super All Traction 23° TL-R-1 8 ply 15685 5 $ 1,027.89 | $ 5,139.45 No Bid
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 ply 15686 5 $ 3,056.78 | $ 15,283.90 No Bid
18.4-30 Super All Traction II 23° R-1 8 ply 15687 4 § 78832158 3,153.28 No Bid
12.4R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 15688 6 $ 71090 | $ 4,265.40 No Bid
13.6R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 15689 4 § 748311 S 2,993.24 No Bid
14.9R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 15690 8 $ 781261 $ 6,250.08 No Bid
18.4R30 Radio All Traction DT R-1W 15691 6 $ 128436 | $ 7,706.16 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 19B: $ 67,350.63 -
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Agricultural (cont'd)

Section 20A: Goodyear Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

7.50-16 Triple Rib HD TT 6 ply 14773 4 No Bid No Bid

11L-15 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply 14776 12 No Bid No Bid

10.00-16 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply 14777 4 No Bid No Bid

11.00-16 Triple Rib HD 8 ply TT 14778 4 No Bid No Bid

12.4-24 R1 Dura Torque TL 8 ply 14780 16 No Bid No Bid

13.6-24 R1 Dyna Torque II TT 8 ply 14782 5 No Bid No Bid

14.9 R24 R-1W Super Traction Radial 14784 5 No Bid No Bid

18.4-30 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply 14786 24 No Bid No Bid

18.4-30 R-2 Special Sure Grip TDS8 10 ply TL 14790 6 No Bid No Bid

18.4-34 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply 14791 No Bid No Bid

18.4R38 R-1 Dyna Torque TL 14792 No Bid No Bid

23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 14793 10 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 20A: $ - -
Section 20B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

7.50-16 Triple Rib HD TT 6 ply 15692 2 § 154.00 | § 308.00 No Bid

11L-15 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply 15693 6 $ 120.00 | $ 720.00 No Bid

10.00-16 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply 15694 2 § 248.00 | § 496.00 No Bid

11.00-16 Triple Rib HD 8 ply TT 15695 2 $ 22500( $ 450.00 No Bid

12.4-24 R1 Dura Torque TL 8 ply 15696 8 $ 33500 $ 2,680.00 No Bid

13.6-24 R1 Dyna Torque I TT 8 ply 15697 4 $ 46500 $ 1,860.00 No Bid

14.9 R24 R-1W Super Traction Radial 15698 4 $ 1,800.00  $ 7,200.00 No Bid

18.4-30 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply 15699 12 $ 806.00 $ 9,672.00 No Bid

18.4-30 R-2 Special Sure Grip TD8 10 ply TL 15700 4 $ 1,093.00 | § 4,372.00 No Bid

18.4-34 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply 15701 4 $ 889.00 ( $ 3,556.00 No Bid

18.4R38 R-1 Dyna Torque TL 15702 4 $ 999.00 [ $ 3,996.00 No Bid

23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 15703 6 $ 1,864.54 | § 11,187.24 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 20B: $ 46,497.24 -
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Agricultural (cont'd)

Section 21: Generic Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 15704 4 § 154.00 | $ 616.00 No Bid
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 15705 4 § 248.00 | $ 992.00 No Bid
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 15706 5 § 22500 S 1,125.00 No Bid
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 15707 4 $ 12000 | $ 480.00 No Bid
12.4-24 Super All Traction 23° 8 ply 15708 12 § 33500 S 4,020.00 No Bid
18.4-30 Super All Traction 23° TL 8 ply 15709 12 $ 806.00 $ 9,672.00 No Bid
340/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8 ply 9317 5 $§ 539.00 | S 2,695.00 No Bid
380/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8 ply 9318 5 $§ 735.00 (| $ 3,675.00 No Bid
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 6 ply 9319 4 $§ 806.00 | $ 3,224.00 No Bid
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 10 ply 9320 4 $ 1,093.00 | $ 4,372.00 No Bid
16.9-34 Traction Field & Road 8 ply 9321 5 $§ 73400 | S 3,670.00 No Bid
18.4-34 Super All Traction 23° TL 8 ply 15710 5 $ 880.00( $ 4,400.00 No Bid
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 ply 9323 5 $ 999.00 | $ 4,995.00 No Bid
13.6-24 Super All Traction 23° TL 8 ply 15711 8 $ 480.00  $ 3,840.00 No Bid
ST205/75R15C Tow Master Trailer 10100 80 $ 86.00 | $ 6,880.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 21: $ 54,656.00 $ -
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Heavy Equipment/Specialty

Section 22A: Michelin Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
29.5R25 XHA?2 Loader 15469 6 No Bid No Bid
14.00R24 XGLA2 15470 10 No Bid No Bid
17.5R25 XTLA Loader 15471 10 No Bid No Bid
20.5R25 XTLA Loader 15472 10 No Bid No Bid
13.00R24 XGLA2 15473 10 No Bid No Bid
7.50R15 XLC Lisse Compactor 15474 10 No Bid No Bid
23.5R25 XHA2 15475 10 No Bid No Bid
12x16.5 X TWEEL SSL 2 All Terrain 12" 15476 10 No Bid No Bid
12x16.5 X TWEEL SSL 2 Hard Surface 12" 15477 8 No Bid No Bid
620/75R26 was 23.1-26 10 ply 15478 4 No Bid No Bid
620/75R26 was 23.1-26 12 ply 15479 4 No Bid No Bid
750/65R26 was 28L-R26 10 ply 15480 4 No Bid No Bid
750/65R26 was 28L-R26 12 ply 15481 4 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 22A: - $ -
Section 22B: Generic Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
29.5R25 XHA2 Loader 15712 2 No Bid No Bid
14.00R24 XGLA2 15713 6 No Bid No Bid
17.5R25 XTLA Loader 15714 6 No Bid No Bid
20.5R25 XTLA Loader 15715 6 No Bid No Bid
13.00R24 XGLA2 15716 6 No Bid No Bid
7.50R15 XLC Lisse Compactor 15717 6 No Bid No Bid
23.5R25 XHA2 15718 6 No Bid No Bid
12x16.5 X TWEEL SSL 2 All Terrain 12" 15719 6 No Bid No Bid
12x16.5 X TWEEL SSL 2 Hard Surface 12" 15720 4 No Bid No Bid
620/75R26 was 23.1-26 10 ply 15721 2 No Bid No Bid
620/75R26 was 23.1-26 12 ply 15722 2 No Bid No Bid
750/65R26 was 28L-R26 10 ply 15723 2 No Bid No Bid
750/65R26 was 28L-R26 12 ply 15724 2 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 22B: - $ -
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Heavy Equipment/Specialty (cont'd)

Section 23A: Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
14.00X24 G-2 14781 10 $§ 530.00 | $ 5,300.00 No Bid
14.00R24 VUT 14783 10 $§ 93500 $ 9,350.00 No Bid
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 14785 5 $ 1,126.00 | $ 5,630.00 No Bid
23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 14787 5 $ 1,798.00 | $ 8,990.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 23A: $ 29,270.00 $ -
Section 23B: Generic Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
14.00X24 G-2 15725 5 $§ 530.00[$ 2,650.00 No Bid
14.00R24 VUT 15726 5 § 93500 $ 4,675.00 No Bid
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 15727 2 $ 1,126.00 | $ 2,252.00 No Bid
23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 15728 2 $ 1,798.00 | $ 3,596.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 23B: $ 13,173.00 $ -
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Section 24A: Titan Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
11L-15SL Tru Trac Triple Rib TT F-2 8 ply 14797 12 No Bid No Bid
10.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply 14800 4 No Bid No Bid
11.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply 14802 4 No Bid No Bid
18.4-34 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 14805 No Bid No Bid
13.6-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 14807 No Bid No Bid
12.4-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 14809 12 No Bid No Bid
18.4-30 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 12 ply 14810 12 No Bid No Bid
13.6R24-128 A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 14813 5 No Bid No Bid
14.9R24-120A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 14815 5 No Bid No Bid
13.6-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 14817 8 No Bid No Bid
18.4-34 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 14820 2 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 24A: - -
Section 24B: Generic Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
11L-15SL Tru Trac Triple Rib TT F-2 8 ply 15729 6 No Bid No Bid
10.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply 15730 2 No Bid No Bid
11.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply 15731 2 No Bid No Bid
18.4-34 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 15732 2 No Bid No Bid
13.6-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 15733 4 No Bid No Bid
12.4-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 15734 4 No Bid No Bid
18.4-30 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 12 ply 15735 4 No Bid No Bid
13.6R24-128 A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 15736 2 No Bid No Bid
14.9R24-120A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 15737 2 No Bid No Bid
13.6-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 15738 4 No Bid No Bid
18.4-34 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 15739 2 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 24B: - -
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Trailer/Miscellaneous

Section 25A: Goodyear Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each
ST 225/75R15 14 Ply 15885 20 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 25A: $ - -
Section 25B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply 9379 4 $ 24000 ( $ 960.00 No Bid

6.00X9 industrial 10 ply 9380 4 § 113.00 | $ 452.00 No Bid

8.25X15 Industrial 12 ply 9381 4 $ 39200 ( $ 1,568.00 No Bid

7.00X12 Industrial 10 ply 9382 4 $§ 170.00 | $ 680.00 No Bid

4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply 9383 4 $ 17.00 | $ 68.00 No Bid

410/350-4 9366 4 $ 19.00 | $ 76.00 No Bid

8-14.5 Towmaster Super Hwy 9367 5 $ 95.00 | $ 475.00 No Bid

12X16.5 Super traction 9368 8 $ 23000 $ 1,840.00 No Bid

14/70-20 20 ply roller tire 9369 7 $ 2,100.00 | $ 14,700.00 No Bid

15.5X25 SGGLO 9370 5 § 685.00]| S 3,425.00 No Bid

17.5X25 GGG E2/L-2 9371 5 $ 830.00 | $ 4,150.00 No Bid

14.00X24 G-2 9374 12 $§ 670.00 | $ 8,040.00 No Bid

14.00R24 Bridgestone VUT 9375 8 $ 1,200.00 | $ 9,600.00 No Bid

20.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 9376 5 $ 1,650.00 | $ 8,250.00 No Bid

23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 9377 5 $ 2,200.00 | $ 11,000.00 No Bid

29.5R25 E-3 22 ply 9378 6 $ 5,600.00 | $ 33,600.00 No Bid

13 x 500-8 NHS Turf 9384 2 $§ 22500 $ 450.00 No Bid

23 x 1050-12 NHS Turf 9385 2 $ 96.00 | $ 192.00 No Bid

18 x 750-8 Turf 9386 2 $ 91.00 | $ 182.00 No Bid

7.50R16 LRG Trailer tire 9387 8 § 185.00 | $ 1,480.00 No Bid

ST235/85R16 LRG Trailer 10458 8 $ 199.00 | $ 1,592.00 No Bid

11.4.00-5 15740 2 $ 35.00 | $ 70.00 No Bid

20x8.00-10 11553 2 $ 70.00 | $ 140.00 No Bid

ST205/75R15 LR C 11554 8 $ 88.00 | $ 704.00 No Bid

ST225/75R15 LR D 11555 8 $§ 115.00 | $ 920.00 No Bid

ST225/90D16 LR E, 105 psi Trailer 12024 8 § 185.00 | $ 1,480.00 No Bid
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Section 25B: Generic (cont'd) Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each
20X10.0-10 13155 8 $ 70.00 | $ 560.00 No Bid
18X8.50-8 13156 8 $ 49.00 | $ 392.00 No Bid
7.00-15LT Trailer 13157 8 § 159.00 | $ 1,272.00 No Bid
ST175/80R13 13536 10 $ 69.00 | $ 690.00 No Bid
LT 9.50 - 16.5 LOAD RANGE "E" 13537 10 $§ 165.10 | $ 1,651.00 No Bid
ST175/80R13 13538 10 $ 69.00 | $ 690.00 No Bid
ST 235/80R16 Trailer 13539 10 $§ 129.00 | $ 1,290.00 No Bid
24 X 12.00-12 NHS 13918 10 $§ 139.00 | $ 1,390.00 No Bid
13x6.5-6 13919 10 $ 31.00 | $ 310.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 25B: $ 114,339.00
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Numatic Roller

Section 26A: Galaxy Brand Only, No Subs Lawson Estimated Southern Tire Mart The Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Number Annual Company
Quantity
Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
per Total per Total
Each Each

14/70 =20 20 ply NHS for roller 14804 7 $ 2,100.00 | $ 14,700.00 No Bid

14/70 —20 20 ply NHS for roller, blem 14808 7 $ 2,100.00 | $ 14,700.00 No Bid

11L- 16 Galaxy Workstar F-3 14812 8 $§ 208.00 [ $ 1,664.00 No Bid

23.1-26 R-1 14814 5 $§ 1,699.00 | $ 8,495.00 No Bid

23.1-26 R-3 Diamond 14816 7 $ 1,499.00 | $ 10,493.00 No Bid

19.5L-24 Ez Rider R-4 14818 4 § 739.00 | $ 2,956.00 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 26A: $ 53,008.00 -
Section 26B: Generic Lawson Estimated Bid Price Extended Bid Price Extended
Number Annual per Total per Total
Quantity Each Each

14/70 —20 20 ply NHS for roller 15741 4 $ 2,100.00 | $ 8,400.00 No Bid

14/70 —20 20 ply NHS for roller, blem 15742 4 $ 2,100.00 | $ 8,400.00 No Bid

11L- 16 Galaxy Workstar F-3 15743 2 $ 208.00 [ $ 416.00 No Bid

23.1-26 R-1 15744 2 $ 2,069.11 | $ 4,138.22 No Bid

23.1-26 R-3 Diamond 15745 4 $ 1,499.00 | $ 5,996.00 No Bid

19.5L-24 Ez Rider R-4 15746 2 § 739.00 | $ 1,478.00 No Bid

TOTAL FOR SECTION 26B: $ 28,828.22 -
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