

**Fort Bend County Tabulation
 Bid 23-006
 Term Contract for Bridge Materials**

Term: through March 31, 2023

Awarded 10/25/2022: Conroe Wood Products

10.1 Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top: 12 lb. Creosote (price per each)		
Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Willis, TX Unit Bid Price
50' Piling 12" Butt		No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt		
40' Piling 12" Butt		
35' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 12" Butt		
25' Piling 12" Butt		
20' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 8" Top		
25' Piling 8" Top		
20' Piling 8" Top		
18' Piling 8" Top		
16' Piling 8" Top		
14' Piling 8" Top		
12' Piling 8" Top		

10.2 Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top: 12 lb. Creosote Tested and Certified to AWPA Standards (price per each)		
Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
50' Piling 12" Butt		No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt		
40' Piling 12" Butt		
35' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 12" Butt		
25' Piling 12" Butt		
20' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 8" Top		
25' Piling 8" Top		
20' Piling 8" Top		
18' Piling 8" Top		
16' Piling 8" Top		
14' Piling 8" Top		
12' Piling 8" Top		

**10.3 Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top: 0.60 CCA Treated
(price per each)**

Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
50' Piling 12" Butt		No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt		
40' Piling 12" Butt		
35' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 12" Butt		
25' Piling 12" Butt		
20' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 8" Top		
25' Piling 8" Top		
20' Piling 8" Top		
18' Piling 8" Top		
16' Piling 8" Top		
14' Piling 8" Top		
12' Piling 8" Top		

**10.4 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber
8 lb. Creosote**

Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
2" X 4"-20'		No Bid
2" X 8"-12'		
2" X 8"-14'		
2" X 8"-16'		
2" X 8"-20'		
2" X 8"-24'		
3" X 8"-12'		
3" X 8"-14'		
3" X 8"-16'		
3" X 8"-18'		
3" X 8"-20'		
3" X 8"-22'		
3" X 8"-24'		
3" X 8"-26'		
3" X 8"-28'		
4" X 4"-12'		
4" X 12"-14'		
4" X 12"-16'		
4" X 12"-18'		
6" X 16"-14'		
6" X 16"-16'		
6" X 16"-18'		

**10.5 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber
0.60 CCA Treated
(price per each)**

Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
2" X 4"-20'	10271	\$ 21.47
2" X 8"-12'	10272	\$ 23.65
2" X 8"-14'	10273	\$ 27.59
2" X 8"-16'	10274	\$ 32.70
2" X 8"-20'	10275	\$ 42.93
2" X 8"-24'	10276	\$ 55.04
3" X 8"-12'	10277	\$ 38.11
3" X 8"-14'	10278	\$ 44.46
3" X 8"-16'	10279	\$ 51.52
3" X 8"-18'	10280	\$ 61.13
3" X 8"-20'	10281	\$ 70.12
3" X 8"-22'	10282	\$ 70.84
3" X 8"-24'	10283	\$ 82.56
3" X 8"-26'	10284	\$ 92.56
3" X 8"-28'	10285	\$ 102.48
4" X 4"-12'	10286	\$ 23.65
4" X 12"-14'	10287	\$ 87.70
4" X 12"-16'	10288	\$ 100.22
4" X 12"-18'	10289	\$ 115.13
6" X 16"-14'	10290	\$ 254.24
6" X 16"-16'	10291	\$ 290.56
6" X 16"-18'	10292	\$ 326.88

10.6 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber
0.23 MCA
(price per each)

Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
2" X 4"-20'		No Bid
2" X 8"-12'		
2" X 8"-14'		
2" X 8"-16'		
2" X 8"-20'		
2" X 8"-24'		
3" X 8"-12'		
3" X 8"-14'		
3" X 8"-16'		
3" X 8"-18'		
3" X 8"-20'		
3" X 8"-22'		
3" X 8"-24'		
3" X 8"-26'		
3" X 8"-28'		
4" X 4"-12'		
4" X 12"-14'		
4" X 12"-16'		
4" X 12"-18'		
6" X 16"-14'		
6" X 16"-16'		
6" X 16"-18'		

**10.7 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber
12 lb. Creosote
(price per each)**

Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
8" X 8"-16'		No Bid
8" X 10"-16'		
10" X 10"-14'		
10" X 10"-24'		
10" X 10"-26'		
10" X 10"-28'		
10" X 12"-14'		
10" X 12"-16'		
10" X 12"-24'		
10" X 12"-26'		
10" X 12"-28'		
12" X 12"-16'		
12" X 12"-20'		
12" X 12"-24'		
12" X 12"-26'		
12" X 12"-28'		

**10.8 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber
0.60 CCA Treated
(price per each)**

Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
8" X 8"-16'	10331	\$ 126.12
8" X 10"-16'	10332	\$ 163.52
10" X 10"-14'	10333	\$ 178.85
10" X 10"-24'	10334	\$ 344.00
10" X 10"-26'	10335	\$ 385.67
10" X 10"-28'	10336	\$ 427.00
10" X 12"-14'	10337	\$ 210.70
10" X 12"-16'	10338	\$ 249.60
10" X 12"-24'	10339	\$ 486.72
10" X 12"-26'	10340	\$ 555.88
10" X 12"-28'	10341	\$ 614.04
12" X 12"-16'	10342	\$ 299.52
12" X 12"-20'	10343	\$ 386.40
12" X 12"-24'	10344	\$ 584.06
12" X 12"-26'	10345	\$ 667.06
12" X 12"-28'	10346	\$ 736.85

10.9 Rough Bridge Timber: 0.60 CCA Treated (price per each)		
Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
10" X 12" - 16'	2146	\$ 249.60
4" X 12" - 14'	15897	\$ 87.70
4" X 12" - 16'	2147	\$ 100.22
3" X 8" - 16'	1518	\$ 51.52
2" X 8" - 16'	2149	\$ 32.70

10.10 0.14 MCA Treated materials, No 2 or better S4S Southern Yellow Pine 0.40 (price per each)		
Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
2" X 8" - 16'		No Bid
2" X 6" - 16'		
2" X 6" - 12'		
2" X 6" - 20'		
2" X 4" - 12'		
2" X 4" - 16'		
2" X 4" - 18'		
2" X 4" - 20'		
4" X 4" - 8'		
4" X 4" - 12'		

10.11 0.40 CCA Treated materials, Round Post Southern Yellow Pine (price per each)		
Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
6-1/2' POST - 3-1/2" - 4" Top	2153	\$ 9.74
8' POST - 6" Top	2154	\$ 24.67
8' POST - 7" Top	1525	\$ 34.26
8' POST - 8" Top	2155	\$ 46.51
10' POST - 8" Top	6681	\$ 59.56

**10.12 0.80 CCA Treated Piling materials
(price per each)**

Materials Description	Lawson Number	Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
50' Piling 12" Butt	1526	\$ 483.71
45' Piling 12" Butt	1527	\$ 462.72
40' Piling 12" Butt	1528	\$ 401.93
35' Piling 12" Butt	1529	\$ 375.91
30' Piling 12" Butt	1530	\$ 361.85
25' Piling 12" Butt	1531	\$ 353.44
30' Piling 8" Top		No Bid
25' Piling 8" Top		No Bid
20' Piling 8" Top	1533	\$ 344.06
18' Piling 8" Top	1534	\$ 194.37
16' Piling 8" Top	2157	\$ 186.09
14' Piling 8" Top	2158	\$ 181.64
12' Piling 8" Top	1535	\$ 177.24

**10.13 0.80 Treated Piling materials: 0.80 CCA tested and certified to AWPA standards
(price per each)**

Materials Description		Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price
50' Piling 12" Butt		No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt		
40' Piling 12" Butt		
35' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 12" Butt		
25' Piling 12" Butt		
30' Piling 8" Top		
25' Piling 8" Top		
20' Piling 8" Top		
18' Piling 8" Top		
16' Piling 8" Top		
14' Piling 8" Top		
12' Piling 8" Top		