Fort Bend County Tabulation

BID 24-049

Term Contract for Purchase of Traffic Signs, Posts and Supplies

Term: through March 31, 2025

Awarded 5/14/2024: Lowest Bidder per Section

Core Products, Lightle Enterprises | Osburn Associates . Trantex Transportation Mandel Metals Inc
Canuck Power Inc. . Solar Thingz, Inc . Vulcan, Inc.
Vendor Yuba City, CA LLC of Ohio, LLC Inc. Temecula. CA Products Of Texas, Inc. | dba US Standard Sign Foley, AL
i Covington, LA Frankfort, OH Logan, OH i Houston, TX Carol Stream, IL i
Section 1: No Bid No Bid $ 5,318.00| $ 4,320.00 | $ 12,499.00| $ 10,545.00 No Bid 5,680.00
Complete Signs
Section 2: No Bid No Bid $ 364,013.251 $ 311,330.00( $ 780,905.90( $ 949,055.00( $ 317,406.00 271,700.65
Blanks
Section 3: Posts & Disqualified, Did not No Bid $ 625,935.00 No Bid No Bid $ 616,975.00 No Bid 436,905.00
Accessories-Telespar bid all items in Section
Sign Support System as required.
Section 4: No Bid No Bid $ 273,600.00 No Bid No Bid $ 238,600.00 No Bid No Bid
Construction Supplies
Section 5: No Bid No Bid $ 35,775.00 No Bid No Bid $ 38,925.00 No Bid 24,150.00
Carsonite Products
Section 6: No Bid No Bid $ 4,015,641.25 | Disqualified, Did not No Bid Disqualified, Did not bid No Bid 2,883,146.82
3M Products bid all items in Section all items in Section as
as required. required.
Section 7: Avery No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified, Did not No Bid $ 306,059.00 No Bid 236,208.20
Dennison Products bid all items in Section
as required.
Section 8: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20,406.75
Cutting Knives
Section 9: No Bid 316.57| $ 18,689.58 No Bid No Bid $ 469.00 No Bid 541.75
Banding Materials
Section 10: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6,881.00 No Bid No Bid
Safety Vests
Section 11: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 99,455.00 No Bid No Bid

Miscellaneous




	Recap

