

**Fort Bend County Tabulation
 Bid 25-007
 Term Contract for Bridge Materials**

Term: October 1, 2024 through September 30, 2025

Awarded 8/27/2024: Conroe Wood Products

| 10.1 Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top: 12 lb. Creosote (price per each) | | |
|---|----------------------|--|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Willis, TX Unit Bid Price |
| 50' Piling 12" Butt | | No Bid |
| 45' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 40' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 35' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 30' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 25' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 20' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 30' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 25' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 20' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 18' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 16' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 14' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 12' Piling 8" Top | | |

| 10.2 Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top: 12 lb. Creosote Tested and Certified to AWPA Standards (price per each) | | |
|--|----------------------|--|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Willis, TX Unit Bid Price |
| 50' Piling 12" Butt | | No Bid |
| 45' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 40' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 35' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 30' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 25' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 20' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 30' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 25' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 20' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 18' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 16' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 14' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 12' Piling 8" Top | | |

| 10.3 Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top: 0.60 CCA Treated (price per each) | | |
|--|--------------------------|---|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 50' Piling 12" Butt | 10238 | \$ 621.00 |
| 45' Piling 12" Butt | 10239 | \$ 580.00 |
| 40' Piling 12" Butt | 10240 | \$ 520.00 |
| 35' Piling 12" Butt | 10241 | \$ 503.00 |
| 30' Piling 12" Butt | 10242 | \$ 486.00 |
| 25' Piling 12" Butt | 10243 | \$ 468.00 |
| 20' Piling 12" Butt | 10244 | \$ 293.00 |
| 30' Piling 8" Top | 10245 | \$ 227.00 |
| 25' Piling 8" Top | 10246 | \$ 207.00 |
| 20' Piling 8" Top | 10247 | \$ 158.16 |
| 18' Piling 8" Top | 10248 | \$ 140.24 |
| 16' Piling 8" Top | 10249 | \$ 120.95 |
| 14' Piling 8" Top | 10250 | \$ 114.17 |
| 12' Piling 8" Top | 10251 | \$ 81.90 |

| 10.4 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber 8 lb. Creosote (price per each) | | |
|--|--------------------------|---|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 2" X 4"-20' | | No Bid |
| 2" X 8"-12' | | No Bid |
| 2" X 8"-14' | | No Bid |
| 2" X 8"-16' | | No Bid |
| 2" X 8"-20' | | No Bid |
| 2" X 8"-24' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-12' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-14' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-16' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-18' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-20' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-22' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-24' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-26' | | No Bid |
| 3" X 8"-28' | | No Bid |
| 4" X 4"-12' | | No Bid |
| 4" X 12"-14' | | No Bid |
| 4" X 12"-16' | | No Bid |
| 4" X 12"-18' | | No Bid |
| 6" X 16"-14' | | No Bid |
| 6" X 16"-16' | | No Bid |
| 6" X 16"-18' | | No Bid |

| 10.5 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber 0.60 CCA Treated (price per each) | | |
|--|--------------------------|---|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 2" X 4"-20' | 10271 | \$ 21.40 |
| 2" X 8"-12' | 10272 | \$ 22.72 |
| 2" X 8"-14' | 10273 | \$ 26.55 |
| 2" X 8"-16' | 10274 | \$ 31.68 |
| 2" X 8"-20' | 10275 | \$ 43.75 |
| 2" X 8"-24' | 10276 | \$ 57.95 |
| 3" X 8"-12' | 10277 | \$ 30.50 |
| 3" X 8"-14' | 10278 | \$ 35.56 |
| 3" X 8"-16' | 10279 | \$ 41.60 |
| 3" X 8"-18' | 10280 | \$ 47.52 |
| 3" X 8"-20' | 10281 | \$ 55.60 |
| 3" X 8"-22' | 10282 | \$ 70.40 |
| 3" X 8"-24' | 10283 | \$ 81.60 |
| 3" X 8"-26' | 10284 | \$ 95.45 |
| 3" X 8"-28' | 10285 | \$ 106.15 |
| 4" X 4"-12' | 10286 | \$ 23.40 |
| 4" X 12"-14' | 10287 | \$ 84.56 |
| 4" X 12"-16' | 10288 | \$ 96.64 |
| 4" X 12"-18' | 10289 | \$ 112.68 |
| 6" X 16"-14' | 10290 | \$ 271.55 |
| 6" X 16"-16' | 10291 | \$ 310.50 |
| 6" X 16"-18' | 10292 | \$ 349.95 |

| 10.6 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber | | |
|--|----------------------|---|
| 0.23 MCA | | |
| (price per each) | | |
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 2" X 4"-20' | | No Bid |
| 2" X 8"-12' | | |
| 2" X 8"-14' | | |
| 2" X 8"-16' | | |
| 2" X 8"-20' | | |
| 2" X 8"-24' | | |
| 3" X 8"-12' | | |
| 3" X 8"-14' | | |
| 3" X 8"-16' | | |
| 3" X 8"-18' | | |
| 3" X 8"-20' | | |
| 3" X 8"-22' | | |
| 3" X 8"-24' | | |
| 3" X 8"-26' | | |
| 3" X 8"-28' | | |
| 4" X 4"-12' | | |
| 4" X 12"-14' | | |
| 4" X 12"-16' | | |
| 4" X 12"-18' | | |
| 6" X 16"-14' | | |
| 6" X 16"-16' | | |
| 6" X 16"-18' | | |

| 10.7 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber | | |
|--|----------------------|---|
| 12 lb. Creosote | | |
| (price per each) | | |
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 8" X 8"-16' | | No Bid |
| 8" X 10"-16' | | |
| 10" X 10"-14' | | |
| 10" X 10"-24' | | |
| 10" X 10"-26' | | |
| 10" X 10"-28' | | |
| 10" X 12"-14' | | |
| 10" X 12"-16' | | |
| 10" X 12"-24' | | |
| 10" X 12"-26' | | |
| 10" X 12"-28' | | |
| 12" X 12"-16' | | |
| 12" X 12"-20' | | |
| 12" X 12"-24' | | |
| 12" X 12"-26' | | |
| 12" X 12"-28' | | |

| 10.8 No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber 0.60 CCA Treated (price per each) | | |
|--|--------------------------|---|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 8" X 8"-16' | 10331 | \$ 112.64 |
| 8" X 10"-16' | 10332 | \$ 154.67 |
| 10" X 10"-14' | 10333 | \$ 157.80 |
| 10" X 10"-24' | 10334 | \$ 346.00 |
| 10" X 10"-26' | 10335 | \$ 413.83 |
| 10" X 10"-28' | 10336 | \$ 460.83 |
| 10" X 12"-14' | 10337 | \$ 203.00 |
| 10" X 12"-16' | 10338 | \$ 232.00 |
| 10" X 12"-24' | 10339 | \$ 458.40 |
| 10" X 12"-26' | 10340 | \$ 539.50 |
| 10" X 12"-28' | 10341 | \$ 602.00 |
| 12" X 12"-16' | 10342 | \$ 268.80 |
| 12" X 12"-20' | 10343 | \$ 415.20 |
| 12" X 12"-24' | 10344 | \$ 532.80 |
| 12" X 12"-26' | 10345 | \$ 628.68 |
| 12" X 12"-28' | 10346 | \$ 698.88 |

| 10.9 Rough Bridge Timber: 0.60 CCA Treated (price per each) | | |
|--|--------------------------|---|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 10" X 12" - 16' | 2146 | \$ 232.00 |
| 4" X 12" - 14' | 15897 | \$ 84.56 |
| 4" X 12" - 16' | 2147 | \$ 96.64 |
| 3" X 8" - 16' | 1518 | \$ 41.60 |
| 2" X 8" - 16' | 2149 | \$ 31.68 |

**10.10 0.14 MCA Treated materials, No 2 or better S4S Southern Yellow Pine 0.40
(price per each)**

| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
|------------------------------|----------------------|---|
| 2" X 8" - 16' | | No Bid |
| 2" X 6" - 16' | | |
| 2" X 6" - 12' | | |
| 2" X 6" - 20' | | |
| 2" X 4" - 12' | | |
| 2" X 4" - 16' | | |
| 2" X 4" - 18' | | |
| 2" X 4" - 20' | | |
| 4" X 4" - 8' | | |
| 4" X 4" - 12' | | |

**10.11 0.40 CCA Treated materials, Round Post Southern Yellow Pine
(price per each)**

| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
|-------------------------------|----------------------|---|
| 6-1/2' POST - 3-1/2" - 4" Top | 2153 | \$ 10.85 |
| 8' POST - 6" Top | 2154 | \$ 25.55 |
| 8' POST - 7" Top | 1525 | \$ 36.36 |
| 8' POST - 8" Top | 2155 | \$ 48.08 |
| 10' POST - 8" Top | 6681 | \$ 63.21 |

| 10.12 0.80 CCA Treated Piling materials (price per each) | | |
|---|--------------------------|---|
| Materials Description | Lawson Number | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 50' Piling 12" Butt | 1526 | \$ 621.00 |
| 45' Piling 12" Butt | 1527 | \$ 580.00 |
| 40' Piling 12" Butt | 1528 | \$ 520.00 |
| 35' Piling 12" Butt | 1529 | \$ 503.00 |
| 30' Piling 12" Butt | 1530 | \$ 486.00 |
| 25' Piling 12" Butt | 1531 | \$ 468.00 |
| 30' Piling 8" Top | 1532 | \$ 293.00 |
| 25' Piling 8" Top | 16308 | \$ 227.00 |
| 20' Piling 8" Top | 1533 | \$ 182.00 |
| 18' Piling 8" Top | 1534 | \$ 160.00 |
| 16' Piling 8" Top | 2157 | \$ 143.00 |
| 14' Piling 8" Top | 2158 | \$ 128.00 |
| 12' Piling 8" Top | 1535 | \$ 95.00 |

| 10.13 0.80 Treated Piling materials: 0.80 CCA tested and certified to AWPA standards (price per each) | | |
|--|--|---|
| Materials Description | | Conroe Wood Products, Unit Bid Price |
| 50' Piling 12" Butt | | No Bid |
| 45' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 40' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 35' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 30' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 25' Piling 12" Butt | | |
| 30' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 25' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 20' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 18' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 16' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 14' Piling 8" Top | | |
| 12' Piling 8" Top | | |