

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 26-049
Term Contract for Purchase of Weed, Brush and Insect Control Chemicals

Term: through March 31, 2027

Awarded 7/16/2026: Lowest Bidder per item

Herbicides										
Item #1: 2, 4-D Amine Full Aquatic Label	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8879	NO BID	\$50.75	\$47.80	\$50.15	\$40.00	\$52.15 container	\$57.60 / jug	NO BID	\$51.50
30 gallon container	8880	NO BID	\$609.00	\$540.00	\$579.30	\$472.50	\$552.00 container	NO BID	NO BID	\$599.40
Item #2: Arsenal EUP, Habitat, Polaris (Aquatic)	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8903	NO BID	\$128.72	\$140.95	\$159.00	\$130.00	\$128.50 container	\$169.00 / jug	\$178.82	\$132.50
5 gallon container	9678	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$260.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15 gallon container	8904	NO BID	\$768.75	NO BID	NO BID	\$735.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
30 gallon container	9679	NO BID	\$1,537.50	\$1,725.00	NO BID	\$1,470.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
250 gallon container	9680	NO BID	\$12,750.00	\$13,680.00	\$15,337.50	\$12,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item #3: Dupont Oust Extra	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
4 pound container	8910	NO BID	\$127.20	\$99.50	\$144.96	\$90.60	\$103.92 container	\$172.80 / cont.	NO BID	\$128.80
12 pound container	8911	NO BID	\$381.60	NO BID	NO BID	\$271.80	\$311.76 container	NO BID	Vendor withdrew item	NO BID
Item #4: Escort	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 oz. container	8920	NO BID	\$18.40	NO BID	\$18.80	\$12.96	\$15.84 container	NO BID	\$21.03	\$23.12
16 oz. container	8921	NO BID	\$36.80	\$28.00	\$37.60	\$25.92	\$31.36 container	\$66.56 / cont.	NO BID	\$46.24
64 oz. container	9684	NO BID	\$144.00	\$112.00	NO BID	\$103.68	\$124.16 container	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item #5: Garlon 3A	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8930	NO BID	\$133.12	\$100.85	\$109.48	\$72.50	\$122.50 container	\$136.10 / jug	\$106.32	\$123.75
30 gallon container	8932	NO BID	\$1,597.50	\$1,210.00	\$1,313.70	\$840.00	\$1,470.00 container	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,476.00
Item #6: Garlon 4 Ultra	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	14140	NO BID	\$174.75	\$154.10	\$153.20	\$89.38	\$161.05 container	\$137.30 / jug	\$140.56	\$162.13

Item #7: Glyphosate 41%+14% Surfactant	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8942	NO BID	\$43.35	\$39.45	\$43.93	\$28.98	\$43.00 container	\$48.25 / jug	\$47.34	\$45.75
30 gallon container	8943	NO BID	\$499.50	\$436.65	\$504.30	\$342.00	\$493.20 container	\$526.80 / drum	\$558.23	\$543.00
265 gallon container	9688	NO BID	\$4,226.75	\$3,784.45 (260 gallon tote)	\$4,271.80	\$3,021.00	\$4,171.10 container	\$4,467.90 / tote	\$5,942.47	\$4,796.50
Item #8: MSMA 6 Plus 47.60% Active	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8953	NO BID	\$85.15	\$58.75	\$99.25	\$64.88	\$86.50 container	\$93.50 / jug	\$101.11	\$105.00
Item #9: Outrider	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
20 oz. container	8961	NO BID	\$293.00	\$208.00	\$264.80	\$194.80	\$220.00 container	NO BID	\$362.95	\$216.00
Item #10: Pro-Mate Accuracy 30%	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 quart container	8966	NO BID	\$12.75	\$11.00	NO BID	\$9.90	\$12.28 container	NO BID	\$197.24	NO BID
Item #11: Roundup Pro Concentrate 50.2% Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate-complete with performance technology surfactant	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8974	NO BID	\$51.50	\$45.00	\$53.18	\$37.38	\$48.00 container	\$60.75 / jug	\$61.11	\$54.50
30 gallon container	8975	NO BID	\$595.20	\$523.35	\$631.80	\$397.50	\$552.90 container	\$729.00 / drum	\$702.82	\$645.00
265 gallon container	New	NO BID	\$4,608.35	\$4,535.55	\$5,334.45	\$3,484.75	\$4,674.60 container	\$6,285.80 / tote	\$5,941.60	\$5,618.00
Item #12: Surfactant: Nonionic Surfactant Load: 70% HLB Ratio: 12, Antifoam Index: 3	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8989	NO BID	\$45.00	\$45.45	\$30.65	\$21.25	\$28.50 container	NO BID	\$41.47	NO BID

Item #13: Tordon 22K	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	8994	NO BID	\$155.50	\$79.15	\$181.78	\$94.88	\$138.50 container	NO BID	NO BID	\$162.00
30 gallon container	16137	NO BID	\$1,866.00	\$950.00	\$2,181.30	\$960.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,938.00
Item #14: Opensight by Bayer AgroScience	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
20 oz bottle container	9010	NO BID	\$131.87	\$131.88	\$155.50	\$131.80	\$131.875 container	\$131.88 / cont.	\$181.52	\$131.88
Item #15: DLZ-MSO Surfactant Plus Drift, No Subs	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	10461	NO BID	\$60.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.13	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item #16: Hardball, 2,4-D Acid, No Subs	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	10462	NO BID	\$90.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$75.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
30 gallon container	10463	NO BID	\$1,050.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$870.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item #17: Plateau	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 gallon container	11505	NO BID	\$97.49	\$93.80	\$123.53	\$88.99	\$95.98 container	\$133.67 / gallon	\$138.32	\$116.00
Item #18: Vastlan	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	13128	NO BID	\$262.50	\$262.50	\$262.50	\$231.00	\$262.50 container	\$262.50 / jug	\$145.85	\$262.50

Item #19: Trycera Selective Herbicide, No Subs	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	13121	NO BID	\$222.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$250.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
265 gallon container	14356	NO BID	\$22,260.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$26,235.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item #20: Dow Frequency, Bareground Herbicide	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 gallon container	10474	NO BID	\$732.00	\$591.35	\$611.42	\$675.00	\$679.00 container	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item #21: Roundup Custom	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	14141	NO BID	\$56.70	\$61.35	\$73.23	\$51.88	\$59.95 container	\$70.40 / jug	\$78.96	\$64.63
Item #22: Method 240SL	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	13126	NO BID	\$931.20	\$931.20	\$912.00	\$912.00	\$931.20 container	\$931.20 / jug	\$1,119.87	\$931.20
Item #23: Derigo (by Bayer Environmental Science)	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
60 ounce container	14142	NO BID	\$592.80	\$592.80	\$581.40	\$193.80	\$592.80 container	\$592.80 / cont.	NO BID	\$592.80
Item #24: 1% Solution, Drift Control Agent	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 gallon container	10468	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.00	NO BID	\$9.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.62	NO BID
2.5 gallon container	10469	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.38	\$24.45 container	NO BID	\$66.10	NO BID
Item #25: Liberate by Loveland Products, Inc.	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	12054	NO BID	NO BID	\$48.80	\$69.28	\$41.88	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.43	NO BID

Item #26: Esplanade, No Subs	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
4 quarts (1 gallon container)	16141	NO BID	\$1,694.72	\$1,694.72/ 4qt case	NO BID	\$415.36	\$423.68 per quart	\$423.68 / quart	NO BID	\$1,694.72
10 quarts (2.5 gallon container)	16142	NO BID	\$3,849.60	\$3,849.60	\$3,772.80	\$1,038.40	\$3,849.60 container	\$1,539.84/gal	\$4,695.91	\$3,849.60
Item #27: TerraVue, No Subs	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1.1 lb. container	New	NO BID	\$120.45	\$120.45	\$120.45	\$120.38	\$120.45 container	\$481.80 / 4.4 lb container	NO BID	\$120.45
Item #28: Compadre	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	NO BID	\$15.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.45	NO BID
2.5 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.64	NO BID
Item #29: Reign LC	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	\$45.00	\$47.65	\$9.99	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.5 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.98	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Item #30: Strike Lock	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$44.88	NO BID	NO BID	\$57.13	NO BID
Item #31: Justified (Helena)	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	New	NO BID	\$127.50	\$48.80	NO BID	\$25.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$71.40	NO BID
Item #32: Big Foot Dye SS	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 quart container	New	NO BID	\$21.00	\$24.00	\$30.94	NO BID	\$12.00 quart Quoting elite splendor SS	\$12.43 / quart	\$16.45	NO BID

Insecticides										
Item #33: Altosid Briquettes (Mosquito Larvicide and Pupicide)	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 case/400	8890	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$572.00	\$572.00	NO BID
Item #34: Altosid XR (Mosquito Larvicide and Pupicide)	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
1 case/220	8891	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$893.20 / case	\$866.80	NO BID
Item #35: Evoluer 4-4 ULV (Permethrin 4% Piperonyl Butoxide 4%) or equivalent	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
30 gallon container	8924	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$625.89	NO BID
minimum order									\$1.00	
returnable									NA	
Brand Bid									Kontrol 4-4	
55 gallon container	8925	\$1,159.95/drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,347.50 / drum	\$1,134.59	NO BID
minimum order		55 gallon drum						55 gallon drum	\$1.00	
returnable		No						No	NA	
Brand Bid		PermaSease 4-4						CSI 4-4	Kontrol 4-4	
250 gallon container	8926	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order										
returnable										
Brand Bid										
275 gallon container	8927	\$5,486.25/tote	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6,655.00 / tote	\$5,571.84	NO BID
minimum order		275 gallon tote						275 gallon tote	\$1.00	
returnable		No						No	YES	
Brand Bid		PermaSease 4-4						CSI 4-4	Kontrol 4-4	
Item #36: PyreNone 25-5 (Pyrethrins 5% Piperonyl Butoxide 25%), or equivalent	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
30 gallon container	8970	\$6,508.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6,670.20 / drum	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order		30 gallon Drum						5 x 30 gallon drums		
returnable		Yes						No		
Brand Bid		Evergreen 5-25						Evergreen ULV 5-25 Ground		
55 gallon container	16426	\$11,260.70/drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11,542.30 / drum	\$12,456.56	NO BID
minimum order		55 gallon Drum						4 x 55 gallon drums	\$1.00	
returnable		Yes						No	NA	
Brand Bid		Evergreen 5-25						Evergreen ULV 5-25 Ground	Evergreen Ground 525	

Item #37: Dibrom (Naled), or equivalent	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
30 gallon container	16399	\$9,286.80/drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8,760.00 / drum	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order		30 gallon Drum						30 gallon drum		
returnable		Yes, 8 drum minimum to return						Yes		
Brand Bid		Dibrom Concentrate						Imperium		
55 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order										
returnable										
Brand Bid										
250 gallon container	16400	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$72,500.00 / tote	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order								250 gallon tote		
returnable								Yes		
Brand Bid								Imperium		
275 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order										
returnable										
Brand Bid										

Item #38: Fyfanon ULV (96.5% malathion), or equivalent	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
55 gallon container	16396	\$5,167.25/drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order		55 gl drum								
returnable		Yes, 4 drum minimum								
Brand Bid		Fyfanon ULV								
260 gallon container	New	\$23,363.60/tote	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order		260 gallon tote								
returnable		Yes, one tote								
Brand Bid		Fyfanon ULV								
Item #39: Vectobac WDG, or equivalent	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
25 lb. container	New	\$1,171.50/drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$750.00 / pail	NO BID	NO BID
minimum order		25 lb drum						25 lb pail		
Brand Bid		Vectobac WDG - OMRI						Fallout WDG		

Item #40: Altosid Liquid SR-20	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC. Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC. Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Veseris Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	16408	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,766.50 / jug	\$2,213.20	NO BID
minimum order								2 x 2.5 gallon jugs	\$2.00	
5 gallon container	16409	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,533.00	\$5,533.00	NO BID
minimum order								2 x 2.5 gallon jugs	\$1.00	

[illegible]

Item #44: ReMoa Tri (Abamectin, Fenpropathrin, C8910)	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container	New	\$787.50/jug	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum order		2x2.5 gl case								
Returnable		No								
Brand bid		Remoa Tri								
30 gallon container	New	\$9,000.00/drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum order		30 gl drum								
Returnable		Yes, 4 drum minimum								
Brand bid		Remoa Tri								
55 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum order										
Returnable										
Brand bid										
250 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum order										
Returnable										
Brand bid										
275 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum order										
Returnable										
Brand bid										

Item #45: DeltaGuard (2% Deltamethrin) or equivalent	Lawson Number	Adapco LLC, Lake Mary, FL	Marubeni America Corporation dba Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Waller, TX	Nutrien Ag Solutions Inc Houston, TX	Opterra Solutions, Inc Lexington, SC	Orion Solutions LLC Rocky Mount, VA	Red River Specialties LLC, Shreveport, LA	Rentokil North American Inc. dba Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	ES OPCO USA LLC dba Vesperis Chicago, IL	Asplundh Tree Expert LLC dba VM Distribution Partners Atlanta, GA
30 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8,760.00 / drum	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum order								30 gallon drum		
Returnable								Yes		
Brand bid								DeltaGard and		
55 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12,540.00	NO BID
Minimum order									\$1.00	
Returnable									Yes	
Brand bid									Duovex	
250 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$72,500.00 / tote	NO BID	NO BID
Minimum order								250 gallon tote		
Returnable								Yes		
Brand bid								DeltaGard and Imperium		
275 gallon container	New	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$62,700.00	NO BID
Minimum order									\$1.00	
Returnable									Yes	
Brand bid									Duovex	

*Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. Disqualified due to providing incorrect pricing form