Fort Bend County Tabulation
RFQ 2015-05
Dumpster Rental

Term: 1 October 2014 through 30 September 2015
Term: 1 October 2015 through 30 September 2016
Awarded to: Republic Waste

Dumpster - Monthly Rental Fee

For
Weekly Service
Dumpster Size Location Lawson # |Estimated Republic Waste Sprint Waste
and Annual Fvoamiv Rental | Extended | Monthly Rental| Extended
Description Quantity o e o B
Servicing Price Servicing Price

Front load, 4 |Katy Branch
yard 2620 Commercial Center

Blvd. Katy TX 77494 5954 12 $ 73.00 | $ 876.00 No Bid NA
Frontload, 6 [North End Annex
yard 22333 Grand Corner Dr.

Katy Texas 77494 9421 12 $ 86.00 | $ 1,032.00 No Bid NA
Front load, 4 |Fulshear Branch
yard 8100 F.M. 359 South

Fulshear TX 77441 5956 12 $ 73.00 | $ 876.00 No Bid NA
Front load, 2  |Albert George Branch
yard 9230 Gene Street

Needville TX 77461 9424 12 $ 32.00 [ $ 384.00 No Bid NA
Frontload, 6 |Parks Department
yard 2725 F.M. 521 North

Fresno TX 77545 5961 12 $ 86.00 [ $ 1,032.00 No Bid NA
2 each - Crabb Service Center
Front load, 8  |201 Payne Lane/FM 762
vard Richmond TX 77469 5962 12 $ 110.00 | $ 1,320.00 No Bid NA
Frontload, 4 |Road & Bridge
yard 4310 FM 2218

Richmond TX 77469 9868 12 $ 73.00 | $ 876.00 No Bid NA
Front load, 4 |Gordon Ranch

Richmond TX 77469 11408 12 $ 73.00 | $ 876.00 No Bid NA
Frontload, 6 |Juvenile Leadership
yard 400 Coen Road

Rosharon TX 9718 12 $ 86.00 | $ 1,032.00 No Bid NA
Frontload, 2 [Mamie George Branch
yard 320 Dulles Avenue

Stafford TX 77477 5958 12 $ 32.00 | $ 384.00 No Bid NA
Frontload, 6 |5th Street Community
yard Center

3110 Fifth Street

Stafford Texas 77477 8786 12 $ 86.00 | $ 1,032.00 No Bid NA
Front load, 8 |Four Corners Park
yard **(September-April)**

15700 Old Richmond Road

Stafford TX 77477 5960 8 $ 110.00 | $ 880.00 No Bid NA




Dumpster - Monthly Rental Fee

For
Bi-Weekly Service
Dumpster Size Location Lawson # |Estimated Republic Waste Sprint Waste
and Annual Fvonmiv Rental | Extended | Monthly Rental| Extended
Description Quantity and Price and Price
Servicing Price Servicing Price
Front load, 8 |Four Corners Park
yard **(May-August)**
15700 Old Richmond Road
Stafford TX 77477 5964 4 3 110.00 | $ 440.00 No Bid NA
Roll off, 40 Crabb Service Center
yard 201 Payne Lane/FM 762
Richmond TX 77469 5965 12 $ 385.00 | $ 4,620.00 | $ 400.00 [ $4,800.00
Roll off, 40 Beechnut Office
yard 19310 Beechnut
Richmond TX 77469 5966 12 $ 385.00 | $ 4,620.00 | $ 400.00 [ $4,800.00
Total per month for all locations:| $ 1,800.00 $ 800.00
Annual Total:[ $20,280.00 | Annual Total: | $9,600.00

Texas Disposal Systems, Inc. - Disqualified: Vendor altered Terms & Conditions
WCA Waste Corporation - Disqualified: Did not provide Excel file of pricing, and altered specifications
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