
Emergency Medical Service                                  Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

EMS Support Vehicles Front Fenders 11054 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Front Fender 11055 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Driver Door 11056 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Passenger Door 11057 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Driver Side Door 11058 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Passenger Side Door 11059 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Quarter Panels 11060 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Quarter Panel 11061 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Deck Lid 11062 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

EMS Support Vehicles Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

EMS Support Vehicles Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11064 1 80.00$            

EMS Support Vehicles EMS Support Vehicle Full Decal Set 11065 2 ** $   1,422.40

EMS Support Vehicles SUV Rear Set 11066 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Crown Victoria Rear Set 11067 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Design set-up Fee 11063 1 320.00$          

EMS Ambulance Front Fenders 11068 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Front Fender 11069 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Driver Door 11070 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Passenger Door 11071 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Driver Side 11072 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Passenger Side 11073 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Front 11074 1 70.00$            

Renewal Term:  1 October 2015 through 30 September 2016

*** Amended 8.14.18,  ** Amended 10.04.16,  *Amended 9.22.15

No Bid

Awarded 10/28/14:  OnSiteDecals, LLC

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 15-023

Term:  1 November 2014 through 30 September 2015
Vehicle Graphics

Renewal Term:  1 October 2017 through 30 September 2018
Renewal Term Approved 7/10/18:  1 October 2018 through 30 September 2019

Renewal Term:  1 October 2016 through 30 September 2017



Emergency Medical Service                                  Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

EMS Ambulance Module Rear Right Door 11075 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Rear Left Door 11076 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Deck Lid 11077 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Unit Number Set 11078 1 30.00$            

EMS Ambulance Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

EMS Ambulance Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11080 1 80.00$            

EMS Ambulance EMS Ambulance Full Decal Set 11081 4 ** $   3,140.00

EMS Ambulance Design set-up Fee 11079 4 320.00$          

EMS Squad Truck Driver Door 11082 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Passenger Door 11083 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Rear Driver Side Door 11084 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Rear Passenger Side Door 11085 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Rear Quarter Panels 11086 1 * $        274.48

EMS Squad Truck Rear Quarter Panel 11087 1 * $        274.48

EMS Squad Truck Deck Lid 11088 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

EMS Squad Truck Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

EMS Squad Truck Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11090 1 80.00$            

EMS Squad Truck Squad Truck Full Decal Set 11091 1 ** $  1,422.40

EMS Squad Truck Design set-up Fee 11089 1 320.00$          

EMS Roof Unit Number Only 13443 1 *** $       80.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

No Bid



Constable Precinct 1 Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 1 Front Fenders 11092 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Front Fender 11093 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Driver Door 11094 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Passenger Door 11095 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Driver Side Door 11096 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Passenger Side Door 11097 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Quarter Panels 11098 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Quarter Panel 11099 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Deck Lid 11100 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Set 11101 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 1 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 1 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11103 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Constable 1 Full Decal Set 11104
3

** $    500.00

Constable Precinct 1 Design set-up Fee 11102 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 1 Roof Unit Number Only 13444 1 *** $     80.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

No Bid



Constable Precinct 2 Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 2 Front Fenders 11105 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Front Fender 11106 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Driver Door 11107 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Passenger Door 11108 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Driver Side Door 11109 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Passenger Side Door 11110 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Quarter Panels 11111 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Quarter Panel 11112 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Deck Lid 11113 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Set 11114 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 2 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 2 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11116 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Constable 2 Full Decal Set 11117 2 ** $    500.00

Constable Precinct 2 Design set-up Fee 11115 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 2 Roof Unit Number Only 13445 1 *** $     80.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

No Bid



Constable Precinct 3 Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 3 Front Fenders 11118 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Front Fender 11119 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Driver Door 11120 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Passenger Door 11121 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Driver Side Door 11122 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Passenger Side Door 11123 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Quarter Panels 11124 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Quarter Panel 11125 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Deck Lid 11126 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Set 11127 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 3 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 3 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11129 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Constable 3 Full Decal Set 11130 1 ** $    500.00

Constable Precinct 3 Design set-up Fee 11128 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 3 Roof Unit Number Only 13446 1 *** $     80.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

No Bid



Constable Precinct 4                                  Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 4 Front Fenders 11131 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Front Fender 11132 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Driver Door 11133 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Passenger Door 11134 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Driver Side Door 11135 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Passenger Side Door 11136 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Quarter Panels 11137 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Quarter Panel 11138 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Deck Lid 11139 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Set 11140 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 4 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 4 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11142 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Constable 4 Full Decal Set 11143 4 ** $   500.00

Constable Precinct 4 Design set-up Fee 11141 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 4 Roof Unit Number Only 13447 1 *** $     80.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

No Bid

OnsiteDecals, LLC 



Sheriff's Office Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders 11144 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender 11145 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders 2 " Subdivision Name 11819 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender 2 " Subdivision Name 11820 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders 2 " Mud 11821 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender 2 " Mud 11822 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Driver Door 11146 4 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Passenger Door 11147 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Driver Side Door 11148 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Passenger Side Door 11149 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panels 11150 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panel 11151 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Truck Front Fender, Livestock 11152 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Truck Passenger Door, Livestock 11153 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Truck Rear Passenger Door, Livestock  11154 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Truck Rear Quarter Panel, Livestock 11155 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Trailer Full Decal Set 11823 1 ** $     140.00

Sheriff's Office Trailer Sides 11824 1 15.00$            

Sheriff's Office Trailer Side 11825 1 15.00$            

Sheriff's Office Trailer Back Decals 11826 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Trailer Back Decal 11827 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Deck Lid 11156 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Set 11157 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

OnsiteDecals, LLC 
Estimated 

Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                
Quantity 

No Bid



Sheriff's Office (cont'd) Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Sheriff's Office Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11159 1 80.00$            

Sheriff's Office Magnetic Patch 11160 1 25.00$            

Sheriff's Office Roof Unit Numbers 18" 11161 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Windshield Numbers 1 1/2" 11828 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Windshield 3" Letters 11162 1 10.00$            

Sheriff's Office Sheriff's Office Full Decal Set Color 11163
20

** $    500.00

Sheriff's Office Design set-up Fee 11158 1 320.00$          

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders Ghost 11164 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender Ghost 11165 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Driver Door Ghost 11166 4 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Passenger Door Ghost 11167 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Driver Side Door Ghost 11168 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Passenger Side Door Ghost 11169 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panels Ghost 11170 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panel Ghost 11171 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Set Ghost 11172 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Unit Number Ghost 11829 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Title Classificiation Ghost 11830 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Magnetic Patch Ghost 11173 1 25.00$            

Sheriff's Office Roof Unit Numbers 18" Ghost 11174 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Ghost Full Set 12422 1 ** $     500.00

Sheriff's Office Roof Unit Number Only 13448 1 *** $     80.00

Sheriff's Office Van Front Fender 13449 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Front Fender 13450 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Driver Door 13451 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Passenger Door 13452 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Rear Driver Side Door 13453 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Rear Passenger Side Door 13454 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Rear Quarter Panel Driver's Side 13455 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Rear Quarter Panel Passenger Side 13456 1 *** $       50.00

OnsiteDecals, LLC 
Estimated 

Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                
Quantity 

No Bid



Sheriff's Office (cont'd) Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Sheriff's Office Van Decklid 13457 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Unit Number 13458 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Van Roof Unit Numbers 18" 13459 1 *** $       50.00

Sheriff's Office Van Windshield 3" Letters 13460 1 *** $       10.00

Sheriff's Office Van Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 13461 1 *** $       80.00

Sheriff's Office Van Full Decal Set Color or Ghost 13462 1 *** $      500.00

No Bid

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 



Office of Emergency 
Management

Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

OEM Autos Front Fender 11176 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Driver Door 11177 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Passenger Door 11178 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Rear Driver Side Door 11179 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Rear Passenger Side Door 11180 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic & SUV Rear Quarter Panels 11181 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic & SUV Rear Quarter Panel 11182 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic Rear Set 11183 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic Full Decal Set 11184 1 ** $     500.00

OEM Truck Rear Quarter Panels 11185 1 50.00$            

OEM Truck Rear Quarter Panel 11186 1 50.00$            

OEM Truck & SUV Rear Set 11187 1 50.00$            

OEM Truck & SUV Full Decal Set 11188 1 ** $     500.00

OEM Autos Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

OEM CERT Trailer Full Decal Set 11190 1 360.00$          

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Driver Side 11191 1 120.00$          

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Passenger Side 11192 1 120.00$          

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Front 11193 1 60.00$            

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Rear 11194 1 60.00$            

OEM MVDR Unit 1 Full Decal Set 11195 1 **   $ 2030.00

OEM MVDR Unit 1 MVDR Unit 1 Trailer Driver Side 11197 1 810.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 1 MVDR Unit 1 Trailer Passenger Side 11198 1 810.00$          

OEM Design Setup Fee 11831 1 320.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 Full Decal Set 11202 1 **   $ 2030.00

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Driver Side 11203 1 810.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Passenger Side 11204 1 810.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Front 11205 1 180.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Rear 11206 1 180.00$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Driver Side 11207 1 517.50$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Passenger Side 11208 1 517.50$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Front 11209 1 172.50$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Rear 11210 1 172.50$          

OEM Roof Unit Number Only 13463 1 *** $      80.00

OnsiteDecals, LLC 
Estimated 

Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                
Quantity 

No Bid



Fire Marshal Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Fire Marshal Small Markings Rear Quarter Panel Driver's Side 13464 1 *** $      90.00

Fire Marshal Small Markings Rear Quarter Panel Passenger Side 13465 1 *** $      90.00

Fire Marshal Small Markings Decklid 13466 1 *** $      9.00

Fire Marshal Small Markings Unit Number 13467 1 No Charge

Fire Marshal Small Markings Title Classificiation 13468 1 No Charge

Fire Marshal Small Markings Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 13469 1 *** $      80.00

Fire Marshal Small Markings FBCFMO Vehicle Full Decal Set 13470 1 *** $      270.00

Fire Marshal Full Markings Front Fender 13471 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Front Fender 13472 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Driver Door 13473 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Passenger Door 13474 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Rear Driver's Side Door 13475 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Rear Passenger Side Door 13476 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Rear Quarter Panel Driver's Side 13477 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Rear Quarter Panel Passenger Side 13478 1 *** $      62.50

Fire Marshal Full Markings Rear Lift Gate Full Marking 12855 1 *** $      400.00

Fire Marshal Full Markings Decklid 13479 1 *** $      400.00

Fire Marshal Full Markings Unit Number 13480 1 No Charge

Fire Marshal Full Markings Title Classificiation 13481 1 No Charge

Fire Marshal Full Markings Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 13482 1 *** $      80.00

Fire Marshal Full Markings FBCFMO Vehicle Full Decal Set 13483 1 *** $      900.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

No Bid



County Seal w/Inlay Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

County Seal w/Inlay Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11212 1 80.00$            

County Seal w/Inlay 12" County Seal Graphic 12" 11213 1 15.00$            

County Seal w/Inlay Installation 11214 1 25.00$            

County Seal Design set-up Fee 11211 1 320.00$          

***County Seal w/Inlay 6" County Seal Graphic 6",                                   
25 ea order minimum

13484 1 *** $      7.00

No Bid

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 


	Detail Pricing

