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Lawson # 7531

$4,195.00 No Bid $5,295.00 $6,000.00 $5,900.00 $3,100.00 $3,360.00 $6,720.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$5,235.00

GML Admin    

Lawson #11333

#$1336.70

Missouri City            

Lawson # 7532

$1,175.00 $1,790.00 $1,695.00 $1,800.00 $1,190.00 $875.00 $925.00 $2,160.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$2,040.00

First Colony             

Lawson # 7533

$1,175.00 No Bid $1,695.00 $1,800.00 $1,290.00 $900.00 $980.00 $2,160.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$2,043.00

Albert George             

Lawson # 7534

$500.00 No Bid $450.00 $600.00 $400.00 $370.00 $375.00 $520.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$843.00

Mamie George             

Lawson # 7535

$500.00 $375.00 $450.00 $600.00 $350.00 $300.00 $320.00 $520.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$741.00

Fulshear             

Lawson # 7536

$995.00 No Bid $1,395.00 $1,250.00 $1,090.00 $780.00 $840.00 $1,850.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$1,535.00

Sugar Land             

Lawson # 7537

$1,395.00 $1,975.00 $1,695.00 $1,800.00 $1,475.00 $1,000.00 $1,070.00 $1,175.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$2,112.00

Cinco Ranch             

Lawson # 7538

$1,675.00 No Bid $2,295.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $1,400.00 $1,500.00 $2,580.00 ** 

Contract Cancelled
$2,273.00

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 10-004

Term Contract for Janitorial Services for Libraries

Term: 1 October 2009 through 30 September 2010

Awarded 09/08/09: KT Commercial Cleaning

*Amended 02/09/10 **Amended 5/4/10 ***Amended 9/13/11 #Amended 5/27/14

Renewal Term: 1 October 2011 through 30 September 2012

Renewal Term: 1 October 2013 through 30 September 2014

Renewal Term: 1 October 2012 through 30 September 2013

Renewal Term: 1 October 2010 through 30 September 2011



Sienna Branch            

Lawson #8428

NEW                 

$2500

** 

Contract Cancelled

University Branch            

Lawson # 9710

*** 

$3054.00

High Quality

Maintenance of 

America      

Disqualified:  Did not submit insurance as required.

Disqualified:  Did not submit insurance nor references as required.



 


