
County Stockpile           
Delivery Points

 Cleveland Asphalt 
Shepherd 

 P Squared 
Emulsion         
Elm Mott 

 Performance 
Grade Asphalt     

Hitchcock 
Minimum 5000 gallons
Rosenberg 2.8153                   
Crabb 2.8153                   
Fresno 2.8153                   
Fulshear 2.8153                   
Missouri City 2.8153                   
Needville 2.8153                   
Richmond 2.8153                   
Plant 2.68                       
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No bid
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile No bid
 Restocking Fee N/C
Laydown Charge N/C
Demurrage Charge 80.00/hr after 2 hrs
Plant Location Shepherd

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 10-059

Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Type Road Materials 

Term:  April 1, 2010 through March 31, 2011

Awarded 3/2/10: Award to all bidders meeting specifications

AC-10, Asphalt Cement, THD #300  (price per gallon)       
Lawson #8440



County Stockpile           
Delivery Points

 Cleveland Asphalt 
Shepherd 

 P Squared 
Emulsion         
Elm Mott 

 Performance 
Grade Asphalt     

Hitchcock 
Minimum 5000 gallons
Rosenberg 2.8153                   
Crabb 2.8153                   
Fresno 2.8153                   
Fulshear 2.8153                   
Missouri City 2.8153                   
Needville 2.8153                   
Richmond 2.8153                   
Plant 2.10                       
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No bid
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile No bid
 Restocking Fee N/C
Laydown Charge N/C
Demurrage Charge 80.00/hr after 2 hrs
Plant Location Shepherd

County Stockpile           
Delivery Points

 Cleveland Asphalt 
Shepherd 

 P Squared 
Emulsion         
Elm Mott 

 Performance 
Grade Asphalt     

Hitchcock 
Minimum 5000 gallons 4000 gallons
Rosenberg 2.1353                   2.05                       
Crabb 2.1353                   2.05                       
Fresno 2.1353                   2.05                       
Fulshear 2.1353                   2.05                       
Missouri City 2.1353                   2.05                       
Needville 2.1353                   2.05                       
Richmond 2.1353                   2.05                       
Plant 2.0000                   1.90                       
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No bid No bid
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile No bid No bid
 Restocking Fee N/C 0.00
Laydown Charge N/C No bid
Demurrage Charge 80.00/hr after 2 hrs
Plant Location Shepherd Hitchcock

Lawson #8441

Lawson #8442 
CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300  (price per gallon)

AC-20, Asphalt Cement , THD #300  (price per gallon)    



County Stockpile           
Delivery Points

 Cleveland Asphalt 
Shepherd 

 P Squared 
Emulsion         
Elm Mott 

 Performance 
Grade Asphalt     

Hitchcock 
Minimum 5000 gallons 4000 gallons
Rosenberg 3.4353                   2.90                       
Crabb 3.4353                   2.90                       
Fresno 3.4353                   2.90                       
Fulshear 3.4353                   2.90                       
Missouri City 3.4353                   2.90                       
Needville 3.4353                   2.90                       
Richmond 3.4353                   2.90                       
Plant 3.30                       2.75                       
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No bid No bid
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile No bid No bid

 Restocking Fee N/C 0.00
Laydown Charge N/C No bid
Demurrage Charge 80.00/hr after 2 hrs
Plant Location Shepherd Hitchcock

County Stockpile           
Delivery Points

 Cleveland Asphalt 
Shepherd 

 P Squared 
Emulsion         
Elm Mott 

 Performance 
Grade Asphalt     

Hitchcock 
Undiluted Delivered  1.57                       
Diluted 12:1 Delivered 0.75                       

Lawson #8443

Lawson #8444

MC-30 Medium Curing Type Cutback Asphalt, THD #300(price per gallon)

Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)           



County Stockpile           
Delivery Points

 Cleveland Asphalt 
Shepherd 

 P Squared 
Emulsion Elm 

Mott 

 Performance 
Grade Asphalt     

Hitchcock 
Minimum 5000 gallons 4000 gallons
Rosenberg 2.0353                   2.05                       
Crabb 2.0353                   2.05                       
Fresno 2.0353                   2.05                       
Fulshear 2.0353                   2.05                       
Missouri City 2.0353                   2.05                       
Needville 2.0353                   2.05                       
Richmond 2.0353                   2.05                       
Plant 1.90                       1.90                       
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No bid No bid
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile No bid No bid

 Restocking Fee N/C 0.00
Demurrage Charge 80.00/hr after 2 hrs
Plant Location Shepherd Hitchcock

County Stockpile           
Delivery Points

 Cleveland Asphalt 
Shepherd 

 P Squared 
Emulsion Elm 

Mott 

 *Performance 
Grade Asphalt     

Hitchcock 
Minimum 5000 gallons 4000 gallons
Rosenberg 2.59                       2.90                       
Crabb 2.59                       2.90                       
Fresno 2.59                       2.90                       
Fulshear 2.59                       2.90                       
Missouri City 2.59                       2.90                       
Needville 2.59                       2.90                       
Richmond 2.59                       2.90                       
Plant 2.39                       2.45                       
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No bid No bid
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile No bid No bid

 Restocking Fee 1.25                       0.00
Demurrage Charge 70.00/hr after 2 hrs
Plant Location Elm Mott Hitchcock

Lawson #8445

Lawson #8446
Road Stabilizer (price per gallon)                

SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)                  


